8/29/22, 4:43 PM jindalaluminium Mail - RE: REQ OF CERAMIC BALLS (Jindal Aluminium Limited)
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\__ Rajgopal C. Sarda <rajgopal@jindalal*uminium.com>

s

Jindal Aluminium

RE: REQ OF CERAMIC BALLS (Jindal Aluminium Limited)

1 message

Bidyut Bhattacharjee (Wesman Thermal) <bidyut.bhattachariee@wesman.com> Mon, Aug 29, 2022 at 4:09 pM

Reply-To: bidyut.bhattachariee@wesman.com
To: rajgopal@jindalaluminium.com
Cc: Kunal Kanti Sarkar <kunal.sarkar@wesman.com>

Dear Sir, /

In response to your following email and subseqty‘l{ﬁkjp nic discussion, we are glad to submit our quotatio
below : ) \<'€
N\

1) AL2 03 BALL (CERAMIC BALLS)—20-22 mm or as per the standard - 2000 Kgs (Rs. 230.00 per kg) Q{\f&

ey
Payment Term : 100% payment against Proforma Invoice. g
1000 Kgs are in stock, which can be supplied as soon as payment is credited to our account. Delivery for balance item 18-20
weeks. However, we shall try to prepone the delivery.
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Billing and delivery address :

M/s. Jindal Aluminium Limited.,

SRR

SP-2/333, Industrial Area,

e

Bhiwadi Dist, Alwar, ( Rajasthan ) — 301019.

= 5

GST No. 08AAACJ4324M1ZH

O\

We are waiting for your valued purchase a r. A

A ey

Regards, 3\ %\
Bidyut Kumar Bhattacharjee W QX

Wesman Thermal Engineering Processes Pvt Ltd/&ﬁi

T: +91 (33) 40020387

&
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Begin forwarded message:

From: "Rajgopal C. Sarda" <rajgopal@jindalaluminium.com>
Subject: Re: REQ OF CERAMIC BALLS
Date: 29 August 2022 at 15:13:38 IST
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