12/6/22, 3:06 PM jindalaluminium Mail - Re: Enquiry No:'EN221202569'-'S0701'Bhiwadi Division

Rajgopal C. Sarda <rajgopal@jindalaluminium.com>

Jindal Aluminium

Re: Enquiry No:'EN221202569'-'S0701'Bhiwadi Division

1 message

Srinivas Joshi <sujayenterprises.joshi@gmail.com> Tue, Dec 6, 2022 at 3:02 PM
To: purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com
Cc: "rajgopal@jindalaluminium.com" <rajgopal@yjindalaluminium.com>

6" Sch 40 @ Rs. 3,450/mtr (MSL Make with, TC)
NoTE: T Lok ‘Z: 75; %&25 ANRD-YS po-blek

1. Payment to be made in 7 days as discussed.
Bv @ -1y
»

2. Material collection in Mumbai at your scope. % H'
3. Loading of Rs. 450/ton will be charged to your account. W -
—7(: M 6l

4. Invoicing will be done from Bengaluru.
Please confirm to further coordinate material collection.
Rgds,

On Sat, Dec 3, 2022 at 5:12 PM <purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com> wrote:
Dear Sir/Madam,

PLEASE QUOTE YOUR COMPETITIVE OFFER FOR THE ATTACHED ENQUIRY BY RETURN MAIL & KINDLY
SEND YOUR ACKNOWLEDGEMENT MAIL ONCE YOU RECEIVED THE ENQUIRY FOR CONFIRMATION.

NOTE : FEEL FREE TO CONTACT US IF YOU ARE NOT GETTING ENQUIRY ATTACHMENT AS MENTIONED
IN ITEM DESCRIPTION. 3
”’:‘f.'::\‘f%&*emw

ASST. MANAGER PURCHASE, - CHE P/ UST ,

JINDAL ALUMINIUM LIMITED,

Bhiwadi division,
SP-2/333, INDUSTRIAL AREA, DISCOUNT-€ (£> VQ@‘Z& wunlde... ﬂ&\b“@

BHIWADI - 301019,
ALWAR DIST,( RAJASTHAN ) PRICE BASIS : FOR BHIWADL.... E;Q._ E

GST No. 08AAACJ4324M1ZH F—f)’ ]Q
PH. NO. 9611195368
lesTigsT - ”§ E ZLM

Website : www.jindalaluminium.com P&F

V\

Regards

S.K. Joshi DELIVERY DOry M‘UQ .
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