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C Industrial Area Phase-V Bhiwads Rajasthan India
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To, AN Quotation No. 212202929
M/s  Hindal almunium LTD SVN\ &(r‘ NN Date 17.02.22
Bhiwadi }X Q},” 3~ Contact Person Mr Vipin Tiwari
Contact No +91 7268087854
*-5:’ ?F Ref. No As Per Discussion as on
Kind Attn: Mr. Rajgop?‘f’
Sir,
We are pleased to quote our lowest possible rate for your perusal & consideration
Sr. No. |Particulars HSN Code Price/Unit_{MOQ/Pcs| Net Rate
b DIE RING NO 009 ( HDR 009-A3) 8207 11,200700 3 33,600.00
— /r?"_;_ 0 -
Gross Total INR 33,600.00
Terms Of Delivery
Tax- All Tax Extra As Applicable 6&)
Validity 15-days
Inspection As Per Requirement
Transport As Actual % QQ/W
Delivery- 2-4 Week
Payment-: 1 Week
1- ONLY JOB WORK Authorised Sign
2- MATERIAL PROVIDE JINDAL
3- Plauwratts Ghivastasa
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Sri Karthik Enterprises

#12,13, 5th Cross, Abbigere,Near KEB Office,
Lakshmipura MainRoad, Bangalore- 560090,
Mob : 9945019887 Email : srikarthikenterprises@gmail.com

QUOTATION
TO
M/s. JINDAL ALUMINIUM Ltd. Quotation NO: 173 /21-22
tumukur road,Bengalore -562111 Date: 16/02/2022
V.C. §02463
For LABOUR Work
KIND ATTN: Mr. Rajgopal
Dear Sir,
With reference to your letter /enquiry No dated
We have pleasure to submit herewith our lowest quotation,
SLNO Item Description Hsgol diAC Unit Qty. Rate (in Rs.) Amount
1 |HDR-009 Die ring ‘ Nos 3 6820100 20460.00

et
5 |Inc of Vaccum heat treatment . (f’f’z & /408 fo 5K . Q%’

Transport to jal Bangalore

i B e e

RUPEES .twenty thousand four hundred and sixty only

*Excluding of GST V—>
*Payment Aganist delivery.. \X

*Delivery 4 weeks from date of mat
*Validity 30 days from above offerl\

Wy %wm #ﬁ&ﬁwﬁ K’ga

We look forward in receiving your valuable order whieh wil have.bufr immediaté attention. - o
Thanking you and assuring of our best and prompt s (&/ Cat a | times. .Qé,&

@V\Q ...For S Karthik Enterprises
Our GSTIN : 29AXBPK3214G1ZR A B
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v 2/17/22, 11:05 AM jindalaluminium Mail - Fwd: HDR-009

aa

s
(IIRmAL) ' |
N Rajgopal C. Sarda <rajgopal@jindalalurminium.coms

NG
Jindal Aluminium

Fwd: HDR-009

1 message

Thu, Feb 17, 2022 at 10:35

AM

Jitendra Narain Rai . <jnrai@jindalaluminium.com
To: "Rajgopal C. Sarda" <rajgopal@jindalaluminium.com>

In house tooling cost is 22000/~ Rs. with die steel.

Best Regards ng/&w @C% [B,Aw\ @f%%

J.N.Rai < e R
bo Ly Badh GBERC
Sr.Manager - Tool-Shop Y dV
-
M: +91-9611195330
. linkedin icon {“facebook icon | “twitter icon www.JindalAluminium.com

instagram icon

--------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Jitendra Narain Rai . <jnrai@jindalaluminium.coms>

Date: Thu, Feb 17, 2022 at 10:21 AM

Subject: Fwd: HDR-009

To: Bhiwadi Purchase <purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com>

Cc: Rajgopal C. Sarda <rajgopal@jindalaluminium.com>, Devendra Sain <dsain@jindalaluminium.com>, Rajendra
Parsad Jaiswal <rajendraprasad.jaiswal@jindalaluminium.com>, Brijesh Kumar <brijesh@jindalaluminium.com>

Dear Rupesh

We required 3 nos HDr-009 die ring for our BP-3 press on urgent basis.Please arrange to get it full
finished condition from job work party.Die steel provided by us

Best Regards

J.N.Rai
Sr.Manager - Tool-Shop

M: +81-9611195330

linkedin icon {_ _facebook icon by “"_,twitter icon www.JindalAluminium.com
_instagram icon

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Toolshop - Bhiwadi . <toolshop.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.coms
Date: Thu, Feb 17, 2022 at 9:56 AM

Subject: HDR-009

To: <parchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminum.com>

Ce: Jitendra Narain Rai <jnrai@jindalaluminium.coms>

SIR,
PLEASE FIND ATTACHED DRAWINGS AS PER YOUR REQUIRED HDR-009
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