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Enquiry No:EN22010001 SBhiwadi Division

Milhard Sales pvt. Ltd. <sales@milhard.com> Wed, Jan 12, 2022 at 11:31 A
To: purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com

Dear Sir/Madam
With reference to your inquiry we are pleased to quote here with oyr most competitive price:-

DIGITAL VERNIER CALIPER 12" 0-300 MM (500-1 73-30)--------, @16400/-

Please Note

Goods offered - Subject to Prior Sale

Appearance and specifications are subject to change without prior notice for product improvement.
Actual products may vary from the picture sent by you.

Price Validity: "15 Days from Date of Quotation

GST 18% extra Prices Ex-Godown Delhi

Payment against Proforma Invoice, Packing, Forwarding & Freight extra.a

GST-07AAACM21 28A1Zz7

CIN No.U452020L1977PTC008638
We are looking forward to your valued orders.

MSME No. UDYAM-DL-01-0010988
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MILHARD SALES PVT. LD, CHECs s (v PRV '

4772, HAUZ QAZI DELHI (AJMER] GATE) INDIA 110006
Email; sales@milhard.com

On Mon, Jan 10, 2022 at 6:17 PM <purchase.bh;’wadé@jmdamu,sminium,com> wrote:
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