719/22, 9:02 AM jindalaluminium Mail - Re: Enquiry No:'EN220700396'-'S2803'Bhiwadi Division

Rajgopal C. Sarda <rajgopal@jindalaluminium.com>

Jindal Aluminium

Re: Enquiry No:'EN220700396'-'S2803'Bhiwadi Division

1 message

SANKALP HYDRAULIK <sankalphydro@gmail.com> Fri, Jul 8, 2022 at 11:37 PM
To: purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com
Cc: rajgopal@jindalaluminium.com

Pl
Dear Sir, , b\t‘*_ @Mi‘lo 5 :
We request you to please refer our offer as below :- W “
M+S one to one equivalent to OMP-315 0 ,
Model - MP-315 W w o
‘(/\Q \‘oO

Add Gst @18% - :
Delivery - Ready stock %/
Price - Ex works - Navi Mumbai.
Please confirm .
On Fri, 8 Jul 2022 at 20:29, <purchase.bhiwadi@)jindalaluminium.com> wrote:

Dear Sir/Madam,

PLEASE QUOTE YOUR COMPETITIVE OFFER FOR] ENQUIRY BY RETURN MAIL & KINDLY

SEND YOUR ACKNOWLEDGEMENT MAIL ONCE Y THE ENQUIRY FOR CONFIRMATION.

NOTE : FEEL FREE TO CONTACT US IF YOU E N ET ENQUIRY ATTACHMENT AS MENTIONED
IN ITEM DESCRIPTION.

ASST. MANAGER PURCHASE, \ .
JINDAL ALUMINIUM LIMITED,
Bhiwadi division, @\c/ CHECKLIST - ‘
SP-2/333, INDUSTRIAL AREA, ! !
BHIWADI - 301019, ol [@Ot—ﬁ ___0-@00’@ :
ALWAR DIST,( RAJASTHAN ) @S Y % UNT '&(\ Dty ’

§
GST No. 08AAACJ4324M1ZH OS\& :
PH. NO. 9611195368 §§ 1 PRICE BASIS #FOR SHWDE‘...
Website : www.jindalaluminium.co .—%ﬁ) (( 40@

3 \ipP&F INCL. ‘/,. EXTRA..... 3
Best Regards, : % 9 1
GST/‘GST :__:;S_:“ ..ﬁ:zzz'm{g..z,. . 3 Giss j 4
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SANKALP HYDRAULIK PVT. LTD, , ! ore 7&6&&
Regd office: Office no - 1, Roop Maya CHS, L8 WEITC h. T ..mn -----
Plot no 7, Sector -6 , Near ICICI Bank,
Airoli ,Navi Mumbai, Maharashtra,
India - 400 708 VALIDITY R |
Tel : +91 91366 06792 / +91 91369 81792 FOP {
For Sales : +91 91361 18792 SHECUEN BV L ia Rl e ;
Email : sales.sankalp@shplgroup.com bt

Website : www.shplgroup.com

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=5e5d9c88408&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A17377970325990R053N%7 Cmen_fo.2 A 172720221 )
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Bhiwadi Purchase . <purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com>

Enquwy No EN2207003968h|wad| D|V|S|on

yogesh@sllmllnehydrotek com <yogesh@shm|lnehydrotek com>
To: purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com
Cc: purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com, rajgopal@jindalaluminium.

Dear Sir,

Thanks for enquiry of Danfoss products.

Mon, Jul 4, 2022 at 1:24 PM

com

=
We are pleased to offer you standard version of hydraulic motor as pe

’

r attached product details and below mentioned offer :

L@’ﬂ 1_0 Hne jl\#le}ﬂf\p Lhevng

Model : OMPX 315 ( New version of OMP 315 motor )
e e T

HSN Code : 84122990

Unit Price : INR 32,2887 each
Dich unit price.

GST: 18%
Qty. 1 No.

Delivery : Within 32-36 weeks after confirmed purchase orde

Terms & Conditions : -

Above offered Price is for each , ex works, unpacked Pune.
Packing & forwarding : N.A.

Delivery : As indicated above after purchase order.

Payment : 50% advance alongwith P.O. and balance against Proform

TAX AMOUNT : GST EXTRA ON BASIC AMOUNT.
Freight and Insurance to be born from your side.

Warranty : Against any manufacturing defect for the period of one yeg
plastic parls open to physical abuse.

Validity : 15 Days.
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Please feel free to contact us in case of any query.

Thanks and Regards,

e

Yogesh Kulkarni

s

+91 0822846545
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71712022 jindalaluminium Mail - Enquiry No:EN220700396Bhiwadi Division

N Bhiwadi Purchase . <purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com>

L ;
Jindal Aluminium

Enquiry No:EN220700396Bhiwadi Division

Shashi Dhawal Hydraulics |Delhi <shashidhawal.delhi@srpgroup.co.in> Thu, Jul 7, 2022 at 11:09 AM
To: purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com, delhi.accounts@srpgroup.co.in
Cc: rajgopal@jindalaluminium.com

Dear Sir,
We acknowledge with thanks for your enquiry, we are to€nclose the following quotation.
V)
i
Sr. Model Code / - ice Discount Availability
A y

—

1 | Hyd. Motor OMP X 315 \/ M) Net price 22 to 24 Weeks

Make : Danfoss L‘-————O.gr@ L\I@SSD% "a"Q/D ,a (o q’ —
HSN Code : 841229 \
JoIh OMP2/5

(Discounted Price)

e

22,962.00 Net Price 16to 18 S

Hyd. Motor WP 315

Ty

TERMS & CONDITIONS : .- Mﬁ

o . OK, ot
NS
V | el ] EXTRAL cvae aeeaears
TAX (GST) 18% \\7} : TR
_ \ " ‘
" 1) ¢ s
PAYMENT 30 days ,S .

e
Delivery As mentioned above é “’Q)%”")x)/ EMIECE o S
\

FREIGHT Paid V)
/ ®q

,,,,,,,
............

Validity : 30 days

NOTE : DUE TO PENDAMIC SITUATION DELIVERY MAY DIFFER

https://mail.goodle.com/mail/u/0/?ik=6ac74 10004 &view=nt&search=all& nermmsaid=man-fo43A1737R711 0ANRAAANAD7R.cimnl—men £/ 211727274 4



AFM AI'M HYDRAULICS

U LIQS Office No.3,Afm House,Jallalpur,Khoripakar,Ballia-277001,Uttar Pradesh
A ‘
QUOTATION
JINDAL ALUMINIUM LTD Our Ref': Mail
SP-2/333,RICO Industrial Area,Bhiwadi,Alwar- |Date:30/06/2022
01019 Enquiry No. :EN220700396
Kindly attention : Mr.Rajgopal C

Dear Sir,
This is Reference of Your email Enquiry & our Telephonic Discussion . We are Glad to submit our
offer for the same along with Terms & Condition :

S.no Description Qty.I Price Each |, HSN Code Delivery
1 |Hydraulic Motor Make Danfoss Denmark 1.00 M\ 841281 EX-STOCK |L—
-

Model:- OMP-315 151-0317 Qe l 50@ é}‘/)’) =
-c"————__—‘

Shaft=25 mm Cylindrical i%m@.”'r?'
—— i

R S TR =
i s

WARRANTY=1 YEAR | DI&R

5

GST:- 09AZMPK6356N1ZI [P & e ]

Terms & Condition : { o 4 "\h{/\- e ! Account Details:

1. Price : Ex-Works Uttar Pra(fﬁ@ST/’GST j ?l 7’ /g E H e

2. Tax : 18% GST Extra | SEET A 18020105036722
:- Axis Bank

3. Payment : 100% after Delivf{:‘)&u\‘/ERy s C/)N MQQ_% Bank:- 7
Yennesia,, o I o

4. Freight:- Paid by us

5.Validity: 30 Days PAYMENT /0?9 : ‘9 /_

We Hope that you find ou Gﬁﬁﬂm Competjti [{z%liavour%i g &zr.
Thanking You, JEME SR et FRIn %{Vy:w 0/2

Sesoeap; "ecsnnge

E-Mail:- sales@afmhydraulics.com R

For AFM Hydraulics, }VAUD'TY . —

Krishna Sharma (+91 9454829846 , +91 817837766355 rereserunnnr,

Branch Office:- NH-24 DThHEGKEOByIPass Road, N ’W?I)ad 201002 (U.P.)
T ﬁsm, L WWW. afmhydraullcs com

o Jishas

:%ﬁ %Q\& /‘E]

We are Importer/Tradel for [ntern'ltlonal - Tokimec , Rexroth Germany ,Danfoss,Yuken , Eaton,
Vickers , Denison, Polyhydron, Dowty , Nachi , Parker,Permoco , Etc




