Bhiwadi Purchase . <purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com>

findal Aluminium

Enquiry No:EN220700447Bhiwadi Division

Shashi Dhawal Hydraulics |Delhi <shashidhawal.delhi@srpgroup.co.in>
To: purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com, delhi.accounts@srpgroup.co.in
Cc: rajgopal@jindalaluminium.com

Dear Sir,

We acknowledge with thanks for your enquiry, we are glad to enclose the following quotation.

Sr. Description Model Code Price Discount Availability

5 OP-3008 8,758.8 Net Ex Stock
Hydraulic Pump

TERMS & CONDITIONS :

Price Ex our store
TAX (GST) 18% o
PAYMENT 30 days ‘
P&F Inclusive |
Delivery As mentioned above .,:
FREIGHT Paid | ‘i
!
Validity 30 days .Eli
............................. "}
............. ‘ {
Hope this will meet your requirement & favor us with your value& order. 5a V‘? M__ww,,A
SR8 LR Ry

Thanks and Regards
Loaking forward en early reply

With Regards



{WHA! ) Bhiwadi Purchase . <purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com>

Jindal Aluminium

Enqu1ry No EN220700447Bh|wad| D|V|S|on

SANJAY HYDRAULIK <sanjayhydro@gmall com> Mon, Jul 11, 2022 at 12:23 PM
To: purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com .
Cc: SANKALP HYDRO <sankalphydro@gmail.com>

DEAR SIR

PLEASE FIND BELOW ITEM QTN

OP 3008

PRICE-4350.00 NET

ADD GST EXTRA
Best Regards,
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Tel : +91 8591666907

For Sales : +91 98201 66907 | +91 8591566907
For Accounts: +91 8531966907

For Dispatch Details : +91 8591866907

Email : sales.sanjay@shplgroup.com

Website : www.shplgroup.com

Authorised Partners & Products:
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Hydraulic Motors

Disclaimer : This message is for the designated recipient only and may contain privileged, proprietary, or otherwise private information. [f you have
received it in error; please notify the sender immediately and delete the original. Any use of the email by you is prohibited and is unlawfil. The
Organisation shall not be liable for the message if altered, changed or fulsified. Thank vou for your Co-operation.

On Mon, Jul 11, 2022 at 12:23 PM SANKALP HYDRAULIK <sankalphydro@gmail.com> wrote:
fyr

Best Regards.
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Jindal Aluminium

Enquwy No EN220700447Bh|wad| D|V|S|on

Bhiwadi Purchase . <purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com>

AFM HYDRAULICS <sa|es@afmhydrau||cs com> Thu, Jul 21, 2022 at 3:16 PM
To: "Bhiwadi Purchase ." <purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com>
Cc: "Rajgopal C. Sarda" <rajgopal@jindalaluminium.com>

Dear Sir,

This item is not available.

With Regards

Krishna Sharma

AFM HYDRAULICS

Head Office:- Office No.3,Afm House,Jallalpur,Khoripakar,Ballia-277001(U.P)
Branch Office:- NH-24,Delhi Hapur By Pass Road,Mehrauli,Ghaziabad-201002(U.P)
Mobile:-9454829846/8178377663

Email:-sales@afmhydraulics.com , afmhydraulics@gmail.com

Website:- www.afmhydraulics.com , www.rexrothdistributar.co.in , www.afmrexrothsupplier.com

[Quoted text hidden]
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