10/1/2022 jindalaluminium Mail - Reg.Rate of stretch films

Bhiwadi Purchase . <purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com>

Reg.Rate of stretch films

Aashis kumar <shreeshyam.ind13@gmail.com> Sat, Oct 1, 2022 at 12:11 PM
To: "Bhiwadi Purchase ." <purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com>
Cc: "Rajgopal C. Sarda" <rajgopal@)jindalaluminium.com>

Dear sir [L;Q//- FWKQ&

The rate of stretch films 3" x 30micron== -per kg GST 18 % extra.

Thanks & Regards

On Sat, 1 Oct 2022, 12:02 pm , <purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com> wrote:
Dear Sir/Madam,

PLEASE QUOTE YOUR COMPETITIVE OFFER FOR THE ATTACHED ENQUIRY BY RETURN MAIL & KINDLY
SEND YOUR ACKNOWLEDGEMENT MAIL ONCE YOU RECEIVED THE ENQUIRY FOR CONFIRMATION.

NOTE : FEEL FREE TO CONTACT US IF YOU ARE NOT GETTING ENQUIRY ATTACHMENT AS MENTIONED
IN ITEM DESCRIPTION.

ASST. MANAGER PURCHASE,
JINDAL ALUMINIUM LIMITED,
Bhiwadi division,

SP-2/333, INDUSTRIAL AREA,
BHIWADI - 301019,

ALWAR DIST,( RAJASTHAN )
GST No. 08AAACJ4324M1ZH : . i
PH. NO. 9611195368 : ‘
Website : www.jindalaluminium.com

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=6ac741 0004&view=pt&search=alI&pcrmmsgid:msg-f%SM 7454664380124570598simpl=msg-f%3A174546... 1/1



10/1/2022 jindalaluminium Mail - Enquiry No:EN221001543Bhiwadi Division

Enquwy No: EN221001543Bh|wad| D|V|S|on

Ashutosh Mittal <m|tta|bhlwad|@gma|| com>"
To: purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com
Ce: rajgopal@jindalaluminium com )

Sat, ®ct"

o B

3" stretch film @ 1557- p kg ‘ gﬁk

CERCE BASIS 1 FOR BHIWA FOYCWL‘
Tax extra C(\V\(A ?ﬂ — |

Ready stock 32 JeSs o )i

Ex shop price '/Q\P\?

[Quoted text hidden)]

Regards- PAYMENT LKL ’. d%) . 'SdO)Jé
Ashutosh Mittal
9024183293 (Whatsapp), 9351483869 |

MSME NO - RJO2A0016389

https://iwww. indiamar’i.com/aggarwahtrade‘:—-i’i‘h'ié{f/"?‘? AR ——— -

Aggarwal Trade Link \ Q g o5 i
In front of UIT Police Chowki, Gaurav Path, BHIWAD! -307 @JM S v

/)mfkﬂfs . DISCOUNT 6%01/0 chc are.. GM,,J

Mfg_and supplier of Stretch film, Face Mask, Sanitizer, PP/Pet/MS Strap, Packing

Clip, BOPP Tapes, Bubble Role, and all other packing material
Repair and \
Stanvac
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100% AFTER SALES SERVICE SUPPORT OF ALL TYPE OF PACKING MACHINE

LIKE BOX STRAP MACHINE, PNEUMATIC / BATTERY PET STRAP MACHINE,
SEALING MACHINES

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=6ac7410004&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-{%3A174546841 4713245282&simpl=msg-f%3A174546...

Bhiwadi Purchase . <purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com>
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Bhiwadi Purchase . <purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com>

Enquiry No:EN221001543Bhiwadi Division

A S Enterprise <aseinfo9@gmail.com> ’ Sat, Oct 1, 2022 at 4:06 PM
To: purchase.bhiwadi@)jindalaluminium.com
Cc: aseofficial@yahoo.com, rajgopal@jindalaluminium.com

DEAR SIR , Date: 01/10/2022 \/‘\(7-/
WE ARE PLEASED TO QUOTE BELOW OUR PRICES.

| Ay }/ »
Sr No ITEM SIZE ' PRIEE(Rs.) \}-\7"}/\ > ’JM

1. Stretch film 3" Pjs/lé‘ﬂ-/per kg

TERMS & CONDITION:-

1. GST Extra @18%

2. Local Freight extra

3. Payment within 15 Days.

4. 100% Guarantee of length and weight

We hope our offer will meet your kind approval.

Thanking you and assuring you best services at all times.
[Quoted Lext hidden]

Regards

Rahul Gupta

A S ENTERPRISE

E-366 (C) B2 RIICO INDUSTRIAL AREA BHIWADI 301019
Email- aseinfod@gmail.com , aseofficiali@yahoo.com
Contact- +91 9649901239




