9/22/22, 1:50 PM jindalaluminium Mail - Re: REQ OF HYNEYWELL MAKE CONTROLLERS

JINDAL )
C Rajgopal C. Sarda <rajgopal@jindalaluminium.com>

-
Jindal Aluminium

Re: REQ OF HYNEYWELL MAKE CONTROLLERS

Apple Automation And Sensor <applesensor@gmail.com> Thu, Sep 22, 2022 at 1:27 PM
To: "Rajgopal C. Sarda" <rajgopal@jindalaluminium.com>

Dear Sir,

Model:- TBC2800A1000

Price:- 16500/-EACH

Del:- Delivery 10 weeks from the date of your PO & receipt of advance payment

GST:- 18% Extra

Freight:- Extra

Payment:- Advance

Offer Validity:- 15 days

For terms & condition visit below link

https://www.applesensor.com/terms

Please note: We have offered as per model no given by you, we have not checked the
specification of quoted model no.

You are requested please check the suitability of quoted model no's specification and
application before order.

Best Regards,
Tanvi - 9699397942

Click Here List of Our Sales Executive Numbers (as per brand handle)

( Industrial Equipment Supplier )
FLOOR 2, PLOT 110, PARTH, GANESH PETH LANE, OFF N. C. KELKAR ROAD, DADAR-WEST, MUMBAI-400028

For Sales Executive Contact No Click Here: https://www.applesensor.com/brand-supplier

applesensor@gmail.com | https://www.applesensor.com

Many Mor
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Sales Executive : Aishwarya : 9699397923 : applesensor@gmail.com
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Sales Executive : Tanvi: 9699397942 : applesensor@gmail.com
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Sales Executive : Sneha: 9699397932 : applesensor@gmail.com
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INDUSTRIAL AUT™OMATION

We are supglier of above brand produds

On Wed, Sep 21, 2022 at 8:18 PM Rajgopal C. Sarda <rajgopal@jindalaluminium.com> wrote:
Dear Sir,

Please find below our requirements.
1) HONEYWELL MAKE DIGITAL BURNER CONTROLLER, MODEL-TBC2800 , INPUT-220VAC , 50HZ, CLASS-

IP54 FOR P3 FURNACE

QTY : 3 Nos

Billing and delivery address :

M/s. Jindal Aluminium Limited.,

SP-2/333, Industrial Area,

Bhiwadi Dist, Alwar, ( Rajasthan ) — 301019.

GST No. 08AAACJ4324M1ZH

Best Wishes,

Rajgopal. C. Sarda.
Deputy. Manager — Purchase.

M: +91 9611-195-368 Jindal Aluminium Limited
Jindal Nagar, Tumkur Road,
T: +91 8023-715-561 / 55 (EXt — 422) Bengaluru - 560073 India

E: rajgopal@jindalaluminium.com
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