OFFER

Santosh Electricals <santoshelectricals2003@gmail.com>

Fri 4/7/2023 9:48 AM

To: Bhiwadi Purchase <purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com>

Dear Sir,
Greetings for the day!!

Please find the offer:

SR.
Product - Discount . . Amount
NO. i 0
Réferénes Quantity Description MRP % Unit Price] Amount | GST % After Tax
1 A9N3P63C 10 Acti 9 MCB xC60 3P 63A C 10000A | 3,425.00 | 72.00% 959.00 9590 18% 11316.20

Terms & Conditions:-

1. Quote Validation: 7 DAYS **** Any change in LIST PRICES by our principals will supersede any
earlier price approvals given,irrespective of the validity date.The company reserves the right to change
prices without prior information/intimation. If any change of list prices is announced,all previous price
approvals stand invalid unless expressly re approved with reference to new list prices. All prices are in

INR.

2. Delivery: As stated above, on receipt of Techno-Commercial clear purchase order.

3. GST: Extra as applicable.

4. Payment: Within 30 Days.

5. Freight: Extra as applicable.

Thanks & Regards

Lalit Kumar Gupta | Santosh Electricals | Bhiwadi- India

Phone: 01493-294891 | GSTIN 08AGWPG027811ZW

Mobile: +91-9667209981
Address:

Shop No. 3, Ajanta Chowk, Bhiwadi (Rajasthan) i
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Re: Enquiry No:'EN230400025'-'K5061'Bhiwadi Division

KHANDELWAL AGENCIES <khandelwal_agencies@yahoo.com>

Thu 4/6/2023 1:32 PM

To: Bhiwadi Purchase <purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com >;sales@khandelwalagencies.net

<sales@khandelwalagencies.net>

Cc: Bhiwadi Purchase <purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com>;Rajgopal C. Sarda <rajgopal@jindalaluminium.com>

Dear sir
Please find below price

MCB 63 amp 3 pole

List@ 2700. Less—§®4
by

GST EXTRA

FREIGHT EXTRA

PAYMENT WITH IN 30 DAYS

THANKS & REGARDS

MOHIT AGGARWAL
9875110194

Sent from Yahoo Mail for iPhone

On Thursday, April 6, 2023, 12:08 PM, purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com wrote:

Dear Sir/Madam,

PLEASE QUOTE YOUR COMPETITIVE OFFER FOR THE ATTACHED ENQUIRY BY RETURN MAIL & KINDLY
SEND YOUR ACKNOWLEDGEMENT MAIL ONCE YOU RECEIVED THE ENQUIRY FOR CONFIRMATION.

NOTE : FEEL FREE TO CONTACT US IF YOU ARE NOT GETTING ENQUIRY ATTACHMENT AS MENTIONED IN

ITEM DESCRIPTION.

ASST. MANAGER PURCHASE,
JINDAL ALUMINIUM LIMITED,
Bhiwadi division,

SP-2/333, INDUSTRIAL AREA,
BHIWADI - 301019,

ALWAR DIST,( RAJASTHAN )

GST No. 08AAACI4324M1ZH

PH. NO. 9611195368

Website : www.jindalaluminium.com
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Re: Enquiry No:EN230400025Bhiwadi Division

BM Gupta <ankit_electricals@rediffmail.com>
Thu 4/6/2023 12:07 PM

To: Bhiwadi Purchase <purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com>

DEAR SIR
PLEASE FIND BELOW PRICE

1- MCB 63 AMP 3POL MAKE SCHNIEDER = LIST- 3425 LESS-73%

REGARDS

DEEPAK KHANDELWAL
9785914240, 9667200374
ANKIT ELECTRICALS

SHOP NO-A4 DHABA COMPLEX
RIICO IND AREA BHIWADI
MOBILE NO-9351135781

From: <purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com>

Sent: Tue, 04 Apr 2023 15:47:23

To: ankit_electricals@rediffmail.com

Cc: purchase bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com, rajgopal @jindalaluminium.com
Subject: Enquiry No:EN230400025Bhiwadi Division

Dear Sir/Madam,

PLEASE QUOTE YOUR COMPETITIVE OFFER FOR THE ATTACHED ENQUIRY BY RETURN MAIL & KINDLY SEND YOUR ACKNOWLEDGEMENT
MAIL ONCE YOU RECEIVED THE ENQUIRY FOR CONFIRMATION.

NOTE : FEEL FREE TO CONTACT US IF YOU ARE NOT GETTING ENQUIRY ATTACHMENT AS MENTIONED IN ITEM DESCRIPTION.

ASST. MANAGER PURCHASE,
JINDAL ALUMINIUM LIMITED,

Bhiwadi division, N i
SPl-V;S?IaB,lT:sJSTRIALAREA, - CHECK L'ST

BHIWADI - 301019, \ k &20\5 ¢
ALWAR DIST,( RAJASTHAN ) : DISCOUNT ! .ureeesenbentdoidZheensitlen Sitbesivannens
GST No. 08AAACI4324M1ZH
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‘ Re: Enquiry No:EN230400025Bhiwadi Division

KAPIL KHANDELWAL <dhruv.bhiwadi@gmail.com>
Tue 4/4/2023 3:52 PM

To: Bhiwadi Purchase <purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com>

Cc: Rajgopal C. Sarda <rajgopal@jindalaluminium.com>

Dear sir,

1. Mcb tp 63 amp -3425/- each list

Less-74%
GST extra

On Tue, 4 Apr 2023 at 3:47 PM, <purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com> wrote:

Dear Sir/Madam,

PLEASE QUOTE YOUR COMPETITIVE OFFER FOR THE ATTACHED

ENQUIRY BY RETURN MAIL & KINDLY SEND YOUR

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT MAIL ONCE YOU RECEIVED THE ENQUIRY FOR CONFIRMATION.

NOTE : FEEL FREE TO CONTACT US IF YOU ARE NOT GETTING ENQUIRY ATTACHMENT AS MENTIONED IN ITEM DESCRIPTION.

ASST. MANAGER PURCHASE,
JINDAL ALUMINIUM LIMITED,
Bhiwadi division,
SP-2/333, INDUSTRIAL AREA,
BHIWADI - 301019,
ALWAR DIST,( RAJASTHAN )
GST No. 08AAACJ4324M1ZH
© PH. NO. 9611195368
Website : www jindalaluminium.com

THANK'S WITH REGARD'S

KAPIL KHANDELWAL
TEL.01493-221272,220029
+91-9414012592, 9214315777
DHRUV ELECTRICALS
SHOP:-3,DHABA COMPLEX
BHIWADI-301019 Distt-Alwar (Raj.)
E-MAIL: dhruv.bhiwadi@gmail.com
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