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ISC 9001 : 2015 UOTATION
Certified By PIMA CONTROLS PVT LTD
TUVNORD P-NO-446/447,ROAD NO-17 NEAR RADHA SWAMI, SATSANG BHAVAN,

AKHEDA DUNGAR, VKI AREA,
Jaipur-302013, Rajasthan
GSTIN: 08AAACPS160F1ZE

QUO NO. SQJT/23/01000 DATE: 16-02-2023

T0,

JINDAL ALUMINIUM LIMITED SUBJECT: YOUR REQUIREMENT OF AB MAKE PLC
SP-2/333, RHCQ INDUSTRIAL AREA

BHIWADI-301019 DIST. ALWAR REF.: BY DISCUSSION

ALWAR, 301019
EMAIL 1D:  purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com

KIND ATTN:- M:9611195368
We acknowledge with thanks receipt of your above mentioned enguiry and are pleased to submit herewith our guotation as per the following for your kind

—————————— Unit Price | Total Prige

Sr. No. [Cat. No, Description IHSNISAC IGST % IQty (Rs.) (Rs.)
[-00000]~
Compactlegix 5370 L1 Controller, Dual Ethernet wiDLR '
1 1769L19ERBB1B capability, TMB Memory — ’l Lt WeMC . 85371000 18 1 PCS| 103;102.86 103,102.86
7746 SLC System, EtherNetiP Cdmmuniﬁtion modu!e
2 17T4TAENTR %,‘"‘ 32 W’*"[LM? . 85176200¢ 18 ) '.J1 PC.:S‘ 11.3 , .58 130,386.68
’ Sub Total] 233,489.54

Total:{ 233,489.54

Please Note:-
1. in event of an order, the same cannot be changed or cancelled. ! -!'fA ' .-)’ é 4
2. We have considered supply of only loose hardware. Any type of support services would be charged extra. \ N@’ ») v,
3.  "We have taken every effort for proper selection of manufacturer's catalogue number/part numberfitem "code of the qu item, which

are based on the inputs provided by you. However please cross verify the" manufacturer's part number of each item prior lo placing the
purchase order. Orders are executed based™ on manufacturer part numbers and the corresponding description will be used for
indicative purpose only." 1 (2

Commercial Terms and Conditions : < yslt,e"‘*"‘b N on
DESP MODE : By Road \\JwJ\" [+ evr-

FREIGHT : Extra at actual
GST : GST wiil be charged extra as applicable at the time of Invoice as per Government

INSURANCE : To your account
PAYMENT TERMS : 100% afong with 100% taxes & duties against Proforma Invoice.

AL
PRICE BASE : FOR PIMA Warehouse C/

VALIDITY : 30 days, Beyond which subjected to cur written confirmation,

WARRANTY : One year from the date of our invoice against manufacturing defects only

In case you need any further clarifications, please feel free to contact us.

Order acceptance based on this offer is subject to our written acceptance and confirmation of same.

We trust the above is as per your requirement and look forward to the pleasure of receiving your vatued order.
Thanking you and assuring you of our best and prompt services at ail times.

Yours faithfully,
For Pima Controls Pvt. Ltd.

NANDLAL FULRE ,
SALES ENGINEER Sumit Verma
M. No. 9549897789




3, 11:07 AM Mail - Raman Sharma - Qutlook

Re: Fw: Requirement-20000001373

Anurag Taneja <anurag@svesludhiana.in>
Fri 2/17/2023 9:37 PM

To: Raman Sharma <raman@®jindalaluminium.com>
Cc: SVES (www.svesludhiana.in} SHREE VISHWAKARMA ELECTRO SALES MAIL <svesldh@gmail.com>

Dear sir
With reference to your email , please note down the below

1769-L19ER-BB1B (CompactlLogix L19 Controller, 24 VDC Only, U'p to 8 Modules
Expansion, POINT Bus Backplane, 16 DI (Sink), 16 DO (Source), 2 Ethernet Port (DLR),
~ Up to 8 Ethernet/IP nodes, 1MB User Memory, 1GB SD Card Inbox) LP = 171838

1747-AENTR (1746 SLC System, EtherNet/IP Communication module) LP=217311

Discount =42%

Tax : GST EXTRA 18%

Delivery 4 to 6 weeks

Payment 30% advance and balance against Pl

Price Basis : F.O.R Ludhiana

Should you require any further information please feel free to contact us

On Fri, 17 Feb 2023 at 2:54 PM, Raman Sharma <raman@jindalaluminium.com> wrote:
Dear Mr.Anurag,

Quote awaited.

Warm Regards
Raman Sharma
Manager - Purchase
#4: +91 8050-605-848 | L:+91 8027-735-051
' www.lindalAluminium.com

https:fioutlook.office.com/mail idf AAMKADZIMjI4 YiEyl WZjZWMINDM2MS04 OGIWLWFKNJNIZWE INTRINGBGAAAAAACXDXQkyUDpQSGqoXQBvHK. .
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2121123, 11:07 AM Mail - Raman Sharma - Outlook

From: Raman Sharma <raman®@jindalaluminium.com>
- Sent: Thursday, February 16, 2023 7:41 PM
_ Te: Anurag Taneja <anurag@sv hiana.in>

Cc: SVES {(www.svesludhiana.in} SHREE VISHWAKARMA ELECTRO SALES MAIL <svesldh@gmail.com>
- Subject: Re: Fw: Requirement-20000001373

_ Dear sir

As per your prifule you are also dealing in Allen Bradely Plc alao.Hence please send offer for below
- PLC ALLEN BRADLY Make for our Bhiwadi plant-

T ) .
Cotern Produc {3y

-1769-
L1SER-

iBB1B 1no
1747-

2 AENTR Ino

Please send quote on delivered basis to our plant at Bhiwadi,Rajsthan.

Warm Regards

Raman Sharma

Manager - Purchase

M: +91 8050-605-848 | L:+91 8027-735-051

www JindalAluminium.com

From: Anurag Taneja <anurag@sves|udhiana.in>

Sent: Thursday, February 16, 2023 4:29 PM

To: Rarnan Sharma <raman@jindalaluminium.com>

Cc: SVES (www.svesludhjana.in) SHREE VISHWAKARMA ELECTRO SALES MAIL <svesidh@gmail com>
Subject: Re: Fw: Requirement-20000001373

Dear sir

Enquired fan is customised fan for OEM , Regret please .......

https:/foutlook.office.com/mailfid/ AAMKADZIMI4Y EyL WZJZWMENDM2MS 04O GIwLWF KNjNiZWE1 NTRINgBGAAAAAACXDXQkyUDpQEGqoXQBvHK...  2/4




RE: Request for a quote against PR no:-EN230203781 { BHIWADI UNIT) - Quote No. 14533

Ameet Kodala - Asteam Techno Solutions Pvt Ltd <ameet@asteamtechno.com>

Sat 18-Feb-23 14:44

To: JRM PURCHASE <jrmpur@jindalaluminium.com>

Cc: Bhiwadi Purchase <purchasebhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com>;Sumit Savaliya - Asteam Techno Solutions Pvt Ltd

<sumit@asteamtechno.com>;Mittal Rathod - Asteam Techno Solutions Pvt Ltd <crm1@asteamtechno.com:;Priya Patel - Asteam Techno

Solutions Pvt Ltd <crm@asteamtechno.com>
Dear Sir,

Greetings from Asteam Techno Solutions Pvt Ltd 1!

Please find the price herewith,

A Unit Price Total Price
Sh Part Number Item Description -Make Qty. Unit {INR) {INR}
1 | 1747-AENTR 1746 SLC System, EtherNet/IP Allen Bradley | 1 | Nos. 128922 128922
Communication module
Compactlogix L19 Controller, 24 VDC
Only, Up to 8 Modules Expansion,
POINT Bus Backplane, 16 DI (Sink), 16
- - ’ . 101945 101945
2 | 1769-L19ER-BB1B DO (Source}, 2 Ethernet Port (DLR}, Up Allen Bradley 1 Nos
to 8 Ethernet/IP nodes, IMB User
Memaory, 1GB 5D Card Inbox
er i
Freight : Extra at actual
GST s Extra at 18%. e ‘G\
Warranty : 1 year standard * \‘
Transit Insurance ; Your scope g\h >

Delivery Period  : Within 1-2 weeks if Ex stock or 30-35 weeks or earl er

Payment Terms : 100% advance with PO u jA(_/
Validity : 15 Days from the date of offer. W

Feel free to contact us in case of any query. (/('ﬂ

0

Waiting for your favorable reply. \/( g
'e

Regards,

Ameet Kodala \G\‘ ’

{M) +91 95379 40404
{E) ameet@asteamtechno.com

AYZVA

) )
et A%ﬁ ream ¥

inte{;rator s 154 B8ORS Certified Compaay)

ASTEAM TECHNG SOLUTIONS PVT LTD

{Formarly Asteam Yechnologies)

Add : 4190, 4th Floor, Apple Square, Beside Swastik Plaza,

Yogi Chowk, Nana Varachha, Surat-395006, Gujarat, India,

E-maif - gsteamtech@amail.com; Web : www.asteamtechno.com

Wonderware | Allen Bradiey | Siemens | ABB | Schneider | VIPA | MOXA | Phoenix | Advantach
PLC | SCADA | HMI | AC Drives | Servo Drives | Converter | Profibus Connector § PPC | IPC

¥ D Aven-Bradley FElecoric AD\'\NTECH S§ E M & N g
PHCENIX T N
[EHENX MOXA ABB YIPE

PlL. note our new website address is www.asteamtechno.com
My new email ID is ameet@asteamtechno.com

Rociowell

Y patemstion  Schineider

M’"@'&'




From: JRM PURCHASE <jrmour@jindalaluminium.com>

Sent: 17 February 2023 18:18

To: ameet@asteamtiechno.com

Cc: Sumit Savaliya ~ Asteam Techno Solutions Pvt Ltd <gsumit@asteamtechna.coms; Janvi Lad - Asteam Techno Solutions Pvt Ltd

<crm2@asteamtechno.com>; Nehal Kakani - Asteam Techno Solutions Pvt Ltd <crml@asteamtechng,coms; Priva Patel - Asteam Techno Solutions
Pyt Ltd <grm@asteamtechno.com>; Bhiwadi Purchase <purchase.bhiwadi@®jindalaluminivm.coms> 4

Subject: Request for a quote against PR no:-EN230203781 ( BHIWADI UNIT)
Dear sit,

Please send your valuable quote for below material descriptions:-

8RR, MATERIAL MATERIAL DESCRIFTION | SPECIFIGATION ESTHIATED URHT
134 ' e - RELIRELE AT
DIZ302042¢7 ~ 15-FPER~23
1 07420263 ALLEN BRADLEY MAKE , 1746~8LC SYSTEM .EIRERNET / 1.001 nos

17 COMMUNICATION MODULE, PBARYT RO-1T747-AENTH,,

DIZAG20G43987 ~ 1L5-FPEB-Z3

2 107420262 ALLEN BRADLEY MAKE , COMPACTLOGIX L19 CONTROLLER, 1.00 ] NGS
PART RO-1769-L19ER~BB1E,,,

Regards,

Arvind

Purchase Department

M1 +91999-6362-260  Jindal Aluminium Limited

Rolling Mill Division, Tumkur Road,
T +91 8027-735-011/51 KIADB Industrial Area,
E: -jrmpur@ jindalaluminium.com Dabhaspet Bengalury Rural-

562111, Karnataka, India,

2018 - Nationa! Awards for Export Excellence, EEPC (Engineering Export Couricif of India}

I Andallumot



|

‘ YHEMA HEMA AUTOMATION

Plot No. : 1190,91,92 Phase-1, Diamond Industrial Park,Road No-3

AUTOMATION Near Sursez, Sachin Surat - 394230

Unit| - Rate ngiz?' . e
1 | 1769-L19ER-BB1B Compactlogix L19 1Mb Memory 85371000  1.00|NOS 108688.00 108688.00 0.00| 19563.84| 128251.84
Controller = 0% 18%
2 | 1747-AENTR SLC 500 Ethernet/IP Adapter 85176290  1.00| NOS 137449.00 137449.00 0.00| 24740.82| 162189.82
g -t

0% 18%

AL

(<§ wé
Q'Ab @M ‘r"'}
ANG
2°
(e
2.00 246137.00 44304.66 | 290441.66
INR Two Lakh Ninety Thousand Four Hundred Forty-Two Only ’ Taxable: 246137.00
Terms And Conditions
1.PAYMENT TERMS  : 100% Against Perfoma before Dispatch
2.VALIDITY OF OFFER: Upto 15 Days from the date of Offer 5
3.DELIVERY © Within 35-37 Weeks from the date of PO, B
4.TRANSPORTATION :  Packing, forwarding & freight charges at actual to your account. Amount: 290442,00
5.WARRANTY * 12 months from the date of Supply against any manufacturing defects.

It is system generated document does not require signature

Schneider HIEMLA  §IEMENS Bihor Autonmanen AL EP ER

Eleceric  prc/HMI s rotrsige " @ Alten-Bradiey @%ﬁﬁﬂﬁ

HIGHPRFONMANCE FOR EVERY CHALLENGE Ph.: 9687638048 E.mail.: sales@hemaautomation.com
Quotation No.  : HA: QTN:-001041_T Client Ref. No : MAIL 17/2
Quotation Date : 18/02/2023 Client Ref. Date :  17/02/2023 Page No: 1
TO, Buyer & Consignee (Ship to):
Jindal Aluminium Limited Jindal Aluminium Limited
Rolling Mill DivisionTumkur Road Rolling Mill DivisionTumkur Road
KIADB Industrial Area, Dabbaspet Bengaluru RuralBangalore Karnataka KIADB Industrial Area, Dabbaspet Bengaluru RuralBangalore Karnataka
Contact Person :Mr. Contact Person :Mr.
GSTIN ID: GSTIN ID:
State Code:29 State Code:29



STELLENT SYSTEMS PVT LTD

No: 9/2, First Floor, 61 Cross, Amarjyothinagar, Bangalore ~ 560 040, Ph: 080 23501142

Price Summary
Sl. No. Catalogue no. Description Unit Price in INR.
CompactLogix L19 Controller, 24 VDC Only, Up to 8 Modules Expansion, / q ﬁ\(
POINT Bus Backplane, 16 DI (Sink), 16 DO (Source), 2 Ethernet Port (DLR), \)
1769-L19ER-BB1B |Up to 8 Ethernet/IP nodes, IMB User Memory, 1GB SD Card Inbox MO
1747-AENTR 1746 SLC System, EtherNet/IP Communication module 1,4 .09 05 '6* (
Grand Total ; 2,61,508.29 || \ \) )
Price in Words: Rupees Two Lakh Sixty One Thousand Five Hundred Eight Only
Note : W
® Scope is limited to supply of hardware only. {V] * .

P
e Warranty is 12 months from the date of invoice. }t( b (P/k\'\f"\ »\...\ oS!
g MM( ww‘ﬂM'
VS e

Terms and Conditions

1. Payment Terms : 100% with taxes along with the PO Q QA(

2. Taxes and Duties : GST extra at 18%

3. Delivery Terms : Ex-works ’}\ ’V>
4. Delivery Lead Time : 30 to 34 weeks from the date of conformed PO

5. Transportation ] Extra at actuals

6. Insurance : NA

7. Packing & Forward ¢ inclusive

8. Validity : 30 days

Commercial details:

GST ID : 29AA0CS3508G173

Bank Details for RTGS/NEFT:

Bank Name and Complete Account Number MICR Code IFSC code
Address

J Indian Bank PrashanthNagar 894546289 560019022 IDIBO00S105




STELLENT SYSTEMS PVT LTD

No: 9/2, First Floor, 6 Cross, Amarjyothinagar, Bangalore — 560 040. Ph: 080 23501142

STELLEN Y

Ref :55-JA-M-100R00/22-23
To: Date: 19 - Feb - 2023
~ M/s. Jindal Aluminium Limited
SP-2/333, RICCO INDUSTRIAL AREA,,
BHIWADI, ALWAR-301019
Rajasthan, INDIA

Dear Sir,

Kind Attention : Mr. Arvind

Subject: Offer for the supply of Allen Bradley hardware

With reference to the above subject, please find attached our offer for your kind consideration.

We hope the same is in line with your requirements, and in case you need any further clarification,
we shall be glad to provide the same.

Based on the above, we look forward to your Purchase order for the same.

Assuring you of our best attention, co-operation and services at all times.

Thanking you,
Yours faithfully
For Stellent Systems Pvt. Ltd.,

0

Manjunath KN

Manager — Sales & Marketing

M: 97390 15557

E : manjunath.kn@stellentsystems.com



i PM Mail - JRM PURCHASE - Outlook

Ke Fw: Enquiry No:EN230203781Bhiwadi Division

.

Aarzoo Traders <info@aarzootraders.com>
Fri 24-Feb-23 17:50
To: JRM PURCHASE <jrmpur@jindalaluminium.coms>

Dear Sir,
Good Day!

Waiting for your reply on 1769- L19ER-BB1B. Would you like to purchase it ?

Thanks & Regards
Nisha
Export Executive
Mobile: +91-9512049925
Web - www.aarzootraders.com
The world of Email : info@aarzootraders.com
Electrical, Electronic Corporate Ofc: Aarzoo traders, opposite of Imamwada masjid,
Instrumentation, Alka Cinema Road, Bhavnagar-364001, Gujarat, INDIA
Automation & Panel. ISO 9001: 2015 Certified Company

On Thu, 23 Feb 2023, 5:08 pm Aarzoo Traders, <info@aarzootraders.com> wrote:
Dear Sir,

Our final price will be Rs. 1,45,500/-
- Our payment terms are 100% in advance.
Make - Allen Bradley
- Warranty is 1 year from the date of manufacturing on the box.

I If you have any questions please let me know.

Thanks & Regards

Nisha
Export Executive
Mobile: +91-9512049925
Web - www.aarzootraders.com
The world of Email : info@aarzootraders.com
Electrical, Electronic Corporate Ofc: Aarzoo traders, opposite of Imamwada masjid,
Instrumentation, Alka Cinema Road, Bhavnagar-364001, Gujarat, INDIA
Automation & Panel. ISO 9001: 2015 Certified Company
On Thy, Feb 23, 2023 at 3:18 PM JRM PURCHASE <jrmpur@ijindalaluminium.com> wrote:

| Dear Madam,
5 Thanks for Providing the offer, Kindly Confirm the Bellow Points for Enabling us to Proceed Further,

- Final Price- Considering Freight and P&F Nil
Incoterm- our Standard terms is FOR-Bhiwadi(Rajasthan)
| P&f-Nil
.| Warranty/TC- if any
. Make-
.| Payment Terms- Our standard terms is 30 Days after Receipt of Material

" Warm Regards
~ JRM PURCHASE
| M: +919900-058-284 | L: +91 8027-735-051 (319)

www.JindalAluminium.com

https:Houtlook.ofﬁce.comlmaiI.’idIAAMkAGEyOGU4ngzLTYzNGYtNDchSOSYzMOLTUzOGYmeYijI 1ZABGAAAAAACTLKPIGV20QZZpLXWL... 1/3



Re: Fw: Enquiry No:EN230203781Bhiwadi Division

Aarzoo Traders <info@aarzootraders.com>
Mon 20-Feb-23 15:32
To: JRM PURCHASE <jrmpur@jindalaluminium.com>

ﬂ] 1 attachments (640 KB)
IMG-20230220-WA0010.jpg;

Dear Sir,

Good Day!

Thank you for your inquiry.

We have 1769-L19ER-BB1B available in our stock as New Factory Seal 1 qty.
Price for the same is Rs.1,45,000/-

Please find attached photo for your reference.
If you have any questions please contact us.

Waiting for your reply.

Best Regards

Nisha
Export Executive
Mobile; +91§m@
Web - Www. ootraders.com
The world of Emall: info@aarzootraders.com
Electrical, Electronic Corporate Ofc: Aarzoo traders, opposite of Imamwada masjid,
Instrumentation, Alka Cinema Road, Bhavnagar-364001, Gujarat, INDIA
Automation & Panel. 1SO 9001: 2015 Certified Company

On Sun, 19 Feb 2023, 9:48 am JRM PURCHASE, <jrmpur@jindalaluminium.com> wrote:

- Reminder.....1

Regards,
- Arvind
Purchose Department

- M +91999.6362-260 Jindal Aluminiam Limited
T 491 8027-735-011/51 Rolling Mill Division, Tumkur Read,
E: -jrmpur® jindalaluminium.com KIADB Industrial Area,
: Dabbaspet Bengaluru Rural-
562111, Karnataka, India,

| 2018 - National Awards for Export Excellence, CEPC (Engineering Export Council of India)

www. JindalAluminium.com

- From: purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com <purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com>
Sent: Friday, February 17, 2023 09:40

To: Info@aarzootraders.com <info@aarzootraders.com>
© Ce: IRM PURCHASE <jrmpur@jindalaluminium.coms>
Subject: Enquiry No:EN230203781Bhiwadi Division

: Dear Sir/Madam,

- PLEASE QUOTE YOUR COMPETITIVE OFFER FOR THE ATTACHED ENQUIRY BY RETURN MAIL & KINDLY SEND YOUR ACKNOWLEDGEMENT MAIL ONCE YOU
* RECEIVED THE ENQUIRY FOR CONFIRMATION,

- NOTE : FEEL FREE TO CONTACT US IF YOU ARE NOT GETTING ENQUIRY ATTACHMENT AS MENTIONED IN ITEM DESCRIPTION.

ASST. MANAGER PURCHASE,



Al355-AB DRIVES & AUTOMATION (P) LTD-10000- EN230203781
Al355-AB DRIVES & AUTOMATION (P) LTD-1246470346-9926308387
Al660-AARZOO TRADERS-9825205981-9825205981 \ —

HO652-HEMA AUTOMATION*968763BD48—2612338038t_f”’/ 17-Feb-2023
S3008-STELLENT SYSTEMS PVT, LTD.—9845610143-—9739015557’/
S3015-SANIYA CONTROL SYSTEMS-9375007214- Immediate

V0609-VISION AUTOMATION TECHNOLOGY-8238024550-7929292157

foAgte

DI230204397 - 15-FEB-23

1 07420262 ALLEN BRADLEY MAKE , COMPACTLOGIX L19 1.00
CONTROLLER, PART NO-1769-L19ER-BBIB.,,
DI230204397 - 15-FEB-23

2 07420263 ALLEN BRADLEY MAKE , 1746-SLC SYSTEM 1.00

.ETHERNET / IP COMMUNICATION MODULE, PART
NO-1747-AENTR, ,

Note

1) YOU HAVE TO DELIVER THE MATERIAL AS PER YOUR COMMITTED DATE OF DELIVERY AT OUR WORKS FAILING
WHICH 2% PENALTY PER WEEK WILL BE DEPENDING UPON THE COMMODITY/ URGENCY OF THE
MATERIAL.HENCE, INDICAT DELIVERY PERIOD .

2) IN CASE, YOU ARE NOT ABLE TO SUPPLY THE MATERIAL ON OR BEFORE THE DUE DATE WE ARE EMPOWERED
TO DIVERT / CANCEL OUR ORDER TO OTHER SUITABLE VENDOR AT THE PREVAILING RATE IN THE

MARKET ,AND THE PRICE DIFFERENCE IF ANY WILL BE DEBITED TO YOUR ACCOUNT.

Please provide Service Tax/TIN Rigistration No./Certificate . We are releasing our payment
through bank hence provide the details of RTGS/NEFT/MICR/BANK ACCOUNT NO.

NOS

NOS



Jindal Aluminium Li ited PURCHASE INDENT
et Aluminium Limite Format : JAL/RMD/STO/E/04
Bhiwadi Division

BHIWAD! - 301019

Indent No : DI230204397 **.memzm.

Indent Date : 09-Feb-2023
P-TYPE : P2 Department . ELECTRICAL MAINTEN
Status :  PROCUREMENT Indent Type : DEPARTMENT
E.mmmm supply/procure the foliowing materials REVENUE EXPENSE
7 Item Code T T T T m oo - e | Justification AN T Y - T T Expected Date/ LT
S.No Description & Make Spl Description TYPE _ ﬁ Stock UOM To be _ Urgency/Brand/ |
F!ﬁlirrfaflslifrfFliaT%f;fF!lii@mb@ﬁf!!iinﬁmﬁmma lg,loxmfwnwo@h!iiff
107420262 - p2 FOR BP4 ﬁ 0.00 NOS 1.00 10-Feb-2023 ,
ALLEN BRADLEY MAKE , COMPACTLOGIX 119 ' PRESS/IMMEDIA | |y N N
CONTROLLER, PART NO-1769-119ER-BBI1p. : TE USE [P00006201410 EXTURSION | 70000.00
| _mw.mz.u\mh PRESS REPAIR AND ﬁ M
| MAINTENENC M
_ _
— e e T I
207420263 . P2 FOR BP4 | 0.00 NOS 1.00 | 10~Feb-2023
ALLEN BRADLEY MAKE , 1746-SLC SYSTEM . PRESS/IMMEDTA ,. LY N N
-ETHERNET / IP COMMUNICATION MODULE, | TE USE 'P00006201410 EXTURSION [ 120000.00
PART NO-1747-AENTR [PLANT/P4 PRESS REPATR AND W
MAINTENENC |
|

** If it is Urgent indicate accordingly

Indent by : JITENDER KUMAR Approved By

Head of Dept : VIKRAM JEET
| oer!s Remarks & signature Approximate Value 190000.00
9:37:13aM Page 1 of 2
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b

Indent No : DI230204397 * *URGENT

Indent Date : 03-Feb-2023
P-TYPE . PZ Department : ELECTRICAL MAINTLN
Status : PROCUREMENT : Indent Type : DEPARTMENT
Please supply/procure the following materials REVENUE EXPENSE
Ttem Code : , P- Justification |||||| QUANT H\w_ Y ———— - mx@mounmgl wMWm\ o o
S.No Description & Make Spl Description . TYPE | | Stock — To be - Urgency/Brand/
I 4w ..onhand _Purchased _ _ CMD Approved . ., . .. _
BELOW IS THE REMARKS GIVEN BY CONCERNED DURING APPROVAL.
USER NAME STATUS DATE REMARKS
JITENDER KUMAR Approved 9-Feb-23 FOR BP4 PRESS
VIKRAM JEET Approved 9-Feb-23 01d PLC obsolete, so we are going with new model
RAJAT PALLAV SINGH Approved 11-Feb-23 OK
DHIRAJ SINGH Approved 14-Feb-23 okay
SEETHARAM Approved 14-Feb-23 ok
BWDPUR Approved 15-Feb-23 ok

17-Feb-2023 . 9:37:13AaM Page 2 of 2




