7/13/23, 1:51 PM Mail - JRM PURCHASE - Outlook

Re: Reg: Offer for EN230601202

Galaxy Shailesh <galaxygroup.bhd@gmail.com> QW
Thu 13-Jul-23 12:53 @\ 0'9’ O qNQ/\ G‘m
To:JRM PURCHASE <jrmpur@jindalaluminium.com> ok
Cc:GALAXY Automation'<automation@galaxygroup.co.in> 916{00 T'\QO
1 attachments (289 KB) J el
OFFER_PDB PANEL FOR COLONY _13-07-23_R1.pdf; N@W@(f (v PU'J " — A
S~

Dear Sir, , ound Fl'\‘\U\Q M

DU ThL LA i

Our final price is 5,55,000/- + GST@18% . Te QA)(U‘ fok d
e JIENIN

As per your given IGA .

g-ereet

f\,‘,,,rj Dt
e The following prices are strictly based on our Quotation No.GPAPL/23-24/069 R1 (
Annexe-1). ‘/O‘mmha' IQ/M.()V‘A
e Any deviation from our BOQ will not be accepted.
e As per discussion with you We will accept any minor changes in the IGA after confirm PO
Till with don't change the overall dimension of the panel.
e FOR to your Plant in Bhiwadi | fCL nuyr Cemn”
e Payment Terms:- 100% Against Delivery (6

e Delivery Time:-6-8 Weeks

Waiting for your valuable Purchase Order. &

Best Regards
Aviral Singhal
+91-9887044128

On Thu, Jul 13, 2023 at 9:54 AM JRM PURCHASE <erpur@J|ndala|um|n|um com> wrote:
- Dear Sir,

GA drawing should be as per attached,
please confirm the final price accrodingly

Thanks and Regards
Gulappa Bhagannanavar

Senior Associate-Purchase

M: +91 9663034968 Jindal Aluminium Limited
T +91 8027-735-051/52 Rolling Mill Division, Tumkur Road,
E: jrmpur@jindalaluminium.com KIADB Industrial Area, Dabbaspet

Bengaluru Rural- 562111,
Karnataka, India.

www.JindalAluminium.com
2018 - National Awards for Export Excellence, EEPC (Engineering Export Council of India)

From: JRM PURCHASE <jrmpur@jindalaluminium.com>
Sent: Thursday, July 13, 2023 09:12

https://outlook.office.com/mail/id/AAMKAGEyOGUA4YjgzL TYZNGYtNDcxZS05YzMOLTUZOGYWZmYYyYjl1ZABGAAAAAACTLKPfGV20QZZpLXWL...  1/5
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Customer Name :

M/s. Jindal Aluminium Limited
Jindal Nagar, Tumkur Road
Bengaluru - 560073, India.

Kind Attn: Mr. ASST. MANAGER PURCHASE

Gala@

GALAXY PROCESS AUTOMATION PVT. LTD.

WORKS: H1-309/A, Phase-1, RIICO Industrial Area,
Bhiwadi-301018, Distt: Alwar (Raj.)

Mobile No. 9414013046

Email: automation@gaiaxygroup.co.in

CIN No. : U31100RJZ011PTC0O34496

UOTATION
Quotation No.  GPAPL/23-24/069 R1
Date 13.07.2023
Your Ref. By Mail
Our GST No. 08AAECG1692B1ZU

We thankfully acknowledge your above referred inquiry and take pleasure in quoting as per under
mentioned terms & condition.

S.NO. Description HSN Code Qty. U.Rate Amount
1 |PDB PANEL FOR COLONY 85371000 1 5,55,000.00 5,55,000.00
BOM Attached- Annux-1
ONLY SUPPLY OF PANEL.
TOTAL 5,55,000.00

Thanks & Regards

For Galaxy Process Automation Pvt. Ltd.

Shailesh Singhal (Director)
ANNEXURE/ENCLOSERS
Terms & Conditions

BOM

e




