7/13/23, 11:56 AM Mail - JRM PURCHASE - Outlook

R‘e: Reg: offer for Polytheen sheet (/C 120 76 [ 5}8

G D PACKAGING <gdpackaging26@gmail.com>
Thu 13-Jul-23 10:09

To:JRM PURCHASE <jrmpur@jindalaluminium.com> 4 \/

Dear Sir,
_ 13'
The offer for the trailing enquiry is Rs.98'per kg plus gst for Bhiwadi godown delivery.
Thank you
Tejus.S

G D Packaging

On Wed, Jul 12, 2023, 10:13 AM JRM PURCHASE <jrmpur@jindalaluminium.com> wrote:
Dear Sirs,
Please send your best offer considering freight in your scope for our
Bhiwadi(Rajastan)requirement.

POLYTHENE SHEET HMHD 44" - 55
MICRON + /5 MICRON - MAXIMUM WT.
8010101|PER ROLL 60 KG KG 2400

Thanks and Regards
Gulappa Bhagannanavar

Senior Associate-Purchase

M: +91 9663034968 Jindal Aluminium Limited
T: +91 8027-735-051/52 Rolling Mill Division, Tumkur Road,
E: jrmpur@jindalaluminium.com KIADB Industrial Area, Dabbaspet

Bengaluru Rural- 562111,
Karnataka, India.

www.JindalAluminium.com
2018 - National Awards for Export Excellence, EEPC (Engineering Export Council of India)
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1119143, 11:00 AIVI Mall - JRM PURCHASE - Outlook

Re: Reg: offer for Polytheen sheet

Manoj Kumar Patra <sales1@krislam.com>

Wed 12-Jul-23 10:44

To:JRM PURCHASE <jrmpur@jindalaluminium.com>

Cc:Ashok <ashok@krislam.com>;Vikas Bhansali <vbmarketing@krislam.com>;Domestic Marketing
<domestic@krislam.com>

Dear Sir,
We are in receipt of your above Enquiry and herewith quoting our best possible price for the same.

1. Commercial terms as agreed.

2. Our rates will be applicable as per present rates.

2. Validity of Offer - Our offers are only valid for - 6 days from the date of our email.
3. Any MOQ if required - Each width : 500 kgs (+/- 10% allowed)

4. Price will be - NET Weight.@ Rs. 87/- per kgs.

5. Payment terms - Net - 30 days (Delay In payment will definitely attract 24% per annum
interest).

6. Tolerance of micron may vary to - 5 % micron +/-.

Awaiting for your Order copy to proceed further.
Assuring you of our best services at all times.

Thanking You,

On Wed, Jul 12, 2023 at 10:13 AM JRM PURCHASE <jrmpur@jindalaluminium.com> wrote:
Dear Sirs,
Please send your best offer considering freight in your scope for our
Bhiwadi(Rajastan)requirement.

POLYTHENE SHEET HMHD 44" - 55
MICRON + /5 MICRON - MAXIMUM WT,

8010101|PER ROLL 60 KG KG 2400
- Mue
- Name of G )™ ")
Thanks and Regards JT} (GU/\Q ‘QO—Q ?ﬂ (6N

Gulappa Bhagannanavar
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purea oot
Vi: +91 9663034968 Jindal Aluminium Limited @’A
T: +91 8027-735-051/52 Rolling Mill Division, Tumkur Road, /
E: jrmpur@jindalaluminium.com KIADB Industrial Area, Dabbaspet
Bengaluru Rural- 562111, o8t - Zk’e’e’u

Karnataka, India. \}"Q »

www.JindalAluminium.com
2018 - National Awards for Export Excellence, EEPC (Engineering Export Council of India) MS‘,M
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- par
For Krishna Lamicoat Pvt Ltd. a /MH/
| | 13/6F

Senior Associate-Purchase

Manoj Kumar Patra
Sr. Business Development Executive.

https://outlook.office.com/mail/id/ AAMKAGEYOGUA4YjgzLTYzNGYtNDcxZS05YzMOLTUzOGYwZmYYyYil1 ZABGAAAAAACTLKPfGV20QZZpLXWL... 1/2



7/13/23, 12:12 PM Mail - JRM PURCHASE - Outlook

Re: Reg: offer for Polytheen sheet

PremKumar <prem@klenepaks.com>
Thu 13-Jul-23 12:11

To:JRM PURCHASE <jrmpur@jindalaluminium.com>

i

We Have given best Price Hm Hdpe -{89.50 +|GST.

Dear Sir.

Thanks & Regards N(‘QMJQ . I b P_hj ") PK’,V\
. |

PremKumar N.A. : , L

Manager Marketing J)?)((’)LN l;’/\c“i p’f

KLENE PAKS LTD
MOB : +918073389345

INE
E-Mail : prem.krishnad@gmail.com FG\% FT€/13
E-Mail : prem@klenepaks.com puf( .
www.klenepaks.com /D'Q/L‘ WO

From: JRM PURCHASE <jrmpur@jindalaluminium.com> g (6 OW}/)
Sent: Wed, 12 Jul 2023 10:13:25 GMT+0530 Porsy M2

To: <recipients undisclosed > QQ

Subject: Reg: offer for Polytheen sheet ég

| 2/ox
Dear Sirs,

Please send your best offer considering freight in your scope for our Bhiwadi(Rajastan)requirement.

POLYTHENE SHEET HMHD 44" - 55
MICRON + /5 MICRON - MAXIMUM WT.
8010101|PER ROLL 60 KG KG 2400

Thanks and Regards
Gulappa Bhagannanavar

Senior Associate-Purchase

M: +91 9663034968 Jindal Aluminium Limited
T: +91 8027-735-051/52 Rolling Mill Division, Tumkur Road,
E: jrmpur@jindalaluminium.com KIADB Industrial Area, Dabbaspet

Bengaluru Rural- 562111,
Karnataka, India.

www.JindalAluminium.com

2018 - National Awards for Export Excellence, EEPC (Engineering Export Council of India)
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A5117-AGGARWAL TRADE LINK-9024183293-

B0528-BANCHALIS PRINT PVT. LTD.-8041171191-9845949014
G5031-G.D. PACKAGING-29526888-6364604888 ,///
K0909-KLENE PAKS LTD-26581596-8073389345 ' 12-Jul-2023
S5274-SHREE SHYAM INDUSTRIES—7340052471—7340052472k////

EN230701707

- g 19/07/2023
167 1she LGM((@c&-EM@cﬂOﬂ 107/
ATI230700142 - 10-JUL-23
1 08010101 POLYTHENE SHEET HMHD 44" - 55 MICRON + / 5 2,400.00
MICRON - MAXIMUM WT. PER ROLL 60 KG,,
Note
1) YOU HAVE TO DELIVER THE MATERIAL AS PER YOUR COMMITTED DATE OF DELIVERY AT OUR WORKS FAILING
WHICH 2% PENALTY PER WEEK WILL BE DEPENDING UPON THE COMMODITY/ URGENCY OF THE
MATERIAL.HENCE, INDICAT DELIVERY PERIOD
2) 1IN CASE, YOU ARE NOT ABLE TO SUPPLY THE MATERIAL ON OR BEFORE THE DUE DATE WE ARE EMPOWERED
TO DIVERT / CANCEL OUR ORDER TO OTHER SUITABLE VENDOR AT THE PREVAILING RATE IN THE
MARKET .AND THE PRICE DIFFERENCE IF ANY WILL BE DEBITED TO YOUR ACCOUNT.

Please provide Service Tax/TIN Rigistration No./Certificate . We are releasing our payment
through bank hence provide the details of RTGS/NEFT/MICR/BANK ACCOUNT NO.



