RE: Request for Quotation EN230701786

alpesh@vijayhydrotech.com
Tue 18-Jul-23 5:18 AM

To:purchase <purchase@jindalaluminium.com>
Cc:Rajgopal C. Sarda <rajgopal @jindalaluminium.com>;Bhiwadi Purchase <purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com>

M/s. Jindal Aluminium Limited,
Bhiwadi,
Rajasthan Plant.

Dear Sir,

We are pleased to offer our best possible prices along with other terms and conditions against your
subject enquiry.

1] DC VALVE MODEL 4WE 6J 6X/E G24 N9K4 ,
MNR NO R983031147, REXROTH MAKE

\
Rate @ 990//- Each -\,\%BO

Delivery :Ex-Stock

HSN Code : 84812000.

2] DIRECTIONAL CONTROL VALVE, MODEL

NO-4WEGE 6X/EG24N9K4 MAKE REXROTH k\
' s
Required Quantity:01 No & \Xb A
o™
Rate @ WEach N %\ ‘{\6,

Delivery :Ex-Stock

HSN Code : 84812000. \3@
-.\\

Vg
N\
Terms and conditions :

Delivery . Ex-Stock subject to priority sale.

Discout M above prices. ‘DV\
Payment : 30 Days.

Taxes : 18% GST Extra as Applicable.

P.&F. : Nil.

Freight ~  :To pay.

Validity : 30 Days.

L.D. Clause : Not Applicable.



RE: Request for Quotation EN230701786

SDH DELHI <shashidhawal.delhi@srpgroup.co.in>

Wed 19-Jul-23 11:12 AM

To:purchase <purchase@jindalaluminium.com> O

Dear Sir, é

We acknowledge with thanks for your enquiry, we are glxddX\enclose the following quotation.

Sr. Part No Model Code " Prige Discafint Availa bility
= . N J
1 | R900561288 4WE 6 J6X/EG24N9K4 /Y | 6.5 }9% Ex Stock
‘ 2 ]
2 | R900561278 AWE 6 E6X/EG24N9K4 6,5 N\ | 20% Ex Stock
L\
LI
TERMS & CONDITIONS : S\
Price Ex our store <7\ e
TAX (GST) 18% -
PAYMENT 30 days

P&F Nil
Delivery As mentioned above
FREIGHT Paid

Validity 30 days PA
Hope this will meet your requirement & favor us with your valued order.
N
Ny
%’&}\

Thanks and Regards

Regards

Pauline

Shashi Dhawal Hydraulics Pvt Ltd

Mob # 99872 48899
Website: http://www.srpgroup.co.in

VIEW OUR PRODUCT CATALOGUE
CUSTOMER FEEDBACK
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From: purchase [mailto:purchase@jindalaluminium.com]
Sent: 19 July 2023 11:05

To: Sales Shashi Dhawal Hydraulics Delhi

Subject: Fw: Request for Quotation EN230701786



GSTIMN - 02aDU{4355

s 8

ADSAR . Trexrath
/ﬁr -L%\) WIPrOVIZ.ZLE exrnt I'I v

HYDRO 1/ Ingersoll Rand
CONTROLS }

! A Bosch Company |
Sales Partner

Plot No-F-773-A, Road No 6D, VKIA,JAIPUR- 302001 Tel:+911412375513 RAJASTHAN.
Email;jaipur@adsar.in,Web:www.adsar.in Tel: 08003397777

QUOTATION

Quatarion No. : 23245

Date :
Valid till : £
{Hilling Address l Shipping Address ]
CODE - 301013, RAJASTHA DA 4. ZRIWADI, ALWAR, EHIWADI {CODE 10 INDIA
Email:p Juminium.com
| No. | Image i ltem & Description item Code HSM / SAC Rate (.3)!_ Less: Taxable (%) B _Amo}»nz (T)1 Lead
| Discount (%) Time
QWE 5 J6X/EG23MIKS 8431 i]nos 5,570.00 1321400 5,256.00 §,202.08 | Ex-Stack
n Control Valve, Make:' Rexrcth 1
| I
2 4WE 6 £ 6X/EG24NSK4 < i{nos
Direction Control Valve, Make Rexroth
‘ i i
| i {
i
. =] - I

A e ”
Total Quotation Amount in Words :

| Rupees Twelve Thousand Four Hundred Four only

?

H
i




Re: Fw: Request for Quotation EN230701786

SANKALP HYDRAULIK <sankalphydro@gmail.com>
Fri 21-Jul-23 4:25 PM

To:purchase <purchase@jindalaluminium.com>
Cc:SALES SANKALP <sales.sankalp@shplgroup.com>

[UJ 1 attachments (11 KB)
image002,jpg;

Dear Sir,

Greetings from Sankalp Hydraulik Pvt Ltd
Thank You for your valuable inquiry

WE ARE AUTHORIZED DEALERS IN ONLY MAHARASHTRA
REGION

Best Regards,
HITESH

».logosan
SANKALP HYDRAULIK PVT. LTD.

Unit No.10, Newa Bhakti Park,

Near Capgemini Gate No. 04

IT knowledge Park, Patani Road
Airoli-Navi Mumbai,

Maharashtra 400708

Tel : +91 91366 06792 / +91 91369 81792
For Sales: +91 91361 18792

Email : sales.sankalp@shplgroup.com

Website : www.shplgroup.com

Authorised Sales Partners:
.».BOSCH REXROTH
Description: cid:image005.png@01D84049.5D67E5B0

Disclaimer : This message is for the designated recipient only and may contain privileged., propricary, or otherwise private

Ll

information. If you have received it in error; please notify the sender immediately and delete the original. Any use of the email by vou is
prohibited and is unlawfid. The Organisation shall not be liable for the message if altered, changed or falsified. Thank vou for vour Co-

operation.

On Fri, Jul 21, 2023 at 4:14PM purchase <purchase@jindalaluminium.com> wrote:



