7/13/23, 11:07 AM Mail - Raman Sharma - Outlook

Re: Fw: Enquiry No:EN230701652Bhiwadi Division

kumarappan Natarajan <kumars0359@gmail.com>

Wed 7/12/2023 7:20 PM

To:Raman Sharma <raman@jindalaluminium.com>

Cc:Arokia Dass dass <dass@kumaransg.in>;JRM PURCHASE <jrmpur@jindalaluminium.com>
Dear sir,

Further to your mail . Our price

SL.NO DESCRIPTION OF THE GOODS QTY
UNIT PRICE IN Rs.

1. CERAMIC FIBRE CONE AS PER DRG.NO.FR-BP-19-A4,, 600 NO
Rs.40/-

Terms of Sales

1. EX Works Basis. - Freight Charges will be to your account.

2. GST @ 18% will be Charged Extra.

3. Validity of offer 15 days.

4. Delivery - 3-4 weeks from the receipt of your firm.

5. Payment terms : 30 DAYS FROM THE DATE OF INVOICE

Warm regards,
N.Kumarappan

On Wed, 12 Jul 2023 at 6:55 PM, Raman Sharma <raman@jindalaluminium.com> wrote:
Dear Sir,

Qty. is not acceptable.
Plz quote for current requirement of 600 Nos. only.

Regards,
Raman

From: kumarappan Natarajan <kumars0359 @gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, July 12, 2023 6:50 PM

To: Raman Sharma <raman@jindalaluminium.com>

Cc: JRM PURCHASE <jrmpur@jindalaluminium.com>; Arokia Dass dass <dass@kumaransg.in>
Subject: Re: Fw: Enquiry No:EN230701652Bhiwadi Division

Dear sir,
Thank you for the reply mail.
Our best price ,F O R Bhiwadi Rs 38/ no.for 7200 nos.if it is lesser qty price will increase.

Warm Regards,
N.Kumarappan.
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On Wed, Jul 12, 2023, 17:53 Raman Sharma <raman@jindalaluminium.com> wrote:
Dear Sir,

As discussed,Please refer last supply, you have supplied on Rs.34/Pc Delivered to our works.

Now the increased quoted price of Rs.38/Pc is very high, and we are unable to accept it considering
bo change in RM and Freight charges.

Hence request you to review your pricing and confirm the final price to close this.

Regards,
Raman

From: JRM PURCHASE <jrmpur@jindalaluminium.com>
Sent: Wednesday, July 12, 2023 5:50 PM

To: Raman Sharma <raman@jindalaluminium.com>
Subject: Fw: Enquiry No:EN230701652Bhiwadi Division

From: kumarappan Natarajan <kumars0359@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, July 12, 2023 17:10

To: Bhiwadi Purchase <purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com>

Cc: JRM PURCHASE <jrmpur@jindalaluminium.com>; Arokia Dass dass <dass@kumaransg.in>
Subject: Re: Enquiry No:EN230701652Bhiwadi Division

Dear sir,

Further to the discussion our best price ,(If you release a yearly order 7200 Nos)
We are pleased to submit our most competitive offer for the supply of the Ceramic Foam Filter.

SL.NO DESCRIPTION OF THE GOODS

QTY UNIT PRICE IN Rs.
1. CERAMIC FIBRE CONE AS PER DRG.NO.FR-BP-19-A4,, 7200
NO Rs.38/-

Terms of Sales

1. EX Works Basis. - Freight Charges will be to your account.
2. GST @ 18% will be Charged Extra.

3. Validity of offer 15 days.

4. Delivery - 3-4 weeks from the receipt of your firm.
5. Payment terms : 30 DAYS FROM THE DATE OF INVOICE.

WARM REGARDS,

N.KUMARAPPAN

Kumaran Shapes & Gasket
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(1SO 9001-2015 CERTIFIED COMPANY )
NO : T 283, SIDCO WOMEN'S INDUSTRIAL ESTATE,
KATTUR , THIRUMULLAIVOYIL,CHENNAI,
TAMIL NADU - 600 062
GSTNO : 3BAAMPKS5504B1Z7
MOBILE : 90426 71071

MAIL . _kumar@kumaransg.in,

WEB . www.kumaransg.com

On Mon, 10 Jul 2023 at 14:48, kumarappan Natarajan <kumars0359@gmail.com> wrote:
SUB : YOUR ENQUIRY NO :EN230701652DT 08.07.23

Dear sir,
Greetings from KUMARAN SHAPES & GASKET.
We are in receipt of your enquiry and thank you very much for the Same.

We are pleased to submit our most competitive offer for the supply of the Ceramic Foam Filter.

SL.NO DESCRIPTION OF THE GOODS QTY
UNIT PRICE IN Rs.
1. CERAMIC FIBRE CONE AS PER DRG.NO.FR-BP-19-A4,, 600 NO
Rs.40/-

Terms of Sales

1. EX Works Basis. - Freight Charges will be to your account.

2. GST @ 18% will be Charged Extra.

3. Validity of offer 15 days.

4. Delivery - 3-4 weeks from the receipt of your firm.

5. Payment terms : 30 DAYS FROM THE DATE OF INVOICE.

WARM REGARDS,
N.KUMARAPPAN
Kumaran Shapes & Gasket

(1SO 9001-2015 CERTIFIED COMPANY )

NO : 7283, SIDCO WOMEN'S INDUSTRIAL ESTATE,

https://outlook.office.com/mail/inbox/id/AAMKADZiMjl4YEyLWZjZWMtNDM2MS04OGIwLWFKNjNiZWE1NTRINgBGAAAAAACXDXQkyUDpQ5GqoXQ...

3/4



7/13/23, 11:07 AM Mail - Raman Sharma - Outlook
KATTUR , THIRUMULLAIVOYIL,CHENNAI,

TAMIL NADU - 600 062

GSTNO : 33AAMPKS5504B1Z7

MOBILE : 90426 71071

MAIL . _kumar@kumaransg.in,

WEB : www.kumaransg.com

On Sat, 8 Jul 2023 at 15:09, <purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com> wrote:
Dear Sir/Madam,

PLEASE QUOTE YOUR COMPETITIVE OFFER FOR THE ATTACHED ENQUIRY BY RETURN MAIL & KINDLY SEND
YOUR ACKNOWLEDGEMENT MAIL ONCE YOU RECEIVED THE ENQUIRY FOR CONFIRMATION.

NOTE : FEEL FREE TO CONTACT US IF YOU ARE NOT GETTING ENQUIRY ATTACHMENT AS MENTIONED IN
ITEM DESCRIPTION.

ASST. MANAGER PURCHASE,
JINDAL ALUMINIUM LIMITED,
Bhiwadi division,

SP-2/333, INDUSTRIAL AREA,
BHIWADI - 301019,

ALWAR DIST,( RAJASTHAN )

GST No. 08AAACJ4324M1ZH

PH. NO. 9611195368

Website : www jindalaluminium.com

Warm Regards
N.Kumarappan
Kumaran Shapes& Gasket
KATTUR, Chennai 600062
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