From: Rajat Pallav Singh <rajatsingh@jindalaluminium.com>
Sent: Thursday, July 20, 2023 10:43 AM
To: Girraj sharan Sharma <girraj.sharma@jindalaluminium.com>; N S Raman <nsraman@jindalaluminium.com>; Neeraj Jagadish Tewari <neeraj@jindalaluminium.com>
Cc: Shankaranand Mishra <smishra@jindalaluminium.com>; Harikesh Sharma <harikesh.sharma@jindalaluminium.com>; Saroja B N <saroja.bn@jindalaluminium.com>; Rajgopal C. Sarda <rajgopal@jindalaluminium.com>; Varun Kumar Rustagi <varun.rustagi@jindalaluminium.com>; Purushothaman Hebbar Illath <purushothamanhebbar@jindalaluminium.com>; Bhiwadi Purchase <purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com>
Subject: Re: CC CLEARANCE - DEEWAN
 
OK 


	Warm Regards

	Rajat Pallav Singh 
Jindal Aluminium Ltd. 
SP-2/333, RIICO Industrial Area
Bhiwadi - 301019

	M: +91 9611-195-334  |  L: +91 8023-715-555 (383)

	



From: Girraj sharan Sharma <girraj.sharma@jindalaluminium.com>
Sent: Thursday, July 20, 2023 10:12 AM
To: N S Raman <nsraman@jindalaluminium.com>; Rajat Pallav Singh <rajatsingh@jindalaluminium.com>; Neeraj Jagadish Tewari <neeraj@jindalaluminium.com>
Cc: Shankaranand Mishra <smishra@jindalaluminium.com>; Harikesh Sharma <harikesh.sharma@jindalaluminium.com>; Saroja B N <saroja.bn@jindalaluminium.com>; Rajgopal C. Sarda <rajgopal@jindalaluminium.com>; Varun Kumar Rustagi <varun.rustagi@jindalaluminium.com>; Purushothaman Hebbar Illath <purushothamanhebbar@jindalaluminium.com>; Bhiwadi Purchase <purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com>
Subject: RE: CC CLEARANCE - DEEWAN
 
Dear Raman
 
Please note that the Product of Dewan Enterprises in only ultrasonic flow water meter, and as per the terms and conditions of quotation of Deewan Enterprises installation charges are extra which is the cleared in the quotation.
 
As per the CGWA (Central Ground Water authority) authorization which is attached as per their terms and condition required to install Ultrasonic flow meter with telemetric, Electromagnetic flow meter with IP68 is required, same will be connect from the CGWA Server through Airtel SIM Card. Already we have issued a workorder to the ECO Engineer for 0ne Flow meter but we have required 02 so another this indent raised by the maintenance team.
 
We will provide you additional approval of Plant Head Shri Neeraj Jagadish Tewari and Shri RPS Ji for processing the same.
 
@Neeraj Jagadish Tewari@Rajat Pallav Singh Kindly approve the additional flow meter through ECO Engineer on as attached work order basis.
 
	Warm Regards

	Girraj Sharma 
Legal & Corporate Relations Bhiwadi

	M: +91 9887550575 |  E: 323 (Bhiwadi) Raj


 
 
From: N S Raman <nsraman@jindalaluminium.com>
Sent: Thursday, July 20, 2023 9:43 AM
To: Girraj sharan Sharma <girraj.sharma@jindalaluminium.com>
Cc: Shankaranand Mishra <smishra@jindalaluminium.com>; Harikesh Sharma <harikesh.sharma@jindalaluminium.com>; Saroja B N <saroja.bn@jindalaluminium.com>; Rajgopal C. Sarda <rajgopal@jindalaluminium.com>; Varun Kumar Rustagi <varun.rustagi@jindalaluminium.com>; Purushothaman Hebbar Illath <purushothamanhebbar@jindalaluminium.com>; Bhiwadi Purchase <purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com>; Rajat Pallav Singh <rajatsingh@jindalaluminium.com>
Subject: Re: CC CLEARANCE - DEEWAN
 
Dear Sir,
 
Both the offers were available with OFS ( in attachments - CC and OFS ), request you to take print out from system and get it approved.
 
Warm Regards
N S Raman 
Manager - Purchase
M: +91 9611-195-320  |  L: +91 8023-715-555 (403)
	   
	www.JindalAluminium.com


 
 

From: Girraj sharan Sharma <girraj.sharma@jindalaluminium.com>
Sent: Thursday, July 20, 2023 9:27 AM
To: N S Raman <nsraman@jindalaluminium.com>
Cc: Shankaranand Mishra <smishra@jindalaluminium.com>; Harikesh Sharma <harikesh.sharma@jindalaluminium.com>; Saroja B N <saroja.bn@jindalaluminium.com>; Rajgopal C. Sarda <rajgopal@jindalaluminium.com>; Varun Kumar Rustagi <varun.rustagi@jindalaluminium.com>; Purushothaman Hebbar Illath <purushothamanhebbar@jindalaluminium.com>; Bhiwadi Purchase <purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com>; Rajat Pallav Singh <rajatsingh@jindalaluminium.com>
Subject: RE: CC CLEARANCE - DEEWAN
 
Dear Raman Ji
 
As discussed with Shri RPS Sir, please provide us the quotation of both the parties, necessary action can be taken accordingly.
 
And he is not in CC or not getting any indent regarding this equipment.
 
	Warm Regards

	Girraj Sharma 
Legal & Corporate Relations Bhiwadi

	M: +91 9887550575 |  E: 323 (Bhiwadi) Raj


 
 
From: N S Raman <nsraman@jindalaluminium.com>
Sent: Wednesday, July 19, 2023 6:51 PM
To: Girraj sharan Sharma <girraj.sharma@jindalaluminium.com>
Cc: Shankaranand Mishra <smishra@jindalaluminium.com>; Harikesh Sharma <harikesh.sharma@jindalaluminium.com>; Saroja B N <saroja.bn@jindalaluminium.com>; Rajgopal C. Sarda <rajgopal@jindalaluminium.com>; Varun Kumar Rustagi <varun.rustagi@jindalaluminium.com>; Purushothaman Hebbar Illath <purushothamanhebbar@jindalaluminium.com>; Bhiwadi Purchase <purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com>; Rajat Pallav Singh <rajatsingh@jindalaluminium.com>
Subject: Re: CC CLEARANCE - DEEWAN
 
Dear Sir,
 
In circulation, Sh.RPS given the following remark, hence we request you to get it clarified and get the approval from them, to enable us to place order on M/s.Eco Engineers with higher price by Rs.37000 approximately.
 
MATTER MOST URGENT.
 
Warm Regards
N S Raman 
Manager - Purchase
M: +91 9611-195-320  |  L: +91 8023-715-555 (403)
	   
	www.JindalAluminium.com


 
 

From: Rajat Pallav Singh <rajatsingh@jindalaluminium.com>
Sent: Monday, July 17, 2023 11:16 AM
To: Girraj sharan Sharma <girraj.sharma@jindalaluminium.com>
Cc: Shankaranand Mishra <smishra@jindalaluminium.com>; Harikesh Sharma <harikesh.sharma@jindalaluminium.com>; Saroja B N <saroja.bn@jindalaluminium.com>; Rajgopal C. Sarda <rajgopal@jindalaluminium.com>; Varun Kumar Rustagi <varun.rustagi@jindalaluminium.com>; Purushothaman Hebbar Illath <purushothamanhebbar@jindalaluminium.com>; Bhiwadi Purchase <purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com>; N S Raman <nsraman@jindalaluminium.com>
Subject: Re: CC CLEARANCE - DEEWAN
 
Kindly put up approval with all details
 
 
	Warm Regards

	Rajat Pallav Singh 
Jindal Aluminium Ltd. 
SP-2/333, RIICO Industrial Area
Bhiwadi - 301019

	M: +91 9611-195-334  |  L: +91 8023-715-555 (383)

	



From: Girraj sharan Sharma <girraj.sharma@jindalaluminium.com>
Sent: Monday, July 17, 2023 9:15 AM
To: Rajat Pallav Singh <rajatsingh@jindalaluminium.com>
Cc: Shankaranand Mishra <smishra@jindalaluminium.com>; Harikesh Sharma <harikesh.sharma@jindalaluminium.com>; Saroja B N <saroja.bn@jindalaluminium.com>; Rajgopal C. Sarda <rajgopal@jindalaluminium.com>; Varun Kumar Rustagi <varun.rustagi@jindalaluminium.com>; Purushothaman Hebbar Illath <purushothamanhebbar@jindalaluminium.com>; Bhiwadi Purchase <purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com>; N S Raman <nsraman@jindalaluminium.com>
Subject: Re: CC CLEARANCE - DEEWAN
 
Dear Sir
 
Kindly allow
 
One plus 
Outlook for Android

From: N S Raman <nsraman@jindalaluminium.com>
Sent: Monday, July 17, 2023 9:13:24 AM
To: Girraj sharan Sharma <girraj.sharma@jindalaluminium.com>
Cc: Rajat Pallav Singh <rajatsingh@jindalaluminium.com>; Shankaranand Mishra <smishra@jindalaluminium.com>; Harikesh Sharma <harikesh.sharma@jindalaluminium.com>; Saroja B N <saroja.bn@jindalaluminium.com>; Rajgopal C. Sarda <rajgopal@jindalaluminium.com>; Varun Kumar Rustagi <varun.rustagi@jindalaluminium.com>; Purushothaman Hebbar Illath <purushothamanhebbar@jindalaluminium.com>; Bhiwadi Purchase <purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com>
Subject: Re: CC CLEARANCE - DEEWAN
 
Dear Sir,
 
We request you to discuss with Mr.RPS and to clear the CC, to enable us to proceed further.
 
	Best Regards
N S Raman
Manager - Purchase

	M: +91 9611-195-320
T: +91 8023-715-561
E: nsraman@jindalaluminium.com
	Jindal Aluminium Limited
Jindal Nagar, 16th KM, Tumkur Road,
Bengaluru - 560073, Karnataka, India.

	
	www.JindalAluminium.com


 
2018 - National Awards for Export Excellence, EEPC (Engineering Export Council of India)

From: Girraj sharan Sharma <girraj.sharma@jindalaluminium.com>
Sent: Saturday, July 15, 2023 9:45 AM
To: N S Raman <nsraman@jindalaluminium.com>
Cc: Rajat Pallav Singh <rajatsingh@jindalaluminium.com>; Shankaranand Mishra <smishra@jindalaluminium.com>; Harikesh Sharma <harikesh.sharma@jindalaluminium.com>; Saroja B N <saroja.bn@jindalaluminium.com>; Rajgopal C. Sarda <rajgopal@jindalaluminium.com>; Varun Kumar Rustagi <varun.rustagi@jindalaluminium.com>; Purushothaman Hebbar Illath <purushothamanhebbar@jindalaluminium.com>; Bhiwadi Purchase <purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com>
Subject: RE: CC CLEARANCE - DEEWAN
 
Dear All
 
Do not go only on the cost of the flow meter because apart from the cost there are many other things which are related to the compliance, the said flow meters should have been installed 11 months back from today, but after installing them, we could not extract the more than 71 KL water from both these borewells. since we have civil work going on and expansion limits were not fixed, now almost everything is final, so we need to install flow meters on both these borewells because we need to file annual compliance before the CGWA before 10th August . In addition, installation these flow meters ECO Engineers will provide the following services in this price.
 
1. This flow meter will connect from the SERVER OF CGWA.
2. Will create the Data of water extraction of past 11 months.
3. Will submit the Annual compliance before the Central Ground Authority.
4. Will assist in all the issues relating noncompliance of CGWA.
 
 
ECO Engineers belongs from Bhiwadi and will assist as and when required, still we recommend to this vendor for installing the remaining one Flow Meter, and already this authority doing work for installation of another one flow meter and piezometer on same rate.
 
	Warm Regards

	Girraj Sharma 
Legal & Corporate Relations Bhiwadi

	M: +91 9887550575 |  E: 323 (Bhiwadi) Raj


 
 
From: N S Raman <nsraman@jindalaluminium.com>
Sent: Friday, July 14, 2023 2:57 PM
To: Girraj sharan Sharma <girraj.sharma@jindalaluminium.com>
Cc: Rajat Pallav Singh <rajatsingh@jindalaluminium.com>; Shankaranand Mishra <smishra@jindalaluminium.com>; Harikesh Sharma <harikesh.sharma@jindalaluminium.com>; Saroja B N <saroja.bn@jindalaluminium.com>
Subject: CC CLEARANCE - DEEWAN
 
Dear Sir,
 
Indent No.
	DIGITAL ULTRASONIC WATER FLOW METER WITH TELEMETRIC, SIZE 2", INDENT NO. DI230500492


 
Indent is pending more than 2 months,
 
Comparative Statement is pending with you, request you to clear the CC on TOP PRIORITY basis.
 
 
CC No.CC230600869, pending from 27th June onwards, kindly clear
	   
	www.JindalAluminium.com


 
 

 
Warm Regards
N S Raman 
Manager - Purchase
M: +91 9611-195-320  |  L: +91 8023-715-555 (403)
 

