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Re: Enquiry No:EN230702008Bhiwadi Division

Naresh Bhiwadi <naresh.bhiwadi@gmail.com>

Fri 7/28/2023 4:16 PM - \}0\_’\3’\
To:Bhiwadi Purchase <purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com> A%LX @Tb\.&’sS\w
Eliasr Selro r best rates Q\&O‘L‘S\A
ee ou :
. oS &
6mm ply is 22 rs. Per sqft. 6161-' pe> N A NN o Q-
9mm ply is 34 rs. Per sq. Ft é\?_l — Pox Nos x\\OO\’e"

Gst extra
For delivery \&
Payment advance

On Thu, 27 Jul, 2023, 5:48 pm , <purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com> wrote:
Dear Sir/Madam,

PLEASE QUOTE YOUR COMPETITIVE OFFER FOR THE ATTACHED ENQUIRY BY RETURN MAIL & KINDLY SEND
YOUR ACKNOWLEDGEMENT MAIL ONCE YOU RECEIVED THE ENQUIRY FOR CONFIRMATION.

P ™
NOTE : FEEL FREE TO CONTACT US IF YOU ARE NOT GETTING ENq UIRY ATTA(".!’I'ﬂbéNT*AS’MENﬁF FLJEE'N ITEM

DESCRIPTION. Ab p~ N
oiscount  2...0.Dove, 133.¢0. Ot Dines
ASST. MANAGER PURCHASE, n
PRICE BASIS @ FOR SiiWAD
JINDAL ALUMINIUM LIMITED, r RICEBASIS : FOR '”“‘"'{mk’m\
Bhiwadi division
1 P & F IH sl - y; .
SP-2/333, INDUSTRIAL AREA, A EATRA e,
BHlWADl i 301019’ GST ‘GST : ""lll"'lllllllglt/l,llll..l('lli‘llllll!li

ALWAR DIST,( RAJASTHAN)

GST No. 08AAACJ4324M1ZH DELIVERY ¢ .o @ dﬁ.ﬂ

PH. NO. 9611195368
Website : www jindalaluminium.com PAYMENT

GCWCC




EN2203e20%0

Rates

Shubham Gupta <ganpatiplywoodhardware2001@gmail.com>
Sat 7/29/2023 5:05 PM
To:Bhiwadi Purchase <purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com>

Hi, Greetings of the day!

Here are the rates-

1). Commercial ply6x3 9mm = 3576 S?Ol’— - CHEC“/ Lgc.ﬁ.:‘ N
2). Commercial ply7x4 6mm =590 per sheet "\ A
3). Decolam sheet = X550 per sheet DISCOUNT - ﬂbm\’ee{\mgs : Q[\;%\M
Warm regards
PRICE BASIS - _ 5
Ganpiati plswead & hardware ‘ A ICE BASIS : FOR sHlv;/Am....aIﬁLB)ammh
\en P&F INCLe—
D'\—Swg N\.'L ---------- -ll E)\ ..................

Abo’\/ £~ 0&/( PAYMENT 5. dﬂd—f .................
*» — ‘
%W\ SV . o




Re: Enquiry No:EN230702030Bhiwadi Division
Mohit Goyal <shrikrishantimber1991@gmail.com>

Sat 7/29/2023 10:46 AM . \)&\\J\/\
To:Bhiwadi Purchase <purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com> bi$ub$5\w
A mmebrmmply @32/- sqfeet ﬁ,"‘" s%6 I" \Q\f - . A(\/\—G—
[’hm@’r’nm ply @30/- sqfeet a’,_,, (8‘40,——-’ Wt Hb \
Laminate @550/- pr sheet |

\ 32 - S
Freight extra A m P ~j 26— S \;Puf Qbo\‘e/‘
Gst 18% extra b M™ by — %QM&Q/{’_'

On Sat, 29 Jul 2023, 9:06 am <purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com> wrote:
Dear Sir/Madam,

PLEASE QUOTE YOUR COMPETITIVE OFFER FOR THE ATTACHED ENQUIRY BY RETURN MAIL & KINDLY SEND
YOUR ACKNOWLEDGEMENT MAIL ONCE YOU RECEIVED THE ENQUIRY FOR CONFIRMATION.

NOTE : FEEL FREE TO CONTACT US IF YOU ARE NOT GETTING ENQUIRY ATTACHMENT AS MENTIONED IN ITEM
DESCRIPTION.

ASST. MANAGER PURCHASE, - CHECK LlST

JINDAL ALUMINIUM LIMITED, @a\ ' .
Bhiwadi division, DISCOUNT : ....ﬂbme.... S0k 2., E,\'y\e.l.Q
SP-2/333, INDUSTRIAL AREA, \
BHIWADI - 301015, PRICE BASIS : FOR BHIWADL... ALk Bhligjacl
ALWAR DIST,( RAJASTHAN )
GST No. 0BAAACJ4324M1ZH P&F
PH. NIO. 96111?.5368 N GSTHGST
Website : www jindalaluminium.com
DELIVERY
et
PAYMENT 9 g
GC/WwChC
VALIDITY




