(p/\o;\&

S.N.D. INDUSTRIES

# 3/4 Sri Skanda Nilayam, Abbigere main road, 4™ Cross, Near Sujatha
Wood Industries, K.G.Halli, Jalahalli West, Bangalore-560015
Email:sndindustries201 1(@gmail.com Mob: - 09036635315

TO, EN230601064

Date: 12/06/23
QTN: 3059

JINDAL ALUMINIUM LIMITED,
Bhiwadi division,

SP-2/333, INDUSTRIAL AREA,
BHIWADI - 301019,

ALWAR DIST,( RAJASTHAN )

Sub: Quotation for manufacturing

01 Item Qty Rate/- Amount

1 | DRIVE ROLLER FOR COLD SAW CONVEYOR | 10nos | 23150/~ | 231000.00
OF BP3 PRESS.
DRAWING NO- APS-BP3-10-A4.,,
2 | DRIVE ROLLER FOR COLD SAW CONVEYOR | 12nos 25610 | 307320.00
OF BP4 PRESS.
DRAWING NO- APS-BP4-24-A4.,,

e ! ,
Dvccoceu. Y

1. Including of transport to Jindal Alu .
2. Delivery term approximant 4 Week @C@ 6‘ \eeh
3. Payment term 30 Days from date of invoice
(oiort | B0 oy
i e4e4
My (MUFor: S.N.D. Industries

(Dinakar)

, Proprietor
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Re: Enquiry No:EN230601064Bhiwadi Division

Golden Engineering & Enterprises <golden.mondal@gmail.com>
Mon 6/12/2023 10:43 AM
To:Bhiwadi Purchase <purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com>

Cc:Rajgopal C. Sarda <rajgopal@jindalaluminium.com>

Dear Sir,

Thank you for your valuable purchase enquiry but we regret to inform you this is not quoted due
to beyond our capacity.

Best regards,
For Golden Engineering & Enterprises.

S. Mondal.(Proprietor)
09830250045/ (003) 26672449
Whatsapp N0:9836668627

Visit us at; www.goldenengineering.co.in

On Mon, Jun 12, 2023 at 10:29 AM Bhiwadi Purchase <purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com>
wrote:

Dear Sir,
| Final Reminder....cw
' Kindly Submit your Quotation.
Warm Regards

From: Bhiwadi Purchase <purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com>
Sent: Saturday, June 10, 2023 11:56 AM

To: golden.mondal@gmail.com <golden.mondal@gmail.com>

Cc: Rajgopal C. Sarda <rajgopal@jindalaluminium.com>

Subject: Re: Enquiry No:EN230601064Bhiwadi Division

Dear Sir,
' Reminder.............
Kindly Submit your Quoation.

From: purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com <purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com>
Sent: Friday, June 9, 2023 4:24 PM
To: golden.mondal@gmail.com <golden.mondal@gmail.com>
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—— AN ISO 9001: 2015 CERTIFIED COMPANY
ENGINEERS, MANUFACTURER & FABRICATORS
13/6, NATABAR PAUL ROAD (KADAMTALA) HOWRAH - 711 101. WEST BENGA.L
TEL.NO.033-2643-8105, E.MAIL:indroindustries@yahoo.co.in Website: www.indroindustries.com

QUOTATION

QUOTATIONNO-1/Q/149/2023-24 DATE 09.06.2023
REF ENQ. NO. EN230601064 DATE 09.06.2023

TO,
M/S. JINDAL ALUMINIUM LIMITED
BHIWADI, RAJASTHAN

Dear Sir,
Thanking you for your above enquiry and we are pleased to submit our lowest best offer. Our terms &
conditions are given below. ~ ‘ =
§59°
SL.NO ITEM CODE. Materials Description Quantity Prices Per
1. 06641907 | DRIVEROLLER FOR COLD SAW CONVEYOR | 405 13;600/- | EACH
OF BP3 PRESS. DRAWING NO- APS-BP3-10-A4 '
2. 06641908 | DRIVE ROLLER FOR COLD SAW CONVEYOR 12 NOS W/— EACH
OF BP4 PRESS. DRAWING NO- APS-BP4-24-A4 ) [ Ood\L

HSN CODE 84834000 D(bf( ’
Gant

We trust our offer will be acceptable to you and will be favored with your valued order.

TERMS & CONDITIONS.

GOODS & SERVICE TAX : G.S.T. 18% WILL BE CHARGE EXTRAL—
TRANSPORTATION :  DOOR DELIVERY BASIS. +~

PAYMENT : WITHIN30DAYS. (— ¢ Lo
DELIVERY :  WITHIN 6-8 WEEKS  — Q.
INSPECTION : AT YOUR WORKS GD\ e
VALIDITY . 30 DAYS {0 4

FOR INDRO INDUSTRIES

SUSANTA BERA
Mobile No. 9831030323

OUR G.S.T. NO. 19AAFFI1702C1ZX



RAEPUT INDUSTRY. DATE: 10.06.2023

BHIWADIL, RAJSTHAN, PIN CODE
301019 GST NO.
08IHPS9548M 122

To

M/s. JINDAL ALUMINIUM LIMITED
Plot No. Sp-2/333 RIICO IND AREA BHIWADI Subject: Quotation
GST NO - 08AAAC)4324M1ZH

Kind Attn. : Mr. JINDAL ALUMINIUM

Respected Sir,
Please check below quotation....

S.No. . Item Name & Discription HSN Qty. Unit __Rate Amount
Drive Roller For Cold Saw Conveyor Bp3

1 Press APS-BP3-10-A4 7214 10 Pes 13700 137000
Drive Roller For Cold Saw Conveyor Bp3

2 Press APS-BP4-24 -Ad 7214 10 Pcs 18300 183000

320000.00
G. Total;
[N =
., B* DR Ceont |57
Terms and Condition: 9‘ ¥ i

P ¥
1.GST18%Extra}>Q®\& F@ ‘& @1\30&9 '
(o c{be peoels O AT

Thanks with Best Regards,

If any querry then please let me know. 67012,( G;S\gd’\f

Sunny Singh
Rajput Industry

Mobile No. 8009453180 w Wy~ &4( @ QQQG/M



‘ /R . od 0

G0680-GOLDEN ENGINEERING &
ENTERPRISES-919830250045-919830250045
I0592-INDRO INDUSTRIES-9339288975-3326438105~

EN230601064

Q
I5046-INDIAN GLOBAL SOURCING INDUSTRIES-0- éyy 09-Jun-2023
R5104-RAJPUT INDUSTRY-8009453180-. r@;£“
S5209-SRI KARTHIK ENTERPRISES. Immediate
-9945019887-
S5295-SHIVAM ENGINEERING-0-7976717048
S5571-SND INDUSTRIES-9738883879- /
DI230600949 - 08-JUN-23
1 06641907 DRIVE ROLLER FOR COLD SAW CONVEYOR OF BP3 10.00
PRESS. DRAWING NO- APS-BP3-10-A4.,,
DI230600949 - 08-JUN-23
2 06641908 DRIVE ROLLER FOR COLD SAW CONVEYOR OF BP4 12.00
PRESS. DRAWING NO- APS-BP4-24-A4.,,
Note
1) YOU HAVE TO DELIVER THE MATERIAL AS PER YOUR COMMITTED DATE OF DELIVERY AT OUR WORKS FAILING
WHICH 2% PENALTY PER WEEK WILL BE DEPENDING UPON THE COMMODITY/ URGENCY OF THE
MATERIAL.HENCE, INDICAT DELIVERY PERIOD
2) 1IN CASE, YOU ARE NOT ABLE TO SUPPLY THE MATERIAL ON OR BEFORE THE DUE DATE WE ARE EMPOWERED
TO DIVERT / CANCEL OUR ORDER TO OTHER SUITABLE VENDOR AT THE PREVAILING RATE IN THE
MARKET.AND THE PRICE DIFFERENCE IF ANY WILL BE DEBITED TO YOUR ACCOUNT.

Please provide Service Tax/TIN Rigistration No./Certificate . We are releasing our payment
through bank hence provide the details of RTGS/NEFT/MICR/BANK ACCOUNT NO.



