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KUDAMM CORPORATION

Address : Y-25 Okhla Industrial Area Phase-2, Opp. Okhla Metro Station New Delhi-110020

Phone No. : 8448448910, 9999002900 | E-mail : enquiry@kudammcorp.in
Website : www.kudammcorp.com | GSTIN:07AAAFK3557G1ZG

Quotation No.

Quotation Date

Customer Reference No
Customer Reference date
Project Name

Bill To

JINDAL ALUMINIUM LIMITED(bhiwadi divisio

: Ash-800/14757130623

: 13/06/2023 4:01:23 PM
: EN23060108
: 13/06/2023

SP-2/333, RICCO INDUSTRIAL AREA,, BHIWADI, ALWAR-301019 , BHIWADI

Contact Person :

Contact Person Number : 9611195368, 9057407027
Contact Person Email : purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com

Additional Contact Email :

Quotation

S.N | Item & Description HSN/SAC Qty (Unit) Rate Amount
1 ACS 560-01-05A6-4 8504 3 21 m 64,500.00
ABB make ACS 560 series 2.2 KW [P20 Built-in Modbus
RTU, 6 DI, 3RO, 2 Al, 2 AO, Ambient Temperature 40
0.2 A, 2 o, -
Deg C, EMC Filters, STO, Coated Boards, . 380-480
(+10 & - 15%)
Sub Total 64,500.00
Notes;
Total Discount 0.00
Amount in Words : Sub Total 64,500.00
Seventy Six Thousand One Hundred And Ten Rupees Only Other Charges 0.00
GST 11,610.00
Bank Detals Total Rs. 76,110.00
Account Holder Name KUDAMM CORPORATION \P"\
Account No 0390261001755
S/
Bank Name CANARA BANK v (V\ wa
Branch NEHRU PLACE, NEW DELHI. (0390 1
IFSC/RTGS CODE NO. CNRB0000390 \r)j
SWIFT CODE CNRBINBBDXN 7 /K\ \ Qd"’\
(== =

Terms & Conditions
1. Delivery
2. Payment
3. Warranty

Ex-stock

OO

100% Against Pl

required, it will be charged extra

yvpyﬁ\(
One year against any manufacturing defect for the product from the date of sald. If any s

A

/vice Engr visit is

Asha gupta

Engineer Services (Automation)
9899062500
asha.gupta@kudammcorp.in




Re: Enquiry No:EN230601080Bhiwadi Division

Kalpana Waghulde <kalpana.w@eastrocontrol.com>
Mon 12-Jun-23 17:15

To:Bhiwadi Purchase <purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com>
Cc:Rudresh Kangane <rudresh.kangane@eastrocontrol.com>;JRM PURCHASE <jrmpur@jindalaluminium.com>

Dear Sir,

Please find below Offer,

1 ACS560-01-05A6-4 22KWVFD 3 21,634 631020 2022 \('JVO\

Weeks
GST: 18% Extra ‘\,(ﬁO\( ﬁ‘\b
Thanks & Best Regards, )\6\\(& ( ) g U/\
Kalpana Waghulde | Sales Executive | Phone: +91- 253 — 2970660 , 8600300184

¢

Eastro Control System Pvt Ltd
... Description: Description: NewLogo_
www.eastrocontrol.com | kalpana.w@eastrocontrol.com

NS

Pune Office: G-705, Aishwaryam Society, Near Khandoba Mandir Chouk, Akurdi, Pune-411019 | +91 8600300147 9\\

Head Office: H145/1, MIDC, Ambad, Nashik-422010 | Phone +91 253 2380145, 2970660

From: purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com <purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com>
Sent: Saturday, June 10, 2023 12:51 PM

To: Aarti Bodke <info@eastrocontrol.com>; Rama Shankar <sales@eastrocontrol.com>

Cc: jrmpur@jindalaluminium.com <jrmpur@jindalaluminium.com>

Subject: Enquiry No:EN230601080Bhiwadi Division

Dear Sir/Madam,

PLEASE QUOTE YOUR COMPETITIVE OFFER FOR THE ATTACHED ENQUIRY BY RETURN MAIL & KINDLY SEND YOUR ACKNOWLEDGEMENT MAIL
ONCE YOU RECEIVED THE ENQUIRY FOR CONFIRMATION.

NOTE : FEEL FREE TO CONTACT US IF YOU ARE NOT GETTING ENQUIRY ATTACHMENT AS MENTIONED IN ITEM DESCRIPTION.

ASST. MANAGER PURCHASE,
JINDAL ALUMINIUM LIMITED,
Bhiwadi division,

SP-2/333, INDUSTRIAL AREA,
BHIWADI - 301019,

ALWAR DIST,( RAJASTHAN )

GST No. 08AAACJ4324M1ZH

PH. NO. 9611195368

Website : www.jindalaluminium.com



Re: Enquiry No:EN230601080Bhiwadi Division

sales shrirangsales.in <sales@shrirangsales.in>

Mon 12-Jun-23 10:43

To:Bhiwadi Purchase <purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com>

CcJRM PURCHASE <jrmpur@jindalaluminium.com>;SSC ABB drive <vfd@shrirangsales.in>

Dear Sir,

As per your valuable inquiry , please find the below mentioned ABB Make VFD Price

ACS560-01-05A6-4 + ACS-BP-S--======ncncuuu 1 Nos
Rating : 3 HP/2.2 KW NORMAL DUTY
Unit price : 19500/-

Delivery :Within 10 to12 weeks prior to order

Terms & Condition: )« N
8k W e
e Price basis ; FOR Sachin W \J
o GST 18% EXTRA O
e Payment : 100% advance against PI = \ V'/h/

o validity : 20 days ,@ ()\f) \J\ LN

Feel free to write to us if you have any query. “]k’\( (Q_j\f *’3(

Waiting for your valuable order.

Thanks & Regards Q‘) y.P
. ©
Amita Varma 4

9824477304 ’

N\
Shrirang Sales Corporation \

(CRISIL SE-1A Rated, Since 2010)
UG-3&4, Nirman Bhavan,

Nr. Krushi Mangal Tall,

Majura Gate, Ring Road,

Surat - 395002.

Tele.: + 91 201 247 1323

Fax:+ 91 261 247 4034

Email: vid@shrirangsales.in_/surateshrirangsales.com

Website: www.shrirangsales.com

On Sat, Jun 10, 2023 at 12:51 PM <purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com> wrote:
Dear Sir/Madam,




Re: Enquiry No:EN230601080Bhiwadi Division

KHANDELWAL AGENCIES <khandelwal_agencies@yahoo.com>

Sat 10-Jun-23 13:41

To:sales@khandelwalagencies.net <sales@khandelwalagencies.net>;Bhiwadi Purchase <purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com>
Cc:JRM PURCHASE <jrmpur@jindalaluminium.com>

Dear Sir,

Greetings!

We thankfully acknowledge receipt of your valuable inquiry. As desired we are submitting the

consideration

sg PRODUCT | QTY | UOM | MAKE | LIST | LESS| NET | TOTAL
AC DRIVE

1 ACS560-5 3 NOS | ABB | 22700 | 0% | 22700 | 68100
AMP 3 HP

GST | 18% 12258

80358

TERMS AND CONDITIONS:

FREIGHT : EXTRA AS APPLICABLE
TAX : GST 18% extra as applicable

Discount : As mentioned

Insurance : In your scope; You have to Insure the consignment if required.

PAYMENT: WITH IN 30 DAYS

Validity of offer — Till the new list price will be announced by the company.

THANKS & REGARDS
MOHIT AGGARWAL
9875110194

offer for



Vashi Integrated Solutions Ltd.

Plot No 19, Sec 17/18, Dividing Road, Sheetla Lane, Gurgaon, Haryana -122001

z'?f Vashi GST No.: 06AAACV1496Q1ZQ, PAN: AAACV1496Q Sales Quotation
. » Quote No: Quote Date :
1370797/QTN 10/6/2023
Case No: | Quote Update :
02734311 10/6/2023
Name: Purchase team
Customer Details: Jindal Aluminium Limited, Contact No: 9611195368
SP-2/333, RICCO INDUSTRIAL AREA, . 1 . L
BHIWADI - 301019, RAJASTHAN INDIA Email ld: purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com
Customer Refere‘nce No.:[CAUTION: SUSPECT SENDER] Enquiry Payment Terms: Against Performa
No:EN230601080Bhiwadi Division Mode of Transport: By Road
Price Validity: 7 Days Frieght: To Pay
. " . Customer O/S.: INR 2,01,645.00
Sales Person: Alihlshak Sami Packing & Forwarding : Inclusive
Sales Person No: +91 8447206680

Dear Purchase team,
We thank you for your valuable enquiry. Our quote for your requirements is as below: For our full range of Products, Pyice L|s ﬁ eet, Test Certificate,
Technical Information, HSN Code, kindly Visit our WebSite http://vashiisl.com for Full Details.

Sr.No |HSNISAC Product Description Data | Delivery Period Quani’Q 1mﬁ/w/er Total (INR) | Line Total
Code Sheet ft (INR) (INR)
1 |8504.40.10 ABB Drives-ACS560 - ACS560- GTP 3-4 Months 3.00 | 19757.71 59,273 69,942.29
01-05A6-4 2.2KW 3HP 5.6AMP - Link | from order date.
2 |8537.10.00 ABB Drives-Accessories - ACS-BP-S- BASIC 3-4 Months 3.00 4,980.00 5,940 7,009.20
CONTROL PANEL Suitable for ACS380 ACS560 - fromayder date. ‘\r.\(_,

Total Before Tax: INR
65,213.13

b\ \(),\ Total Quote Amount: INR
% N 76,951.00

Amount in words (INR) Seventy Six Thousand\NineJHundred and Fifty One Rupees Only

Remark: NEFT / RTGS Instructions: )&)\\6
¥ .

RTGS in favour of Vashi Integrated Sé{ ited.
1.HSBC Bank A/c No. - 006235162001, | - HSBC0400002
2.HDFC Bank A/c No. - 50200050070484, IFSC - HDFC0000240

Oons

For live inventory tracking against your quote, Datasheets, Test Certificates and many other Industry First Digital Offerings, login to the Enterprise
Portal: https://enterprise.vashiisl.com

Terms & Conditions:

Our Return Policy is really simple:

1. The customer should verify the Product upon its receipt.

2. We assure you of free replacement or repairs in case of any defect in the performance of the standard products purchased from us within 30 days of receipt
of material at your end.

3. Our prices as mentioned in the offer are applicable for immediate delivery. In case of planned or future delivery, our principal list price as published on that
date will be applicable, however, the discount agreed will remain the same.

4. Kindly email our Customer Care team at customercare@vashiisl.com or call our Tollfree no - 1800266165

This is a computer generated document. No signature is Required

Page 1 of 1



