®1E50

RE: Enquiry No:'EN230601154'-'D5010'Bhiwadi Division

Dhara Agency <sales@dharaagency.com>
Wed 6/14/2023 6:13 PM

To:Bhiwadi Purchase <purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com>

Cc:Rajgopal C. Sarda <rajgopal@jindalaluminium.com>

U 2 attachments (549 KB)
TV-50-250.pdf; DA-Product Profile..pdf;

Dear sir,

We are pleased to submit our best offer as below.

:I‘erms & Conditions:

Sr. Description Qty Rate
1 Motorized Vickers cum Brinell Hardness Tester 01 Set 185,000/- v
Make: FINE 0
Model: TV-250 epatd PP
. . LD
Vickers 5,20,30 & 50, For Brinell 62.5,187.5 & 250 @
| 2 Motorized Vickers cum Brinell Hardness Tester 01 Set 199,000/-
? Make: FINE O%La/
Model: TV-250S ook
Vickers 1,5,20,30 & 50, For Brinell 62.5, 187.5 & 250 Q)poﬁm oy
AL ©

(%)

MY pop Bivod’

Price Terms: Quoted price is Ex-Warehouse, MIRA], basis. CU"lWM = /«—} chawy
P&F: NIL

TAX: GST@18% extra. kot
Freight & Insurance: Actual at your account. W HA C/Q .
Validity:30 days f; the date of quot

al_lty. ays r.om.e aeo.quoe - \9\ o 10
Delivery: Ex Stock ; Subject to prior sales. LIQETaws -

User Manual: Yes

Calibration Certificate: Yes _— ﬂ 3—@\/(0

Installation: 15000/-
Mode of Dispatch: thru transport
Payment Term: 100% advance along with order.

We trust our offer is in line with your requirements and we await your approval for the same.

Best Regards,

Bhavik Brahmani

DHARA AGENCY



6/16/23, 10:12 AM Mail - Bhiwadi Purchase - Outlook

'

Re: Enquiry No:'EN230601154'-'S1472'Bhiwadi Division

Shreea Sales <sales@shreea.co.in>
Thu 6/15/2023 10:17 AM
To:Bhiwadi Purchase <purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com>

Cc:shreea@vsnl.com <shreea@vsnl.com>;Rajgopal C. Sarda <rajgopal@jindalaluminium.com>

Dear Sir,

‘We regret to quote as Rajasthan is not in our scope
Thanks & Regards,

Shubha

SHREE ASSOCIATES

“Panchajanya", No.209, 4th Cross, 2nd Main, 12th Block,

Nagarbhavi 2nd Stage, Bangalore - 560072

Tel No. +91-80-23212230/+91-9980127913/+91-7892225429
Mail: sales@shreea.co.in

Web: http://www.shreea.co.in

On Thu, Jun 15, 2023 at 9:35 AM Bhiwadi Purchase <purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com>
wrote:
- Dear Sir,

Reminder..........
- Kindly attach the quotation.

From: purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com <purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com>
Sent: Wednesday, June 14, 2023 2:49 PM

| To: shreea@vsnl.com <shreea@vsnl.com>; sales@shreea.co.in <sales@shreea.co.in>

Cc: Bhiwadi Purchase <purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com>; Rajgopal C. Sarda
<rajgopal@jindalaluminium.com>

Subject: Enquiry No:'EN230601154'-'S1472'Bhiwadi Division

Dear Sir/Madam,

PLEASE QUOTE YOUR COMPETITIVE OFFER FOR THE ATTACHED ENQUIRY BY RETURN MAIL & KINDLY SEND
. YOUR ACKNOWLEDGEMENT MAIL ONCE YOU RECEIVED THE ENQUIRY FOR CONFIRMATION.

NOTE : FEEL FREE TO CONTACT US IF YOU ARE NOT GETTING ENQUIRY ATTACHMENT AS MENTIONED IN ITEM
DESCRIPTION.

ASST. MANAGER PURCHASE,
JINDAL ALUMINIUM LIMITED,
Bhiwadi division,
SP-2/333, INDUSTRIAL AREA,
BHIWADI - 301019,
' ALWAR DIST,( RAJASTHAN )
- GST No. 08AAACJ4324M1ZH
https://outlook.office 365.com/mail/id/AAQKADg2MmQyMzU2LTVIZTgtNDI3Zi1hOTQWLTM5YmMxODBmMZWFmOAAQAI20K TsWit5AHjOW%2Fxl...  1/2



6/16/23, 10:10 AM Mail - Bhiwadi Purchase - Outlook

Re: FW: Enquiry No:'EN230601154'-'F0193'Bhiwadi Division

Jaydeep Sambare <mrk1@fietest.com>
Thu 6/15/2023 10:40 AM

To:Bhiwadi Purchase <purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com>

Camrk@fietest.com <mrk@fietest.com>;Rajgopal C. Sarda <rajgopal@jindalaluminium.com>; Pratibha S
<mrk2 @fietest.com>

Dear Sir,

| regret to inform you that VICKERS CUM BRINELL HARDNESS TESTING MACHINE model is on
hold for sale due to upgradation activities.

It will take 4 to 6 moths to relaunch the product.

For despaich status inquiry - Mr. Vijay - 9850065061 - sales@fietest.com
For spares inquiry - Mr. Dhananjay - 9850065980 - sales1@fietest.com

Kind Regards,

i Jaydeep Sambare
{ Sales Manager
. | email mrkl@fietest.com

| “mobile +919309072719

{ Fuel Instruments & Engineers Pvt Ltd
{ Plot 68 to 89, Parvati Industrial estate, Yadrav,
i Kolhapur, MH, 416145, India

E |- LinkedIn (Company) [ General (Enter full link)
On 15-06-2023 09:46 am, mrk@fietest.com wrote:

----- Original Message-----

From: purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com

Sent: Wednesday, June 14, 2023 2:48pm

To: milind@fuelinstrument.com, milind@fuelins.mail.ord1d

Cc: purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com, rajgopal@jindalaluminium.com
Subject: Enquiry No:'EN230601154'-'F0193'Bhiwadi Division

Dear Sir/Madam,

PLEASE QUOTE YOUR COMPETITIVE OFFER FOR THE ATTACHED ENQUIRY BY RETURN
MAIL & KINDLY SEND YOUR ACKNOWLEDGEMENT MAIL ONCE YOU RECEIVED THE
ENQUIRY FOR CONFIRMATION.

NOTE : FEEL FREE TO CONTACT US IF YOU ARE NOT GETTING ENQUIRY ATTACHMENT AS
MENTIONED IN ITEM DESCRIPTION.

ASST. MANAGER PURCHASE,
JINDAL ALUMINIUM LIMITED,
Bhiwadi division,

SP-2/333, INDUSTRIAL AREA,
BHIWADI - 301019,

ALWAR DIST,( RAJASTHAN )
GST No. 08AAACJ4324M1ZH

https://outlook.office365.com/mail/id/AAQkADg2MmQyMzU2LTVIZTgtNDI3Zi1hOTQWLTM5YmMxODBmMZWFmOAAQAPkcnzodIApLgU2IFngnkh...  1/2



