Re: Enquiry No:EN230304011Bhiwadi Division
KAPIL KHANDELWAL <dhruv.bhiwadi@gmail.com>

Sat 3/4/2023 1:11 PM
To: Bhiwadi Purchase <purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com>

Cc: Rajgopal C. Sarda <rajgopal@jindalaluminium.com>

Dear sir,

Sfkj 1.13.5%150 Rs 1350/-
</5fkj 1.1%3.5%240 Rs 1400/~ ~
/57K 1.1%3.5%400 Rs 1750/-pcs— oA Ioem@"‘} '1@4 s
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GST extra

On Sat, 4 Mar 2023 at 12:53 PM, <purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com> wrote:

Dear Sir/Madam, P”A’Ke _ RA\{CH EM

PLEASE QUOTE YOUR COMPETITIVE OFFER FOR THE ATTACHED ENQUIRY BY RETURN MAIL &
KINDLY SEND YOUR ACKNOWLEDGEMENT MAIL ONCE YOU RECEIVED THE ENQUIRY FOR
CONFIRMATION.

NOTE : FEEL FREE TO CONTACT US IF YOU ARE NOT GETTING ENQUIRY ATTACHMENT AS
MENTIONED IN ITEM DESCRIPTION.

ASST. MANAGER PURCHASE,
JINDAL ALUMINIUM LIMITED,
Bhiwadi division,

SP-2/333, INDUSTRIAL AREA,
BHIWADI - 301019, 5
ALWAR DIST,( RAJASTHAN ) P&F HINCLL T
GST No. 08AAACJ4324M1ZH e

PH. NO. 9611195368 bl
Website : www jindalaluminium.com

THANK'S WITH REGARD'S

DELIVERY

KAPIL KHANDELWAL PAYMENT
TEL.01493-221272,220029

+91-9414012592, 9214315777 GCWCTC  +, -

DHRUV ELECTRICALS b e,
SHOP:-3,DHABA COMPLEX VALIDITY

BHIWADI-301019 Distt-Alwar (Raj.)
E-MAIL: dhruv.bhiwadi@gmail.com

{CHECKED BY ;

-u-—.-...‘w.,----. 7o

HAVELLS HAGER, HPL MSEAL NEPTUNE,POLYCAB CABLE
PIDILITE,SETIA PIPE,STEELGRIP TAPE



Re: Enquiry No:EN230304011Bhiwadi Division

BM Gupta <ankit_electricals@rediffmail.com>
Fri 3/3/2023 3:22 PM

To: Bhiwadi Purchase <purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com>

Dear sir g , )
Please find below price [

\/ Omm 3.5 core joint kit make Venus = list 5600 less 60% | C}; Fod b 3 ok <
4 ] Lu“hﬂ” ‘ %

Omm 3.5 core joint kit make Venus = list4250 less 60% « b

150mm 3.5core joint kit make Venus = list 2640 less 60% \ !
DISCOLUNT 40/@3(0"*’\}5“
REGARDS MAKL Venup — /
DEEPAK KHANDELWAL PRICE BASIS : FOR BHINAD!..... [0 IR L
9785914240, 9667200374
ANKIT ELECTRICALS P&F INCT o EXTRAwere

SHOP NO-A4 DHABA COMPLEX
RIICO IND AREA BHIWADI
MOBILE NO-9351135781

Sent from RediffmailNG on Android
\ N
Afden s cvpsran rh
WmR. DCEFCfH Bbov e '993102/,

From: purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com

Sent: Fri, 3 Mar 2023 15:12:26 GMT+0530

To: ankit_electricals@rediffmail.com

Subject: Enquiry l\;\o:EN23 304011Bhiwadi Division
e |£/V*-‘l

Dear Sir/Madam, / 3

PLEASE QUOTE YOUR COMPETITIVE OFFER FOR THE ATTACHED ENQUIRY BY RETURN MAIL &
KINDLY SEND YOUR ACKNOWLEDGEMENT MAIL ONCE YOU RECEIVED THE ENQUIRY FOR
CONFIRMATION.

NOTE : FEEL FREE TO CONTACT US IF YOU ARE NOT GETTING ENQUIRY ATTACHMENT A/%
MENTIONED IN ITEM DESCRIPTION. /4//50 14 /’M $’75 (LA D) A

~ N
ASST. MANAGER PURCHASE, iR mn Cl\b W 1‘37
JINDAL ALUMINIUM LIMITED, e
4o Riuwe Ve /2

Bhiwadi division,

BHIWADI - 301019, \ \ ol @-7Lfé]-7
| Jechin ¢

ALWAR DIST,( RAJASTHAN ) o ke ) 3 Ani ca / -

A
SP-2/333, INDUSTRIAL AREA, #CCOB—C’} ( ;
GST No. 08AAACJ4324M1ZH s
PH. NO. 9611195368 :
Website : www jindalaluminium.com v g [ e vews?
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Re: Enquiry No:EN230304011Bhiwadi Division

SHRIRAM SWITCHGEARS <shriramswitchgears.bhiwadi@gmail.com> \ w4 cu74'7
Sat 3/4/2023 2:20 PM lﬂoLO"l b ) P

: ™MS(VAM] &A1 &
To: Bhiwadi Purchase <purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com> ﬂ § e /_" r\q7
Cc: Rajgopal C. Sarda <rajgopal@jindalaluminium.com> A’é)d W PSqCG’ /
Dear Sir,

Please find rates as below :- pls ignore previous mail.

CHECK LIST

1« Raychem indoor - LT - straight joint kit
a.400 *3.5 = 6912 + gst perpc _—

\ A\
DISCOUNT - , el #’ I~/
M. 150 ¥3.5 = 4050 + gst per pc_- RO 1 NQVL/)HQQ ’

240 *3.5 = 4284 + gst per pc et ae. 2. - _
~ FEPEP RICE BASIS : FOR aHwaDL.... EO & T L

test certificate can be given alongwith.

Par INCLmmred EXTR A
Thanks & Regards

GSTAGST e Sl KK T g |
M.K.Gupta :

For Shriram Switchgears

A5 DEYN
Shop No 4, Santalka Shopping Complex, Santalka, e
Relaxo Chowk, Bhiwadi - 3071019. (Dist. Alwar) (Raj.)

e o Tl (o Aan (R PAYMENT JTM}*(%S

Our Geo Location :- https://goo.gl/maps/V5Tn2p9KCX8QYnLM7

BELIVERY

Click on Link to get Instant Quote GCWCAC ... IC ..... TR ‘
E-Mail :- ShriramSwitchgears.Bhiwadi@gmail.com VALY lb<bl€"'7{0’ 3
Mobile :- +91 - 9460055624, 9414019042 ]

Tel:- +91 - 1493 - 220777 CHECKED DY | e e .47 ﬁ

................................................................... S TR A e e e e e

PAN :- ADYFS 0304 C - (09/05/2019)

GST :- 08 ADYFS 0304 C 175 M le — /\)t‘}‘j CAQ‘H

MSME :- UDYAM-RJ-02-0028511 - (13/04/2022)

Our Product Range :-_

1. Kirloskar :- Inducion Motor , Monoblock Pumps , Fire Fighting pump , Jockey Pump ,

Sewage Pump etc..

2. L&T Switchgears :- ACB, MCCB, MCB , MPCB, Contactors , Distribution Board , Relays , Protection Device, Etc...
3. Philips :- Lighting & Luminaire. ,

4. (A) RR:-Lighting, Luminaire, Fans :- Ceiling , Wall , Exhaust , Pedestal Etc..

- (B) RR:- Wires & Cables - Armoured , UnArmoured , Multicore , Trirated , Etc..

ABB :- Induction Motors.

Siemens :- Induction Motors.

Crompton Greaves :- VCB -(Indoor / Outdoor ), Induction Motor, Crane Duty Motor, DC Motors Etc..
Premium :- Gears Box , Gear Motor Etc...

9. Acme :- Earthing Rod

10.0rient Electric Ltd. :- Lighting & Fixtures

11.Neptune :- Plug & Socket, Capacitors, Meters. Etc...

12.All Panel Accessories :- Lugs , Meter, Indicator, Rotary Switch etc...

oo N g La &

On Sat, Mar 4, 2023 at 12:09 PM SHRIRAM SWITCHGEARS <shriramswitchgears.bhiwadi@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Sir,

Raychem Make Indoor LT Joint Kit Straight

1.400%3.5 = 16320 / pc + gst
2. 150*3.5= 9565 / pc + gst
3.240%3.5 = 10115 / pc + gst



