Re: Offer for C rail EN230304005

Prakash Wadhwani <wadhwanipl@gmail.com>

Wed 3/15/2023 12:10 PM

To: Raman Sharma <raman@jindalaluminium.com>

Cc: Akash Kumar <akash.kumar@jindalaluminium.com>;vinay <vinay@socgroup.in>;mabel
<sales@socgroup.in>

Dear Sir,
Please consider FOR site and discount 7%

Thanks and regards,

P L Wadhwani

Mob: 09341229359
Kartik Consultants

B 503, SNS Arcade,

HAL Airport Road,
Bangalore 560017
08025228390/25221449

On Wed, 15 Mar 2023 at 11:14, Raman Sharma <raman@jindalaluminium.com> wrote:
Dear Sir,

Please confirm final price keeping all other terms as per our last order.Delivery to be made at
Bhiwadi Plant.

Warm Regards

Raman Sharma

Manager - Purchase

M: +91 8050-605-848 | L:+91 8027-735-051

www.JindalAluminium.com

From: Prakash Wadhwani <wadhwanipl@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, March 15, 2023 9:49 AM

To: Raman Sharma <raman@jindalaluminium.com>

Cc: Akash Kumar <akash.kumar@jindalaluminium.com>; vinay <vinay@socgroup.in>; mabel
<sales@socgroup.in>

Subject: Offer for C rail EN230304005

Dear sir,

Please find attached our offer and send Curved drawing along with PO.

Thanks and regards,
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