. RHIWAD
(T

Re: Fw: Reguest for a quote aghinst PR no~< EN230400320

Manoj Maheshwari MAHESHWARI WIRES PVT. LTD. <maheshwariwires@gmail.com>

Fri 28-Apr-23 17:14
To: JRM PURCHASE <jrmpur@jindalaluminium.com> -
Vs 2458 stod
’ \
"
CF e ve . Ihekit

Thanki i "C‘ R @ B/ v
i IS s Bes Pt

Ankit N. Sharma /L
MAHESHWARI WIRES PVT. LTD.

Address : 19 A & B, Mohkampur Industrial Area, Phase-1I, Rithani, Meerut, In%&ﬂﬁ%}iﬁ
E-mail : maheshwariwires@gmail.com

Website : www.maheshwariwires.com 7 23?/0“0 2&%
Contact : 0121-2534611/2511992 —
Mobile : +91 9837053329, +91 7088717776, +91 9837002076

Dear Sir,

As per your query, our best rate will bé

+GST 18%

GSTIN : 09AADCM0032G12X

Our Bankers: State Bank of India
Branch - SME Ganga Plaza - Meerut, India.
A/C -37484356474, IFSC SBIN0004183

On Fri, Apr 28, 2023 at 5:05PM JRM PURCHASE <jrmpur@jindalaluminium.com> wrote:
Dear sir,

Regards,

Arvind

Purchase Assaciate

M +91 999-6362-260 JINDAL ALUMINIUM
LIMITED,

E: -jrmpur® jindalaluminium.com Bhiwadi division,

SP-2/333, INDUSTRIAL AREA,
BHIWADI - 301019,
ALWAR DIST,( RATASTHAN )

2018 Natwong! Awands Tor Exvnert © s olipnre BE00 00,

www. JindalAluminium.com




Re: Request for-a-quote against PR-no---EN230400320

Riya Electrodes Pvt Ltd <riyaelectrodes.ceo@gmail.com>
Sat 29-Apr-23 09:21

To: JRM PURCHASE <jrmpur@jindalaluminium.com>
Cc:Riya Electrodes Pvt.Ltd., Faridabad <riyaelectrodes.faridabad@gmail.com>

Dear Sir,
Thanks for the inquiry.

We are pleased to make an offer as hereunder;

Description Price/Unit (Rs.)

Accucut Soft Brass Wire Dia 0.25 mm (3 Kgs/Spool) 890/Kg

Terms & conditions: VO\ \Y ol st {1 ﬂ/ig/ﬂ "'f‘

1. Price quoted is ex-our works Faridabad. GST extra on cost & Freight @ 18%.

2. Delivery: Ex-stock, subject to prior sales. ’\Olﬂl/‘m

3. Payment: Within 30 days from the invoice date.

Validity: 30 d l’”«g \f'\\)\ -
4. Validity: 30 days. Q(\ )10\& q/\f)j

We hope you will find the offer competitive & favour us with your valued orders.

Kindly let us know if you have any query about the above.

‘We are looking forward to hearing fromyousoon. .. ° /

— —— e —

—

Best Regards,

Devesh Goyal

On Fri, 28 Apr 2023 at 17:04, JRM PURCHASE <jrmpur@jindalaluminium.com> wrote:
Dear sir,

Please send your valuable quote for below material descriptions:-

Regards,

Arvind

Purchase Associate

M: +91 999-6362-260 JINDAL ALUMINIUM
LIMITED,

£: -jrmpur@jindalaluminium,com Bhiwadi division,

SP-2/333, INDUSTRIAL AREA,
BHIWADI - 301019,
ALWAR DIST,( RATJASTHAN )



RE: Request.for.a.quote.against-PR-1o-:-EN230400320 / -

| — —
sachin <palakenterprises1719@gmail.com> ﬂ
Fri 28-Apr-23 19:48 S\ o
To: JRM PURCHASE <jrmpur@jindalaluminium.com> hd S /J’"W
Dear sir g
Received your mail and we have send our best price. Y\
15pool 3.5 kg @ 2520 and GST extra P .

' \\\}"’ (5 A‘
Sent from Mail for Windows X 0
L AN
From: JRM PURCHASE /\ W
Sent: 28 April 2023 17:06 @ \W

To: palakenterprises1719@gmail.com v,/k . |

Subject: Fw: Request for a quote against PR no :- EN230400320 % o\ \A)o
4

Dear sir,

Please send your valuable quote for below material descriptions:-

Regards,

Arvind

Burchase Assosiate

M =91 §99-6362-260 JINDAL ALUMINIUM
LIMITED,
E: -jrmpur@jindalaluminium.com Bhiwadi division,

SP-2/333, INDUSTRIAL
AREA,

BHIWADI - 301019,
ALWAR DIST,(
RAJASTHAN )

2018  National Awards for Export Bx

www indalAluminium.com




