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GSTIN : 08AEBPA525331ZQ
' . Sale on/ PERFORMA INVOICE

JAY AMBAY ENTERPRISES

S1-74 , NEAR RELAXO CHOWK , SANTHALKA SHOPPING COMPLEX

BHIWADI - 301019 DT. - ALWAR (RAl.)
Tel. : 9314090500,06375775351 Fax : 8239490490 email : jayambay1975@gmail.com

Party Details : Quotation No.  : G/83/2023-24
JINDAL ALUMINIUM LIMITED Dated : 28/04/2023
SP-2/333, RIICO INDUSTRIAL AREA, BHIWADI
Rajasthan, 301019

GSTIN / UIN . 08AAACI4324M1ZH
S.N, | Description of Goods HSN/SAC Qty.|Unit List Price | Discount Price] Amount( )
Code
1, | DS255SR61-A 1/4X5/2X220V SINGLE SOL.VAL 84818050 1.00|Nos 1,509.00{23.50 % 1,154.38 1,154.38
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1,154.38
d : ﬁng @ 9.00% 103.89
dd HSEST @ 9.00% 103.89
(/ Grand Total ° 1,362.16

HSN/SAC Tax Rate Taxable Amt. CGST Amt. SGST Amt. Total Tax
84818050 18% 1,154.38 103.89 103.89 207.78

RupeesOne Thousand Three Hundred Sixty Two and Paisa Sixteen Only

Declaration
Yes bank a/c 003484600000584 IFSC CODE YESB0O000034

Bank Details: YES BANK A/C 003484600000584 IFSC YESB0000034

Terms & Conditions Receiver's Signature

1. PAYMENT TERMS-- AGAINST PERFORMA INVOICE
2. QUOTATION WILL BE VALID ONLY FOR 30 DAYS.

For JAY AMBAY ENTERPRISES

Authorised Signatory




M/s. PROCESS VALVES & FITTINGS
#193, C2-C3 Sanjay Tower, S.C. Road, Netkalappa Circle,
Basavangudi, Bangaluru-04, Tel : 08026609544, 26620651,

E-mail; nageshnaikpyft@gmail.com,pvft@rediffmail.com

To,
M/s. Jin

QUOTATION

dal Aluminum Limited,

Bhiwadi division,
SP-2/333, Indl area, Bhiwadi- 301019

Kind Att

Dear Sir,

n: Mr. Arvind (Purchase Ass)

PVFT/QTN/050/23-24

Date: 04.05.2023

We thank you very much for your enquiry and are pleased to quote our best price
for the below mentioned items for your kind consideration. Janatics Make.

SI.No Descriptions Qty | Unit's [ Unit/Price HSN CODE
1/4 -5/2,220V AC Single Sol. sp. return 84818050
1. valve DS2555R61-A 05 No's 1801.00

Terms & Conditions

NO : 29ADHPN6794L1ZL.
Fright charges extfa @Actual

A special discoun@ applicable on the above prices.

1. GST Tax : @ 18 % Extra.

2. Delivery : Ex-stock

3. Payment : 100% against Proforma invoice.
4. GST

5.

6.
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Thanking you and expecting your valuable order at the earliest. Assuring you %; %Pest

services

With reg

at all times.

ards

For PROCESS VALVES & FITTINGS

Nagesh Nayak.
(Chief Executive)
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Fwd: Request for a quote against PR no :- EN230400319 ( BHIWADI UNIT )

Janati¢s_del@janatics.co.in <janatics_del@janatics.co.in>
Thu 04-May-2311:28

To: JRM PURCHASE <jrmpur@jindalaluminium.com>

Cc: janatics_blr@janatics.co.in <janatics_blr@janatics.co.in>

[l_]J 1 attachments (10 KB)
83 - JINDAL ALUMINIUM pdf:

Dear Sir
Pl find the attachment.
We have already shared the quotation on 28.4.23 thru our dealer M/s Jay Ambay Enterprises.

Feel free to contact undersigned for any queries

Regards
Neena
9636279896

From: "Sadhana EO" <janatics_bhiwadi@janatics.co.in>

To: "janatics_del" <janatics_del@janatics.co.in>

Cc: "banke" <banke@janatics.co.in>

Sent: Tuesday, May 2, 2023 5:14:46 PM

Subject: Re: Request for a quote against PR no :- EN230400319 ( BHIWADI UNIT)

Dear Neena Madam,
For the below enquiry quotation send through dealer M/s Jay Ambay amounting approx Rs.7000/-

Regards,
Sadhana
01493-619577, 7297914177, 9636279896, 9358589177
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JENA IS INDIA T A
Marketing Office Address
S-218, 2nd Floor, Sukham Tower,
Opp M. P. School,

Bhiwadi - 301019
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From: "janatics_del" <janatics_del@janatics.co.in>

To: "Janatics_bhiwadi" <janatics_bhiwadi@janatics.co.in>

Cc: "banke" <banke@janatics.co.in>

Sent: Tuesday, May 2, 2023 2:19:20 PM

Subject: Fwd: Request for a quote against PR no :- EN230400319 ( BHIWADI UNIT )

Dear Sadhana
P! find the below mail.

Regards
Neena

From: "janatics blr" <janatics_blr@janatics.co.in>

To: "janatics_del" <janatics_del@janatics.co.in>

Sent: Tuesday, May 2, 2023 2:17:47 PM

Subject: Fwd: Request for a quote against PR no :- EN230400319 ( BHIWADI UNIT )



