71 1LY A-D
KUDAMM CORPORATION St okl

Address : Y-25 Okhla Industrial Area Phase-2, Opp. Okhla Metro Station New Delhi-110020
Phone No. : 8448448910, 9999002900 | E-mail enquiry@kudammecorp.in
Website : www.kudammcorp.com | GSTIN:07AAAFK3557G1ZG

Quotation No. - Ash-728/14296060523 -
Quotation Date : 06/05/2023 11:57:45 A Q u otat I o n
Customer Reference No - EN230500453

Customer Reference date . 06/05/2023
Project Name :

Bill To

JINDAL ALUMINIUM LIMITED(bhiwadi division)

SP-2/333, RICCO INDUSTRIAL AREA,, BHIWADI, ALWAR-301019 , BHIWADI [ "b
Contact Person :

Contact Person Number : 9611195368, 9057407027 \ >
Contact Person Email : purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com [S
Additional Contact Email :

S.N [Item & Description HSN/SAC Mt) Rate Amount

1 ACS 355-03E-15A6-4 8504 2 /3375(00 69,000.00
7.5KW,ABB Make Sensorless vector AC Drive Module, e
Input Volt. 380-480V (£10%) with Integrated Brake
Chopper and PLC

\ L
)'\" e Sub Total 69,000.00
Notes; _; ‘,./"‘ .
/{JL Total Discount 0.00
Pt i Words < “V Sub Total 69,000.00
Eighty One Thousand Four Hundred And Twenty Rupees Only t“ "—9 (e Other Charges 0.00
/ﬂ GST 12,420.00
Bank Detals te -~ Total Rs. 81.420.00
_ g
Account Holder Name KUDAMM CORPORATION , \ "@VJ
Account No 0390261001755 y’m
Bank Name CANARA BANK \u .
Branch NEHRU PLACE, NEW DELHI. (0390) M
IFSC/RTGS CODE NO. CNRBO0000390 3 4
SWIFT CODE CNRBINBBDXN
Terms & Conditions —
1. Delivery Ex-stock l \ \-5
2. Freight Extra
3. Payment 100% Against P|
4. Warranty One year against any manufacturing defect for the product from the date of sale. If any service Engr visit is
required, it will be charged extra
Asha gupta

Engineer Services (Automation)
9899062500
asha.gupta@kudammcorp.in




Re: Enquiry No:EN230500453Bhiwadi Division

Kalpana Waghulde <kalpana.w@eastrocontrol.coms
Mon 08-May-23 17:15

To: JRM PURCHASE <jrmpur@jindalaluminium.com>

Thanks & B@st Regards,

Kalpana Waghulde | Sales Executive ner+91- 253 - 2970660 , 8600300184

\CAM

Eastro Control System Pvt Ltd ¢
Description: Description: NewLogo_
www.eastrocontrol.com | kalpana.w@eastrocontrol.com /g -W
Head Office: H145/1, MIDC, Ambad, Nashik-422010 | Phone +91 253 2380145, 2970660 el LI
2
Pune Office: G-705, Aishwaryam Society, Near Khandoba Mandir Chouk, Akurdi, Pune-411019 | 400300147 e a.‘v’

(,~j Mi
From: JRM PURCHASE <jrmpur@jindalaluminium.coms ¥ u
Sent: Monday, May 8, 2023 5:14 PM
To: Kalpana Waghulde <kalpana.w@eastrocontrol.com>

Subject: Re: Enquiry No:EN230500453Bhiwadi Division —
yls

Dear Madam,

Price not seen clearly , please send once again

Warm Regards
JRM PURCHASE
11:9996362260 | L@ +918027-735-051 (319)

www.JindalAluminium.com

From: Kalpana Waghulde <kalpana.w@eastrocontrol.com>
Sent: Monday, May 8, 2023 17:13

To: JRM PURCHASE <jrmpur@jindalaluminium.com>
Subject: Re: Enquiry No:EN230500453Bhiwadi Division

Dear Sir,



Vashi Integrated Solutions Ltd.

Plot No 19, Sec 17/18, Dividing Road, Sheetla Lane, Gurgaon, Haryana -122001

GST No.: 06AAACV1496Q12Q, PAN: AAACV1496Q Sales Quotation
L
Quote No : Quote Date :
1308665/QTN 6/5/2023
Case No : Quote Update :
02661595 6/5/2023
Name: Purchase team
Customer Details: Jindal Aluminium Limited, Contact No:
SP-2/333, RICCO INDUSTRIAL AREA, . HplINaa68
BHIWADI - 301019, RAJASTHAN INDIA Email 1d: purchase bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com
Customer Reference No.:[CAUTION: SUSPECT SENDER] Enquiry Payment Terms: Against Performa
No:EN230500453Bhiwadi Division Mode of Transport: By Road
Price Validity: 7 Days Frieght: To Pay
Sales Person: Abhishak Saini Cust9mer 0/S.: . INR 66.359.00
Packing & Forwarding : Inclusive
Sales Person No: +91 8447206680

Dear Purchase team,
We thank you for your valuable enquiry. Our quote for your requirements is as below: For our full range of Products, Price List, Data Sheet, Test Certificate,
Technical Information, HSN Code, kindly Visit our WebSite http://vashiisl.com for Full Details.

Sr. No |HSN/SAC Product Description Data Delivery Period Quantity Rate Per Total (INR) Line Total
‘| Code Sheet Unit (INR) (INR)
1 8504.40.10 ABB - ACS355-03E-15A6-4-3 -Phase GTP Ex Stock 2.00 36,780.00 73.560 86,800.80
Drive 7.50KW/10.00HP 15.6 Ampere - Link
2 8504.90.90 ABB - ACS-CP-C MICRODRIVE Suitable for ACS355 - Ex Stock = 2.00 1,980.00 3.960 4,672.80
}" VH‘) Total Before Tax: INR
’ V/,\ 77,520.00
V Total Quote Amount: INR
5 ) W a 91,474.00

Amount in words: (IW),Niﬁ&%ne Thousand Four Hundred and Seventy Four Rupees Only

Remark:

NEF:Fﬂ!/iTGS |nit/rbc.,w§§‘;" \A}*’

RTGS in favnlur of Vashi Integré\ted Solutions Limited.
1.HSBC Bank A/c NoA:006235162001, IFSC - HSBC0400002
2.HDFC Bang 0.- 2000500704q84, IFSC - HDFC0000240

-

For live inventory tracking against your quote, Datasheets, Test Certificates and many other InduS)try First Digital Offerings, login to the Enterprise
Portal: https://enterprise.vashiisl.com

Terms & Conditions:

Our Return Policy is really simple:
1. The customer should verify the Product upon its receipt. “
2. We assure you of free replacement or repairs in case of any defect in the performance of fhe
of material at your end.

3. Our prices as mentioned in the offer are applicable for immediate delivery. In casc of planned or future delivery, our principal list price as published on that
date will be applicable, however, the discount agreed will remain the same.

4. Kindly email our Customer Care team at customercare@vashiisl.com or call our Tollfree no - 1800266165

ard products purchased from us within 30 days of receipl

This is a computer generated document. No signature is Required
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AP+
Re: Enquiry No:EN230500453Bhiwadi Division

sales shrirangsales.in <sales@shrirangsales.in>
Fri 05-May-23 15:59
To: Bhiwadi Purchase <purchase bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com>

Cc: JRM PURCHASE <jrmpur@jindalaluminium.com>;sales shrirangsales.in <sales@shrirangsales.in>;SSC
ABB drive <vfd@shrirangsales.in>

Dear Sir,

As per your valuable inquiry , please find the below mentioned ABB Make VFD Price

Unit price { 32000/-
Delivery : Ex-stoCk prior to

oo _L,
/V peie

ACS355-03E-15A6-4 + ACS-CP-C DISPLAY
Rating : 10 P:ﬁ KW Normal duty
: 0

Terms & Condition:

}-o
Price basis : For Sachin }’u W

. GST 18% EXTRA _; tyr\ =

o Payment : 100% advance against proforma invoice /F\.J/ ‘J/,‘

« Freight: Extra at actual !\’__,.?‘
Feel free to write to us if you have any query /f‘*

Waiting for your valuable order.
Thanks & Regards

Amita Varma \,__p s"),

9824477304

Shrirang Sales Corporation
(CRISIL SE-1A Rated, Since 2010) ~
K
U'G-3&e Nirman Bhavan. /
Nr. Krusht Mangal Hall,
Majura Gate, Ring Road.
Surat - 395002,
Feler - 91 261 247 1325
Fax: = 01 261 247 4034

FEmail: vid@shrirangsales.in_ surata shrivapgsales.com

Website: wavw shrranosales.com

On Fri, May 5, 2023 at 3:26 PM <purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com> wrote:




1509001 : 2015
Certified By
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QUOTATION

PIMA CONTROLS PVT LTD

— P-NO-446/447, ROAD NO-17 NEAR RADHA SWAMI, SATSANG BHAVAN,
AKHEDA DUNGAR, VKI AREA,
Jaipur-302013, Rajasthan
GSTIN: 08AAACP9160F1ZE

QUO NO. SQJT/24/0107 DATE: 08-05-202!
TO,
JINDAL ALUMINIUM LIMITED SUBJECT: YOUR REQUIREMENT OF AB MAKE DRIVES

SP-2/333, RIICO INDUSTRIAL AREA

BHIWADI-301019 DIST ALWAR REF. BY MAIL ON DATED 04-05-2023

ALWAR, 301019

KIND ATTN:- M:9611195368

EMAIL ID:  purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com

We acknowledge with thanks receipt of your above mentioned enquiry and are pleased to submit herewith our quotation as per the following for your kind

consideration

Sr. No. |Cat. No. Description HSN/SAC [GST % |aty. Linit P('l'q‘;e) Total P(rl'{;
POWERFLEX 523 AC DRIVE, 480 VAC, 3 PHASE. 10 FiP,
1 25AD017N104 L2 ORMAL WW HEAVY DUTY, 85044000 | 18 2PCS| 48,160.56| 96,321
e Sub Total| 96,321,
o 7
] - (&"/ Total:

U W _“,(/g/_\
Please Note:- Q{‘

1 In event of an order, the same _canriot be changed or cancelled.

2. We have considered supply of only loose hardware. Any type of support services would be charged extra.

3. "We have taken every effort for proper selection of manufacturer's catalogue number/part number/item "code of the quoted item, which
are based on the inputs provided by you. However please cross verify the" manufacturer's part number of each item prior to placing the
purchase order. Orders are executed based"" on manufacturer part numbers and the corresponding description will be used for

indicative purpose only."
Commercial Terms and Cor})eh”t’ions :
DELIVERY : Available at RA within 1 week from the date of your Order.
DESP MODE : By Road

FREIGHT : Extra at actual

GST : GST will be charged extra as applicable at the time of Invoice as per Government
INSURANCE : To your account

PAYMENT TERMS : 100% along with 100% taxes & duties against Proforma Invoice.
PRICE BASE : FOR PIMA Warehouse

VALIDITY : Till 25-05-2023

WARRANTY : One year from the date of our invoice against manufacturing defects only

In case you need any further clarifications, please feel free to contact us. .

Order acceptance based on this offer is subject to our written acceptance and confirmation of same.

We trust the above is as per your requirement and look forward to the pleasure of receiving your valued order.
Thanking you and assuring you of our best and prompt services at all times.

Yours faithfully,
For Pima Controls Pvt. Ltd.

NANDLAL FULRE
SALES ENGINEER
M. No. 9549897789

Sumit Verma

96,321.



Dear Sir,
We thank you for choosing Tangent automation as your service provider for your automation requirements. With reference

+ to your email dated 04/05/2023, we are pleased to submit our best Techno-Commercial Offer for Supply of AB Make Power
flex 525 Series AC Drive as given below.

Price Summary:

Unit
Item | Product Description MAKE Qty UoM Discount Total Price
: Price
PowerFlex 525 AC Drive, with Embedded EtherNet/IP and
Safety, 480 VAC, 3 Phase, 17 Amps, 10 HP, 7.5 kW . .
1 ZEBH0TN T4 Normal Duty; 10 HP, 7.5 kW Heavy Duty, Frame C, IP20 e 2 No's #3078 1,311,558
NEMA / Open Type, Filter

Sub Total 1,51,558/-

GST Taxes Extra @18% As Applicable Extra

Commercial Terms & Conditions:

1. Prices: Prices are based Ex-works basis and Valid till 30.05.2023

2. Payment Terms
e 50% Advance along with the PO
s 50% against Proforma Invoice before Materials dispatch.

3. Taxes & Duties:

a) For Supply GST @ applicable rates against individual HSN codes shall be applicable extra.
b) For Service GST will be charged extra @ 18%

c) Freight & Forwarding Charges Extra @3% or Actuals.

4. The warranty will be 12 months from the date of supply of Materials

5. Delivery Period
° 18-24 Weeks from the date of receipt of technically and commercially clear Purchase order along with the advance
payment.

o Timely issuance of road permit and other commercial documents such as exemption certificates if any will be a
prerequisite for the adherence to schedule

We hope you will find our offer in line with your expeclations. Expecling your valued P.O at the earliest.

Thank you,
Regards
B.S Manjunatha Yadav
7899955151
Page 20f2
Tangent Automation @ Allen-Bradley
“Authorized System Integrator of Rockwell Automation” e
Rockwell

#38, Ist Main, 3rd Cross, Malagala, Krishnanandanagar, New Outer Ring Road, Bangalore-56009 |
TeleFav-NRNIITRKRISR Email: fanoentantamatinnfiomail com (GRT Nas 20A AHETSHINFI7ZR



