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SAM Gas Projects (P) Ltd.
H.O. & WORKS :
’ SAM Gas E-30, Udyog Kunj, U.P.5.1.D.C. Industrial Area,
' Projects { Near Mehrauli Railway Station }

NH-24, Ghaziabad (U.P.) 201015, India

Phone  :+91-120- 640374143,
Dated : 12.05.2023 = Phone  :+91-120- 2761032

M/s JINDAL ALUMINUM LTD E-mail : samgasprojects@gmail.com

BHIWADI info@samgasindia.com
Web Site  : waww.psa-nitrogen.com

KIND ATIN ? MR. RAJ GOPAL
SUBJECT : EN230500582
Dear Sir,

This has reference to your mail dated 12.05.2023 for your above requirements. We are
pleased to quote our offer for the same as under:

S.N. DESCRIPTION QrTY. UNIT RATE
Z
01. | prOCESS OXYGEN / NITROGEN ANALYZER, 01 Set. {\(
MODEL-P860,0-30, MAKE- CHANGALI 96
ELECTRONIC SCIENCE & TECHNOLOGY CO. LD,
RANGE-1000 PPM-21.0 % O2/N2, POWER, 220 V \/\ YA
AC 50 HZ, FOR SAM GAS NITROGEN PLANT » R/\v‘ WA/
HSN Code-84059000 i \/b\u WL QA O\(
A v S
COMMERCIAL TERMS & CONDITIONS : b
v Prices : Ex our Works - Ghaziabad
v IGST : 18% shall be charged. ( HSN Code : 84059000 3\
v Payment Terms : 100% Against Performa Invoice prior to dispatcty
v Packing Charges Extra @ 2%
v Freight Charges : Extra at actual on To Pay Basis.
v Delivery : Ex Stock

We hope you will find our above proposal in line with your requirements. Accordingly,
we request / look forward to hear from you for further proceedings. Should you require

further any details / clarifications & confirmations, please do intimate us.

Thanking you and assuring you for our best services all the fimes.
For SAM GAS PROJECTS PLTD .

MRIDUL GUPTA
DIRECTOR
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.est for a quote against PR no :- EN230500582 ( BHIWADI UNIT)
NEERING Co <avsengineeringco@gmail.com>
Aay-23 18:07
M PURCHASE <jrmpur@jindalaluminium.com>

ear Mr. Arvind, e )

We have not used the china make Oxygen Analyser. We have the Indian make oxygen Analyser.the cost of Approximate basic
Price is 1.35/-Lac '/—19

Thanks with regards
Harendra Sharma

On Mon, May 15, 2023 at 5:08 PM JRM PURCHASE <jrmpur@jindalaluminium.com> wrote:
Reminder....1

From: JRM PURCHASE <jrmpur@jindalaluminium.com> Y‘/ IR
Sent: Friday, May 12, 2023 16:42 /

To: Avs ENGINEERING Co <avsengineeringco@gmail.com> %

Cc: Bhiwadi Purchase <purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com> /QWJ -

e

S

V|

Subject: Fw: Request for a quote against PR no :- EN230500582 ( BHIWADI UNIT)
Dear sir, /5/

Please send your valuable quote for below material descriptions:- 2,.0‘)'\

/)

AT

Regards, i
Arvind
Purchase Associate
M: +91 999.6362-260 JINDAL ALUMINIUM
LIMITED,
E: -jrmpur® jindalaluminium.com Bhiwadi division,

SP-2/333, INDUSTRIAL AREA,
BHIWADI - 301019,
ALWAR DIST,( RATASTHAN )

2018 - National Awards for Export Excellence, EEPC {Engineering Export Council of India)

www.JindalAluminium.com




