5/26/23, 9:19 AM Mail - purchase - Qutlook

RE: Enquiry No:EN230304284Bhiwadi Division Ce QA

alpesh@vijayhydrotech.com
Fri 31-Mar-23 3:18 PM

To: purchase <purchase@jindalaluminium.com>
Cc: Bhiwadi Purchase <purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com>;Rajgopal C. Sarda <rajgopal@jindalaluminium.com>

Dear Sir,

We are pleased to offer our best possible prices along with other terms and conditions against your
subject enquiry.

Dwccownt - 9y
1] Axial Piston pump : Rexroth make
A2F0O12/61R-VBB06 (%
Ko 20
Qty — 01 No. W‘NG\"“\ e
Rate @ 1,02,000/- Each

Delivery: Ex-Stock subject to priority sale. ol
HSN code : 84136090, ok D naas
ey G e
Terms and conditions : UDCQ@\UM ]
Delivery : Ex-Sfoc;k subject to priority sale. e‘ﬁ ’&NC’U‘
Discount : 17% on-above prices. 4
Payment : 30 Days.
Taxes - 18% GST Extra as Applicable. 9e b
P.&F. - Nil.
Freight : To pay.
Validity : 30 Days.
L.D. Clause : Not Applicable. ‘
Insurance - In your scope. You are requested to arrange proper insurance to claim transit
damage if any occur during transportation. ;
Warranty : 6 months against any manufacturing defect. In case of any problem product is to { be

sent to manufacturer through us. No warranty shall be entertained for failure due to
mis-handling , mis-alignment , oil contamination & cavitations.

Thanking You,
Yours faithfully,

Alpesh Gajjar.

M/S. VIJAY HYDRO-TECH
L-180,G.I.D.C.

B/H Water Tank,Odhav,
Ahmedabad-382415.

Phone: 079-22871506,22892294.
Mobile No. :+ 91 9212229942.

From: purchase <purchase@jindalaluminium.com>
Sent: Thursday, March 30, 2023 3:04 PM

To: alpesh@vijayhydrotech.com

Subject: Fw: Enquiry No:EN230304284Bhiwadi Division

https://outiook.office.com/maillid/AAMKAGZINIIZJBmLWQ1NTCtNDg5Yy 1iZjk5LTNINmFmNzg3MjVhMgBGAAAAAADY r5WiXYw1SY0sBQuUf6y9yB .



5/26/23, 9:19 AM Mail - purchase - Outlook
Dear Sir/Madam,

PLEASE QUOTE YOUR COMPETITIVE OFFER FOR THE ATTACHED ENQUIRY BY RETURN MAIL
& KINDLY SEND YOUR ACKNOWLEDGEMENT MAIL ONCE YOU RECEIVED THE ENQUIRY FOR
CONFIRMATION.

NOTE : FEEL FREE TO CONTACT US IF YOU ARE NOT GETTING ENQUIRY ATTACHMENT AS
MENTIONED IN ITEM DESCRIPTION.

ASST. MANAGER PURCHASE,

JINDAL ALUMINIUM LIMITED,
Bhiwadi division,

SP-2/333, INDUSTRIAL AREA,
BHIWADI - 301015,

ALWAR DIST,( RAJASTHAN )

GST No. 08AAACJ4324M1ZH

PH. NO. 9611195368

Website : www.jindalaluminium.com

https://outlook.office.com/mail/id/AAMKAGZINjIIZBmLWQ1NTctNDg5 Yy 1iZjkSLTNINmFmNzg3MjVhMgBGAAAAAADY r5WjXYw1SY0sBQufby9yB. . 2/2



5/25/23, 5:54 PM Mail - purchase - Outlook

Re: Enquiry No:'EN230500786'-'A1822'Bhiwadi Division

Adsar Hydro Controls <jaipur@adsar.in>
Thu 25-May-23 5:51 PM

To: Bhiwadi Purchase <purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com>
Cc: Rajgopal C. Sarda <rajgopal@jindalaluminium.com>;purchase <purchase@jindalaluminium.com>;Adsar Hydro Controls
<jaipur@adsar.in>

Respected Sir,

We acknowledge with thanks the receipt of your said RFQ. We are pleased to submit our most competitive
offer along with other terms & conditions as below: Hope you shall find the offer inline with your
requirement. Please feel free to get in touch with us for any further clarification. Look forward to receive
your valuable purchase order.

Model Description: Axial Piston Pump A2FO 16 /61R-VBB06-S

Price: INR 98,000.00 Each
General Terms and Conditions of Supply

1) Discount : Net Discounted

4

2) Delivery . Ex-Stock
3) Price Basis : Ex-Our Works Jaipur
4) P&F : NIL
5) GST RATE . Extra @ 18% Extra /
Discosrsed  HEH
6) Freight . Extra as actual _
N - o o
7) Payment : 100% within 15 days @Q}ﬂ/wé\() 3
hoceof
d wQQ_/ 4
8) Validity : Up to 30 days of offer date F()@ B
9)  GSTIN NO : 0BADUPC4659A1Zi e« 8 et

Order Once placed cannot be Cancelled.
| Jo s

Please check the suitability of Offered Products Before Ordering
Hope you shall find the offer inline with your requirement.

https://outlook.office365.com/mail/inbox/id/ AAMKAGZINjIZjBmLWQ1NTctNDg5 Yy 1iZik5SLTNINmFmNzg3MjVhMgBGAAAAAADY 5 WjXYW1SY0sB...  1/2



5/25/23, 5:54 PM Mail - purchase - Outlook

Please feel free to get in touch with us for any further Clarifications.
Awaiting your Valuable Order.

Thanking you & Assuring you our best services.
Piyush Jain
8003397779

ADSAR HYDRO CONTROLS JAIPUR

On 25-05-2023 03:26 pm, purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com wrote:

Dear Sir/Madam,

PLEASE QUOTE YOUR COMPETITIVE OFFER FOR THE ATTACHED ENQUIRY BY RETURN MAIL & KINDLY SEND
YOUR ACKNOWLEDGEMENT MAIL ONCE YOU RECEIVED THE ENQUIRY FOR CONFIRMATION.

NOTE : FEEL FREE TO CONTACT US IF YOU ARE NOT GETTING ENQUIRY ATTACHMENT AS MENTIONED IN
ITEM DESCRIPTION.

ASST. MANAGER PURCHASE,

JINDAL ALUMINIUM LIMITED,

Bhiwadi division,

SP-2/333, INDUSTRIAL AREA,

BHIWADI - 301019,

ALWAR DIST,( RAJASTHAN )

GST No. 08AAACJ4324M1ZH ~
PH. NO. 9611195368

Website : www. jindalaluminium.com

https://outlook.office 365.com/mail/inbox/id/ AAMKAGZINJIZIBmLWQ1NTctNDg5 Yy 1iZjk 5LTNINmFmNzg3MjVhMgBGAAAAAAD Y r5WiXYw1SYO0sB...  2/2



5/25/23, 3:45 PM Mail - purchase - Outlook

A

RE: Enquiry No:'EN230500786'-'S1191'Bhiwadi Division

Shashi Dhawal Hydraulics |Delhi <shashidhawal.delhi@srpgroup.co.in>
Thu 25-May-23 3:43 PM

To: Bhiwadi Purchase <purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com>;delhi.accounts@srpgroup.co.in
<delhi.accounts@srpgroup.co.in> :
Cc: Rajgopal C. Sarda <rajgopal @jindalaluminium.com>;purchase <purchase@jindalaluminium.com>

Dear Sir,
We acknowledge with thanks for your enquiry, we are glad to enclose the following
quotation.
Sr.| Model Code Price Discount Availability
1 | A2FO-16/61R VB B06 97500.00 Net Price Excepted by Oct .
TERMS & CONDITIONS : - ,
= e,
Price Ex our store D s e A @
o) e 7
TAX (GST) 18% @& ® o) $ 1 , DG o
PAYMENT 30 Days
P&F Nil pord 39 A9y
Delivery As mentioned above Q@M
——
FREIGHT Paid o B9 1ol
Validity | 30days — 9
A Lol

Hope this will meet your requirement & favor us with your valued order.

Thanks and Regards

Looking forward en early reply

With Regards

Ruchi Shukla

Shashi Dhawal Hydraulics Pvt Ltd

2E,Caxton House Rani Jhansi Road,

Near Delhi Press Jhandewalan Ext.,New Delhi-110055

Ph: +91- 11 -23555556 / 23555557,43560600,43588799

Mob # 9560865656,8285213607

Email: shashidhawal.delhi@srpgroup.co.in

Registered under MSME, UAM NO. UDYAM-DL-01-0010723

VIEW OUR PRODUCT CATALOGUE
CUSTOMER FEEDBACK

https://outlook.office365.com/mail/inbox/id/AAMKAGZINJIZIBmLWQ1NTctNDg5Yy1iZjk 5LTNINmFmNzg3MjVhMgBGAAAAAAD Yr5WiXYw1SYO0sB...  1/2



5/25/23, 3:45 PM Mail - purchase - Outlook

Authorised Distributors for

{IKEN rexroth —Darker ! EPE KEiKs
wesn o JENISON " TOKEC
. ) /Sr.-‘.__\ rJ!.J.:: IN o 33 ) .
Smﬁz w 3, \:l’ , kociax I m:;?:e: LK h}

Sales Partner

From: purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com [mailto:purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com]
Sent: 25 May 2023 15:27

To: shashidhawal.delhi@srpgroup.co.in; delhi.accounts@srpgroup.co.in

Cc: purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com; rajgopal@jindalaluminium.com;
purchase@yjindalaluminium.com

Subject: Enquiry No:'EN230500786'-'S1191'Bhiwadi Division

Dear Sir/Madam,

PLEASE QUOTE YOUR COMPETITIVE OFFER FOR THE ATTACHED ENQUIRY BY RETURN MAIL & KINDLY
SEND YOUR ACKNOWLEDGEMENT MAIL ONCE YOU RECEIVED THE ENQUIRY FOR CONFIRMATION.

NOTE : FEEL FREE TO CONTACT US IF YOU ARE NOT GETTING ENQUIRY ATTACHMENT AS MENTIONED
IN ITEM DESCRIPTION.

ASST. MANAGER PURCHASE,
JINDAL ALUMINIUM LIMITED,
Bhiwadi division,

SP-2/333, INDUSTRIAL AREA,
BHIWADI - 301019,

ALWAR DIST,( RAJASTHAN )
GST No. 08AAACJ4324M1ZH

PH. NO. 9611195368

Website : www. jindalaluminium.com

https://outlook.office365.com/mail/inbox/id/AAMKAGZINJIZBmLWQ 1N TctNDg5 Yy 1iZjk SLTNINMFmNzg3MjVhMgBGAAAAAAD Yr5WiXYw1SY0sB...  2/2



EN230500786
S1191-SHASHI DHAWAL HYDRAULICS PVT.LTD.

-9560258585-8447294761
S1191-SHASHI DHAWAL HYDRAULICS PVT.LTD.-9987069996- 25-May-2023
V5074-VIJAY HYDRO TECH-9212229942-

A1822-ADSAR HYDRO CONTROLS-8003397777-2375513 T§JS§

01/06/2023

DI230500654 - 23-MAY-23

1 06450215 REXROTH MAKE AXIATL PISTON PUMP A-2
F016/61R-VBB06-S, MNR-R902018138,,

Note

1) YOU HAVE TO DELIVER THE MATERIAL AS PER YOUR COMMITTED DATE OF DELIVERY AT OUR WORKS FAILING
WHICH 2% PENALTY PER WEEK WILL BE DEPENDING UPON THE COMMODITY/ URGENCY OF THE
MATERIAL.HENCE, INDICAT DELIVERY PERIOD

2) 1IN CASE, YOU ARE NOT ABLE TO SUPPLY THE MATERIAL ON OR BEFORE THE DUE DATE WE ARE EMPOWERED
TO DIVERT / CANCEL OUR ORDER TO OTHER SUITABLE VENDOR AT THE PREVAILING RATE IN THE
MARKET.AND THE PRICE DIFFERENCE IF ANY WILL BE DEBITED TO YOUR ACCOUNT.

Please provide Service Tax/TIN Rigistration No./Certificate . We are releasing our payment
through bank hence provide the details of RTGS/NEFT/MICR/BANK ACCOUNT NO.

.00

NOs



