TY(Q 7

Sales Quotation

APCON APCON AUTOMATION INDIA PVT LTD

Plot No. A-348-349(N),RIICO Ind. Area,, Bhiwadi,Alwar(Raj.),301019
CIN : U74999R12022PTC081043
GSTIN : 0BAAWCAS8952E123

" Automation & Process Conlrol..

Tel. : 7230007712,7230007750 email : apconautomation@gmail.com

Party Details : Quotation No. : AAIPL/23-24/Q072
JINDAL ALUMINIUM LIMITED Dated : 26-05-2023
SP-2/333, INDUSTRIAL AREA,BHIWADI Payment Terms 30 Days
DIST,ALWAR,RAJASTHAN-301019 Delivery : 4-6 Weeks
Freight Nill
Gst Extra 18%
GSTIN / UIN : 08AAACI4324M1ZH Packing Nill
S.N | Description of Goods HSN/SAC Qty. |Unit Price Amount( )
Code
1. | E40S8-2000-3-T-24 (Rotary Encoder) 85432090 2.00|Pcs 6,678.00 13,356.00
Autonics Make
Delivery Time:1 Nos Within A Week
Rest 4-6 Weeks
A L
\(\’1
13,356.00
Add : CGST @ 9.00 % 1,202.04
Add : SGST @ 9.00 % 1,202.04
Less : Rounded Off (-) 0.08
Grand Total 2.00 Pcs 15,760.00
Tax Rate Taxable Amt.  CGST Amt.  SGST Amt. Total Tax o B
18% 13,356.00 1,202.04 1,202.04  2,404.08

Rupees Fifteen Thousand Seven Hundred Sixty Only

Bank Details :

AXIS BANK, A/C NO.-922020025742249, IFSC CODE-UTIB0000576

Terms & Conditions

1. Goods'once sold will not be taken back.

2. Interest @ 18% p.a. will be charged if the payment is

Is not made with in the stipulated time
3. Subject to Bhiwadi Jurisdiction only

Receiver's Signature

for APCON AUTOMATION INDIA PVT LT

Authorised Signatory




Re: Enquiry No:EN230500794Bhiwadi Division

Harshada - 09699397923 <applesensor@gmail.com>

Fri 26-May-23 16:26

To: Bhiwadi Purchase <purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com>
Cc: JRM PURCHASE <jrmpur@jindalaluminium.com>

DEAR SIR,

Vad
MODEL NO :- E40S8-2000-3-T-24 Y\lf‘/15
PRICE :-7042/- each
DEL:-READY STOCK (Sub to Unsold)

|
GST :- 18% S & g\JJL 7
FREIGHT EXTRA
PAYMENT ADVANCE )y\ VA(/

Offer Validity:- 15 days
TERMS & CONDITION
https://www.applesensor.com/terms

Please note: Please check the quoted model no., its specifications and suitability as per your apgli bsfore
placing the order. ’)}l

Thanks & Regards,
Harshada 9699397923 / 22

Click Here List of Our Sales Executive Numbers (as per brand handle)

( Industrial Equipment Supplier )

12 /13 Parth Building ! Ganesh Peth Lane i Near Plaza Theater { Dadar West { Mumbai- 400028 i India

For Sales Executive Contact No Click Here: hitps:i/www.applesenser.comibrand-supplier

applesensor@gmail.com ¢ https://www.applesensor.com

_ Many More

On Thu, May 25, 2023 at 5:55PM <purchase.bhiwadi@®jindalaluminium.com> wrote:
Dear Sir/Madam,

PLEASE QUOTE YOUR COMPETITIVE OFFER FOR THE ATTACHED ENQUIRY BY RETURN MAIL & KINDLY SEND YOUR ACKNOWLEDGEMENT MAIL
ONCE YOU RECEIVED THE ENQUIRY FOR CONFIRMATION,

NOTE : FEEL FREE TO CONTACT US IF YOU ARE NOT GETTING ENQUIRY ATTACHMENT AS MENTIONED IN ITEM DESCRIPTION.



RE: Enquiry No:EN230500794Bhiwadi Division

Sriadithya ks <sriadithya.ks@jayemtrade.in>
Thu 25-May-23 18:16

To: Bhiwadi Purchase <purchase bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com>
Cc:Ravi Kumar <sales@jayemtrade.in>;JRM PURCHASE <jrmpur@jindalaluminium.com>
Dear Sir,

We thank you for your enquiry,

With reference to your below mail, Kindly go through the below model, price and availability for Autonics Encoder for

your ref,

e Model: E40S8-2000-3-T-24

s Price: Rs. 7285/- each

e  Qty:2 nos

e GST18% extra :

° Delivery: 1 nos within a week another one 12 weeks

Awaiting your valuable PO for supply. ‘\

For any other clarifications revert back or contact undersigned
Best Regards,

Sri Adithya K.S

Ast.Manager

Jayem Trade Pvt Ltd.

Authorized Distributor For Autonics/HORA/GIC/P & 1/OMRON
"Logitech Park", Plot no 7, Road no 10

EPIP,Whitefield Bangalore - 560066

Phone: +91-080-41353568/500 | Mobile: +91-9164209367
Email: [mailto:sriadithya.ks@jayemtrade.in%?C]51'1’adithya.ks@jayemtrade.in| Mobile:
Fax: +91-80-41353556

HIB

Bevand Trading »s>» SP1,

From: Ravi Kumar <sales@jayemtrade.in>

Sent: Thursday, May 25, 2023 5:58 PM

To: Sriadithya ks <sriadithya.ks@jayemtrade.in>
Subject: FW: Enquiry No:EN230500794Bhiwadi Division

Thanks& Regards
Ravi

From: purchase bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com <purchase. bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com>
Sent: 25 May 2023 17:56

To: Ravi Kumar <sales@jayemtrade.in>; Sudhir Nathu <snathu@javemtrade.in>

Ce: irmpur@jindaialuminium.com

Subject: Enquiry No:EN230500794Bhiwadi Division

Dear SirYMadam,

+91-9035839367

PLEASE QUOTE YOUR COMPETITIVE OFFER FOR THE ATTACHED ENQUIRY BY RETURN MAIL & KINDLY SEND YOUR

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT MAIL ONCE YOU RECEIVED THE ENQUIRY FOR CONFIRMATION.

NOTE : FEEL FREE TO CONTACT US IF YOU ARE NOT GETTING ENQUIRY ATTACHMENT AS MENTIONED IN ITEM DESCRIPTION.

ASST. MANAGER PURCHASE,
JINDAL ALUMINIUM LIMITED.



As Authorised Distributors, we are pleased to submit our offer as follows:

www.intechohennai.com

Fpogeaes e it R i

S/N |Description ?Itg e EE:;:. Delivery CI;T:I?:Z{Je
Autonics Incremental Rotary Encoder,
40mm Outer Dia., 8mm Shaft Dia., .
2000P/R, A, B, Z Output Phase, Will >

1 Totempole Output, Suitable for 124 2 7,285.00”| confirm | & ;
24VDC Operation, Prewired with 2m shortly
cable - Duly Tested & Accessories Catalog 75
E40S8-2000-3-T-24

* The above is very Special Discounted Price

We are in touch with Factory for Delivery confirmation. We will revert back within a week. Please

bear with us till then.

HSN Code - 85371000 \ “ »\]\\{
/ 2\
GST No. 33AABCI0806J12Z ™ \ J
P&F : Extra @ 2% (or) Rs.150/- whichever is higher- Absorbed.

F&l . Extra @ 2% (or) Rs.150/- whichever is higher — Absorbed.
GST . Extra @ 18%

Payment : 100% within 30 days from the date of dispatch.

Validity : 30 days subject to confirmation at the time of ordering.
Delivery . As per above Table-subject to prior sale.

Guarantee - One Year as Provided by the Respective Brand



A1537-APPLE AUTOMATION AND SENSOR-2232993605-9699092002
A5130-APCON AUTOMATION-0-8233027024

D5034~DHRUV ELECTRICALS-9414012592-9214315777
10207-INTECH AUTOMATION PVT. LTD.-9845175951-8043534858 25-May-2023
J0291-JAYEM TRADE PRIVATE LIMITED-41353596-9980563987
52208-SR INDUS ELECTRO SYS PRIVATE

EN230500794

01/06/2023

LIMITED-9880699831-23462036

DI230500671 - 24-MAY-23
1 07981832 AUTONICS MAKE INCREMENTAL ROTARY ENCODER

MODEL E40S8-2000-3-T-24, 12-24VDC,AUTONICS

MAKE,
Note
1) YOU HAVE TO DELIVER THE MATERIAL AS PER YOUR COMMITTED DATE OF DELIVERY AT OUR WORKS FAILING
WHICH 2% PENALTY PER WEEK WILL BE DEPENDING UPON THE COMMODITY/ URGENCY OF THE
MATERIAL.HENCE, INDICAT DELIVERY PERIOD
2) 1IN CASE, YOU ARE NOT ABLE TO SUPPLY THE MATERIAL ON OR BEFORE THE DUE DATE WE ARE EMPOWERED
TO DIVERT / CANCEL OUR ORDER TO OTHER SUITABLE VENDOR AT THE PREVAILING RATE IN THE
MARKET.AND THE PRICE DIFFERENCE IF ANY WILL BE DEBITED TO YOUR ACCOUNT.

Please provide Service Tax/TIN Rigistration No./Certificate . We are releasing our payment
through bank hence provide the details of RTGS/NEFT/MICR/BANK ACCOUNT NO.

.00

NO



Jindal Aluminium Limited PURCHASE INDENT
Format : JAL/RMD/STO/F/04

Bhiwadi Division
BHIWADI - 301019

Indent No : DI230500671 Indent Date : 22-May-2023
P-TYPE - P2 Department : ELECTRICAL MAINTEN
Status :  PROCUREMENT Indent Type : DEPARTMENT
Please supply/procure the following materials REVENUE EXPENSE
Item Code pP- Justification = ------ QUANTITY ====== Expected Date/
S.No Description & Make Spl Description TYPE Stock SO To be Urgency/Brand/
on hand Purchased CMD Approved
1 06641806 P2 BP3,BP4 PRESS 0.00 NOS 1.00 27-May-2023
SCHNEIDER ELECTRIC MAKE AC DRIVE 1.5 COLD N N N
KW, TYPE NO-ATV320U15N4C. SAW/IMMEDIATE P00006201410 EXTURSION 6000.00
INPUT-380-500, 6.4 AMPS, 3 PH, USE PLANT/P3 PRESS REPAIR AND
OUTPUT-0..380-460 3 PH, 4.1 AMPS. MAINTENENC
207981832 P2 press cold 0.00 NOS 2.00 27-May-2023
AUTONICS MAKE INCREMENTAL ROTARY saw/IMMEDIATE N N N
ENCODER MODEL E40S8-2000-3-T-24, USE P00006201410 EXTURSION 10000.00
12-24VDC PLANT/ELEC. MAINTENANCE

Spcl Desc:AUTONICS MAKE

** If it is Urgent indicate accordingly
Indent by : SUDHANSHU GOYAL Approved By

Head of Dept : VIKRAM JEET

Store Manager's Remarks & Signature
Approximate Value 16000.00

25-May-2023 5:24:38PM Page 1 of 2



