. C
5/29/23, 3:16 PM Mail - purchase - Outlook &/ ()( & 2

Fw: Enquiry No:'EN230500610'-'S2919'Bhiwadi Division Bev® b ed/'

shreetechno999 <shreetechno999@rediffmail.com> Ruo %q{ y 09
Mon 29-May-23 3:14 PM

To: purchase <purchase@jindalaluminium.com>;Bhiwadi Purchase <purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com>

Dear Sir,

Please find herewith our Best Offer FOR (10 NOS QUANTITY Per Size )
1) Polyster Roller (180 DEG TEMP) Size ID 60 MM X OD 80 MM X 900 MM Lenght
Price - 2550/- per no

—e—

1) Polyster Roller (180 DEG TEMP) Size ID 60 MM X OD 80 MM X 700 MM Lenght

Price - 2350/- per no 50 (9N
i i ’./\QQLQ e e wont \ a -9 o

b U J 9
Terms & Condition i (Tlﬁ/cﬁﬂ
Tax: 18% GST Will BE EXTRA Dot by - A (DUH
PAYMENT: 100% ADVANCE AGAINST PURCHASE ORDER
TRANSPOTATION : TO PAY BASIS PAID BY YOU ( JINDAL ALUMINIUM)
DELIVERY : 30 TO 45 DAYS AFTER RECEIVED PURCHASE ORDER AND ADVANCE PAYMEN

L

Regards
DN MAKWANA
Shree Technolgy

Plot. No.837/1, Industrial Area, GIDC,Makarpura Vadodara.390010
Tel.+91 265 6560309 mail- shreetechno999@rediffmail.com
cell +91-9825164009 Web:- http://www.shreetechnology.in

Regards

Shree Technolgy -

Plot. No.837/1, Industrial Area, GIDC,Makarpura Vadodara.390010
Tel.+91 265 6560309 mail- shreetechno999 @rediffmail.com

cell +91-9727719199 Web:- http://www.shreetechnology.in

From: "shreetechno999" <shreetechno999@rediffmail.com>

Sent: Fri, 26 May 2023 13:22:00

To: "purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com" <purchase bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com>
Cc: "purchase@jindalaluminium.com"<purchase@jindalaluminium.com>

Subject: Re: Enquiry No:'EN230500610'-'S2919'Bhiwadi Division

Dear Sir,
Please find herewith our Best Offer

1) Polyster Roller (180 DEG TEMP) Size ID 60 MM X OD 80 MM X 900 MM Lenght
Price - 1450/- per no

httns //outlnok office com/mail/inbox/id/AAMKAGZINiIlIZIRml WO 1NTAtNDaAYv1i7ik5] TNINMmFmN7a2MiVhMaRGAAAAAADYriSWiXYw1SYNsROuf 112



51126123, 12:11 PM Mail - purchase - Outlook

" Re: Enquiry No:'EN230500610'-'A1396'Bhiwadi Division

Ashutosh Power TransBelts Ltd <aptbelts@gmail.com>
Fri 26-May-23 12:10 PM

To: Bhiwadi Purchase <purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com>
Cc: Rajgopal C. Sarda <rajgopal @jindalaluminium.com>;1111 shamita <shamita@reengusia.com>;purchase
<purchase@jindalaluminium.com>

Resend

On Thursday, May 25, 2023, Ashutosh Power TransBelts Ltd <aptbelts@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Sir

We are pleased to offer as under

APT INDUSTRIAL FELT SLEEVES

ID oD LENGTH TEMP. QUANTITY  PRICE PER PC
60MM 80MM 900MM 180°C ¢ 10 ¢ 2,250.00 —
60MM 80MM 900MM 280°C 10 4,880.00
60MM 80MM 900MM 450°C 10 7,850.00
60MM 80MM 900MM 600°C 10 24,400.00
60MM 80MM 700MM 180°C¢ 10  1,800.00
60MM 80MM 700MM 280°C 10 3,900.00
60MM 80MM 700MM 450°C 10 6,300.00
60MM 80MM 700MM 600°C 10 19,800.00

\ cwo&gf% Py U

8- g bmﬂ’q = @ KOs
Price: EX Our Works /&Q@ \}0}} ki /QL,(/\’ZS\OM 3 B
Taxes: GST @18% Extra ~

MOQ: 10 pcs each or multiples thereof.

Delivery: 4 weeks atleast from the receipt of PO. go&z (B J UC’}Q} ’

Other Terms & Conditions ) )\wﬂ 104

Payment: 30 Days
Validity: 30 days

regards
For, Ashutosh Power TransBelts Ltd., g% 96\/5
Works :

Plot No 7 & 8 Dholeshwar Industrial Estate,

Changodar GIDC, Changodar, Taluka Sanand,

Dist : Ahmedabad - 382 213.

Guijarat, India.

(O) +91 -79 - 26580282 / 1238 / 0929

Email: aptbelts@gmail.com

Website: www.aptbelts.com

On Mon, May 15, 2023 at 3:21PM <purchase.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com> wrote:
Dear Sir/Madam,

PLEASE QUOTE YOUR COMPETITIVE OFFER FOR THE ATTACHED ENQUIRY BY RETURN MAIL & KINDLY SEND

httns /loutlook office .com/mail/inbox/id/AAMKAGZINilIZiIRmI WO1NTetNDaAYv1iZik5l TNINMFmN7a3MiVVhAMaRGAAAAAANYAWIX Vw1 QYNeRNf 112
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A0764-A.G.BELTING PVT. LTD-1202866114-41596606162 y tﬁrcy
A1396-ASHUTOSH POWER TRANSBELT LTD-7926580282-9879000589
5291 9-SHREE TECHNOLOGY-0-9825164009

EN230500610

/AN 15-May-2023

Nk AR VAN 22/05/2023
pﬁ\x“(\

DI230400337 - 06-MAY-23

1 05040078 FELT SLEEVE 60 MM ID X 80 MM OD X 900 MM 10.00

LENGTH, ,
DI230400337 - 06-MAY-23

2 05040077 FELT SLEEVE 60 MM ID X 80 MM OD X 700 MM 10.00

LENGTH, ,

Note

1) YOU HAVE TO DELIVER THE MATERIAL AS PER YOUR COMMITTED DATE OF DELIVERY AT OUR WORKS FAILING
WHICH 2% PENALTY PER WEEK WILL BE DEPENDING UPON THE COMMODITY/ URGENCY OF THE
MATERIAL.HENCE, INDICAT DELIVERY PERIOD

2) 1IN CASE, YOU ARE NOT ABLE TO SUPPLY THE MATERIAL ON OR BEFORE THE DUE DATE WE ARE EMPOWERED
TO DIVERT / CANCEL OUR ORDER TO OTHER SUITABLE VENDOR AT THE PREVAILING RATE IN THE
MARKET.AND THE PRICE DIFFERENCE IF ANY WILL BE DEBITED TO YOUR ACCOUNT.

Please provide Service Tax/TIN Rigistration No./Certificate . We are releasing our payment
through bank hence provide the details of RTGS/NEFT/MICR/BANK ACCOUNT NO.
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