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Quotation . <quotation@jindalaluminium.com>

Re: FW: FW: Drawing for New Die DPI-Bott-02 (22)

1 message

Tejas B R . <tejas@jindalaluminium.com> Fri, Apr 15, 2022 at 7:12 PM
To: "Quotation ." <quotation@jindalaluminium.com>

Please find revised costing.
Sl.

Section No Description Alloy  Press Nalco
Price

RM Cost  Press cost Foundry Die factor

Prod Cost
WithOut

Surcharges
(Rs.) 

No.

 

1 Q33173
86X42X2MM

MISC SEC 6063-T6 BP 3 280.85 293.65 28.68 8.75 8.5 45.93

Warm Regards
Tejas B R  
Assistant Manager - Centre Of Excellence
M: +91 7676-107-468  |  L: +91 8023-715-555 (346)

      www.JindalAluminium.com

On Fri, Apr 15, 2022 at 12:06 PM Quotation . <quotation@jindalaluminium.com> wrote:

Dear Tejas,


Please recheck costing for Bhiwadi Plant


Regards
Vipeel



---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Jitendra Narain Rai . <jnrai@jindalaluminium.com>

Date: Thu, Apr 14, 2022 at 5:36 PM

Subject: Re: FW: FW: Drawing for New Die DPI-Bott-02 (22)

To: Quotation . <quotation@jindalaluminium.com>

Cc: Raghavendra Rao K <rkulkarni@jindalaluminium.com>, V K Saini <vksaini@jindalaluminium.com>, Toolshop -
Bhiwadi <toolshop.bhiwadi@jindalaluminium.com>





Dear Veepel
                    Please find SND of M/s DPI daylight die for bhiwadi plant


  BP-3 press
Die                     Dia  203.2  X 165 Th.    36227/- Rs
Insert Bolster     Dia   203.2 X 80 Th.      14720/- Rs


Total   50947/- Rs.


Std. Life    6 Mt.





Best Regards

J.N.Rai

Sr.Manager - Tool-Shop

M: +91-9611195330                                
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On Tue, Apr 12, 2022 at 3:29 PM Quotation . <quotation@jindalaluminium.com> wrote:


Dear Sir,


Please confirm below mail


Regards
Vipeel



---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Quotation . <quotation@jindalaluminium.com>

Date: Wed, Apr 6, 2022 at 6:01 PM

Subject: Fwd: FW: FW: Drawing for New Die DPI-Bott-02 (22)

To: Jitendra Narain Rai <jnrai@jindalaluminium.com>

Cc: Tejas B R <tejas@jindalaluminium.com>, Raghavendra Rao K <rkulkarni@jindalaluminium.com>





Dear Sir,


Please find the attached costing sheet. Please provide SND details accordingly


CC : Tejas, To confirm costing for Bhiwadi Plant


Regards
Vipeel



---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: V K Saini . <vksaini@jindalaluminium.com>

Date: Tue, Apr 5, 2022 at 5:45 PM

Subject: Fwd: FW: FW: Drawing for New Die DPI-Bott-02 (22)

To: Quotation <quotation@jindalaluminium.com>

Cc: Vipin Srivastava <vipinsrivastava@jindalaluminium.com>, Jitendra Narain Rai <jnrai@jindalaluminium.com>





Dear Team,


The customer wants to develop an attached drawing die in the bhiwadi plant .


Please provide the quote accordingly .   under a permanent exclusive category .







Best Regards,


VIKAS KUMAR SAINI
Manager- Marketing 

M: +91 9717-04-7733 |  L: +91 11-268909-62/63(Ext -54)

______________________________________________

                           www.JindalAluminium.com





---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Afzaal Ahmad <afzaal@dpidaylighting.com>

Date: Tue, Apr 5, 2022 at 5:33 PM

Subject: FW: FW: Drawing for New Die DPI-Bott-02 (22)

To: V K Saini . <vksaini@jindalaluminium.com>

Cc: Raj Kumar DPI Daylighting <rajkumar@dpidaylighting.com>, Rajeev | DPI Daylighting
<rajeev@dpidaylighting.com>
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Dear Mr. Saini

As discussed, please find the attached approved drawing, but before we send the formal acceptance, we need to
ensure the following:

1. Die to be in Bbiwadi

2. Conversion cost?

3. Cost of finished goods to DPI

4. Cost of die

 

Regards

Afzaal

 

From: V K Saini . <vksaini@jindalaluminium.com> 

Sent: 05 April 2022 02:04 PM

To: afzaal ahmad <afzaal@dpidaylighting.com>

Subject: Fwd: FW: Drawing for New Die DPI-Bott-02 (22)

 




FYI

 

Best Regards,

VIKAS KUMAR SAINI
Manager- Marketing 

M: +91 9717-04-7733 |  L: +91 11-268909-62/63(Ext -54)

______________________________________________

                           www.JindalAluminium.com

 

 

 

Drawing attached .

 

Best Regards,

VIKAS KUMAR SAINI
Manager- Marketing 

M: +91 9717-04-7733 |  L: +91 11-268909-62/63(Ext -54)

______________________________________________

                           www.JindalAluminium.com
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