JINDAL ) " -
C Umesh . <umesh@jindalaluminium.com>

Jindal Aluminium

Fwd: FW: FW: Requisition for complying pre-price bid activities- Reg

1 message

Amit Kumar Chakraborty . <akchakraborty@jindalaluminium.com> Fri, Jul 23, 2021 at 2:30 PM
To: Umesh <umesh@jindalaluminium.com>

Warm Regards

Amit Kumar Chakraborty

Deputy Manager - Marketing

M: +91 9686-461-271 | L: +91 8027-735-051 (346)

0 o O o www.JindalAluminium.com

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Sanchit Khandekar . <skhandekar@jindalaluminium.com>

Date: Fri, Jul 23, 2021 at 2:18 PM

Subject: Fwd: FW: FW: Requisition for complying pre-price bid activities- Reg
To: Amit Kumar Chakraborty <akchakraborty@jindalaluminium.com>

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Rohitash Singh . <rohitash@jindalaluminium.com>

Date: Fri, Jul 9, 2021 at 2:35 PM

Subject: Re: FW: FW: Requisition for complying pre-price bid activities- Reg

To: Sanchit Khandekar . <skhandekar@jindalaluminium.com>

Cc: Anup Nair <anair@jindalaluminium.com>, Sudhir Kumar Sharma <sksharma@jindalaluminium.com>, Vikram Sharma
<vsharma@)jindalaluminium.com>

Dear Sanchit,
ok, we may consider it.

On Fri, Jul 9, 2021 at 10:18 AM Sanchit Khandekar . <skhandekar@jindalaluminium.com> wrote:
Dear Mr. Rohitash,

Please refer to below mail from BHEL regarding TDS. In case if anything is required from BHEL side apart from below mail,
please confirm us so that we can request them.

Warm Regards

Sanchit Khandekar

Manager - Marketing

M: +91 9900-073-377 | L: +91 8027-735-051

@ o o ° www.JindalAluminium.com

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Thiyagarajan D <dthiyagu@bhel.in>

Date: Fri, Jul 9, 2021 at 10:10 AM

Subject: FW: FW: Requisition for complying pre-price bid activities- Reg

To: <skhandekar@jindalaluminium.com>

Cc: <sksharma@jindalaluminium.com>, Vikram Sharma <vsharma@jindalaluminium.com>, <tvgopal@bhel.in>,
<bvenkat@bhel.in>

Dear sir,

As indicated in JAL mail, BHEL will deduct 2% & 0.1% and relevant certificates will be issued by BHEL against deduction.
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Regards

D.Thiyagarajan

Purchase dept

From: Sanchit Khandekar . [mailto:skhandekar@jindalaluminium.com]

Sent: Friday, July 9, 2021 9:21 AM

To: Thiyagarajan D

Cc: Vikram Sharma; Sudhir Kumar Sharma; Neelkant Ghode(Sr Dy GM/MM-FGD&WS/BAP); B Venkateshwar(Add|
GM/MM/Purchase/MM-FGD&WS/BAP); P Suresh Kumar(AGM/MM/BAP)

Subject: Re: FW: Requisition for complying pre-price bid activities- Reg

Dear Sir,

This is in reference to your below mail, we further need confirmation on below points from BHEL.

e The below confirmation mail states that BHEL will deduct 2% TDS for the invoice value more than 2.5 Lacs and BHEL
agreed to provide TDS certificate for the same. This will continue even after new TDS on IT. Please confirm once again
whether BHEL will continue to deduct this or not. Also please confirm the provisions under which such TDS is being
deducted.

» Reference to the new finance act (sec 194Q), buyer will deduct 0.1% on the total amount. Kindly confirm whether
BHEL will deduct 0.1% TDS or not. In case BHEL will deduct TDS then we need a declaration from BHEL on their
letterhead that BHEL will deduct TDS @ 0.1% or else we will charge TCS in our invoice.

Kindly confirm to us on above points.

Warm Regards

Sanchit Khandekar
Manager - Marketing

M: +91 9900-073-377 | L: +91 8027-735-051

@ 0 O ° www.JindalAluminium.com

On Mon, Mar 15, 2021 at 3:53 PM Thiyagarajan D <dthiyagu@bhel.in> wrote:

Dear sir,

LD Clause : If BHEL delays the delivery period, BHEL will extend the delivery period with waiver of penalty.
TDS : For above Rs. 2.5 Lakhs, 2% will be deducted and same will be issued as certificate.

TCS : It is indicated in trailing mail, BHEL will consider Taxes and duties prevailing on the date of dispatch as notified by
Govt. of India.
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Please furnish compliance to trailing mail of BHEL.

Regards

D.Thiyagarajan

Purchase dept

From: Sanchit Khandekar [mailto:skhandekar@jindalaluminium.com]

Sent: Monday, March 15, 2021 3:01 PM

To: Thiyagarajan D

Cc: Vikram Sharma; Sudhir Kumar Sharma; Neelkant Ghode(Sr Dy GM/MM-FGD&WS/BAP); bvenkat@bhel.in;
psureshkumar@bhel.in

Subject: Re: Requisition for complying pre-price bid activities- Reg

Dear Sir,

We are in receipt of your below email and it is under review. We will revert to the same today at the earliest. Meanwhile,
we need confirmation on the below points from BHEL.

¢ LD Clause clarification - Since we have accepted the LD term of BHEL, we need clarification that in case BHEL
holds dispatches by any reason even after LC establishment, as we are not responsible for holding of
dispatches so LD should not be applicable / operative in this case. BHEL to confirm.

e We would like to know whether TDS will be deducted by BHEL on supplies of invoice value above 2.5 Lacs or
not. In case TDS is deducted, please confirm % of TDS and on which (basic or total value) amount will be
deducted. BHEL to confirm.

e Tax Collected Source (TCS) is not mentioned in below commercial parts. Present rate of TCS is 0.075% till 31st
March 2021. TCS may charge from current rate to @ 0.1% on total invoice (basic + freight + Insurance + IGST)
value from 1st April 2021 dispatches. TCS applicable on the date of despatch will be applicable. Please check
and add this taxation in commercial format.

We look forward to your response at the earliest. Based on this, we will add points in below commercial format.

Best Regards

Sanchit Khandekar
Dy. Manager - Marketing
M: +91 9900-073-377 | L: +91 8023-715-555 (Ext - 376)

On Mon, Mar 15, 2021 at 12:24 PM Thiyagarajan D <dthiyagu@bhel.in> wrote:

Dearr sir,

Ref : Enquiry No. : 4400603E dated 31.10.2020; Bulk Procurement of Aluminum sheets and Plates for BHEL
Corporation.

Hereby values indicated in Tabular column is indicative.

Example : Basic Rate Rs. 100 = Nalco Ingot Price IE07 + Conversion cost.
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Freight : Rs. 10 for indicative Purpose.

Payment loading @1.12% done as indicated below.

LC Opening charges and Insurance added as per BHEL Policy existing as of now. It may vary time to time.

NAME M/s Jindal Aluminum limited

PLACE Bengaluru

BASIC RATE 100.00
DISCOUNT 0 0.00
PACKING & FORWARDING 0 0.00
PRICE 100.00
Niryatkar Tax 0% 0.00
Freight 10 | U 10.00
GST/ Customs duty 18 | % 19.80
MARINE INSURANCE 0 0.00
PORT HANDLING CHARGES 0 0.00
Sub-total 129.80
PAYMENT LOADING 112 | % 1.45
LD Loading 0 0.00
LC OPENING CHARGES (Basic+frt) 0.15 | % 0.19
INSURANCE 0.130 % 0.17
ITC 19.80
COST/UNIT IN Rs 131.61
QUANTITY, MT 1.00
TOTAL COST INRs 131.61

Commercial Terms

Technically Suitable for

Enquiry Sl No. 01

Price

Firm conversion cost




Delivery Terms

Ex-works, Freight pre-paid, Delivery upto Respective Destination

GST/ Taxes

Prevailing at the date of dispatch; For evaluation GST @18%
considered.

Packing & Forwarding

Included in basic

Freight & Insurance

Freight extra by supplier, Insurance by BHEL

Delivery place

Respective Destinations

Delivery period from LOI 10.-12 weeks
Qty that can be delivered per month 1000MT
Cinfirmation that Original Manufacturer OEM
Confirmation on LD clause Accepted

Standard payment term

100% Irrevocable Unconfirmed Letter of Credit with 60 days Usance
Credit; Over due Interest for delayed payment is applicable

Validity of offer

90 days from PBO

Inspection before dispatch

Accepted

Test Certificate

Accepted

Guarantee Clause

Not accepted

Risk Purckase clause

Not accepted

Quantity Tolerance -5%/+0%

As per NIT

MSME Status

Large

CEBG

Not applicable

We are requesting M/s Jindal Aluminum limited to sign and stamp the above content in your letter head as the above

terms and conditions are accepted.

Expecting reply at the earliest.

Regards

D.Thiyagarajan

Purchase dept
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Disclaimer for the Electronic Transmission Message- E-mail

The information contained in this Electronic Transmission Message i.e. E-Mail and any attachments to this electronic
message are intended for the exclusive use of the address(s) and may contain proprietary, confidential or privileged
information. If you are not intended recipient, you should not disseminate, distribute or copy this e-mail. If you have
received this message in error, you should destroy this message and may please notify the sender by email.

E-mail transmission is not guaranteed to be secure or error-free as information could be intercepted, corrupted, lost,
destroyed, arrive late or incomplete, or may contain virus in transmission. The E-mail and its contents (with or without
referred errors) shall therefore not attach any liability on the originator/sender of message or BHEL or its affiliates. Views
or opinions, if any, presented in this e-mail are solely those of the sender and may not necessarily reflect the views or
opinions of BHEL or its affiliates. Intended recipients(s) may like to verify the information or intended meaning through
alternate communication mechanism before taking action on the E-mail or its contents.

WARNING: Although the company has taken reasonable precaution to ensure no viruses are present in this email, the
recipient should check this email and any attachments for the presence of virus. The sender of the mail or BHEL accepts
no liability for any damage caused by any virus transmitted by this email.
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Disclaimer for the Electronic Transmission Message- E-mail

The information contained in this Electronic Transmission Message i.e. E-Mail and any attachments to this electronic
message are intended for the exclusive use of the address(s) and may contain proprietary, confidential or privileged
information. If you are not intended recipient, you should not disseminate, distribute or copy this e-mail. If you have received
this message in error, you should destroy this message and may please notify the sender by email.

E-mail transmission is not guaranteed to be secure or error-free as information could be intercepted, corrupted, lost,
destroyed, arrive late or incomplete, or may contain virus in transmission. The E-mail and its contents (with or without
referred errors) shall therefore not attach any liability on the originator/sender of message or BHEL or its affiliates. Views or
opinions, if any, presented in this e-mail are solely those of the sender and may not necessarily reflect the views or opinions
of BHEL or its affiliates. Intended recipients(s) may like to verify the information or intended meaning through alternate
communication mechanism before taking action on the E-mail or its contents.

WARNING: Although the company has taken reasonable precaution to ensure no viruses are present in this email, the



recipient should check this email and any attachments for the presence of virus. The sender of the mail or BHEL accepts no
liability for any damage caused by any virus transmitted by this email.
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Disclaimer for the Electronic Transmission Message- E-mail

The information contained in this Electronic Transmission Message i.e. E-Mail and any attachments to this electronic message
are intended for the exclusive use of the address(s) and may contain proprietary, confidential or privileged information. If you
are not intended recipient, you should not disseminate, distribute or copy this e-mail. If you have received this message in
error, you should destroy this message and may please notify the sender by email.

E-mail transmission is not guaranteed to be secure or error-free as information could be intercepted, corrupted, lost, destroyed,
arrive late or incomplete, or may contain virus in transmission. The E-mail and its contents (with or without referred errors) shall
therefore not attach any liability on the originator/sender of message or BHEL or its affiliates. Views or opinions, if any,
presented in this e-mail are solely those of the sender and may not necessarily reflect the views or opinions of BHEL or its
affiliates. Intended recipients(s) may like to verify the information or intended meaning through alternate communication
mechanism before taking action on the E-mail or its contents.

WARNING: Although the company has taken reasonable precaution to ensure no viruses are present in this email, the
recipient should check this email and any attachments for the presence of virus. The sender of the mail or BHEL accepts no
liability for any damage caused by any virus transmitted by this email.



